
Buyer: Robin Heitz
Project Manager:  Greg Armenta

Bid 14-07 / Major Engine Transmission Repairs - Under One Ton
Bid Opened: February 5, 2014

Contract Period: March 1, 2014 to February 29, 2016
Awardees:  All-State Ford, Nationwide Truck Service, and S&S Transmission

Item # Mfg. Estimated Hours
 Prev. Hourly 

Rate 
 Unit Price 

(Hourly Rate) 
 Estimated Total 

Cost 
 Unit Price 

(Hourly Rate) 
 Estimated Total 

Cost 

 Unit Price 
(Hourly 
Rate) 

 Estimated Total 
Cost 

Unit Price 
(Hourly Rate)

 Estimated Total 
Cost 

1 Ford 400 55.00$             55.00$             22,000.00$              74.00$             29,600.00$              No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

2 GM 75 55.00$             55.00$             4,125.00$                74.00$             5,550.00$                No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

3 Jeep 200 55.00$             55.00$             11,000.00$              74.00$             14,800.00$              No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

4 Ford 160 55.00$             55.00$             8,800.00$                74.00$             11,840.00$              55.00$          8,800.00$                No Bid -$                     

5 GM 50 55.00$             55.00$             2,750.00$                74.00$             3,700.00$                55.00$          2,750.00$                No Bid -$                     

6 Jeep 120 55.00$             55.00$             6,600.00$                74.00$             8,880.00$                55.00$          6,600.00$                No Bid -$                     

7 Ford 450 55.00$             55.00$             24,750.00$              74.00$             33,300.00$              No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

8 GM 60 55.00$             55.00$             3,300.00$                74.00$             4,440.00$                No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

9 Toyota 100 55.00$             55.00$             5,500.00$                _ No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

10 Dodge-Jeep 250 55.00$             55.00$             13,750.00$              74.00$             18,500.00$              No Bid -$                          No Bid -$                     

_

BIDDERS

Major Engine Repairs

Transmission Repairs

Miscellaneous Repairs

Yes

Republic Diesel

Yes

Bid Estimate:  $111,900.00

Bid Signed
Nationwide Truck Service All-State Ford S&S Transmission

Yes Yes

Planholders not submitting:  Bumper to Bumper

Estimated Total

20%

_

Percent Markup for Engine and Transmission parts

Percent Markdown for Engine and Transmission parts _

-$                                                  18,150.00$                                        130,610.00$                                         102,575.00$                                         

15% _ _

25%
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