

Bid 14-100/Pipe Repair Couplings

Buyer: David W. Collier

Project Estimate: \$84,000						BIDDERS									
Item #	Description	Nominal Size	Inventory Number	Prev. Unit Cost	Est. Qty	Ferguson Waterworks		Viking Supply		Hayes Pipe (1)		Smith- Blair (1)(2)		Unit Cost	Total Cost
						Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost		
1	1. Standard Water Line Repair Couplings For C900 PVC, C.I., D.I., & A.C. Pipe	3"	1150053	\$39.13	0	38.18	\$0.00	\$44.11	\$0.00	\$44.87	\$0.00	\$42.00	\$0.00		
2		4" w/2" tap	1150004	\$80.35	0	77.57	\$0.00	\$86.31	\$0.00	\$87.80	\$0.00	\$65.53	\$0.00		
3		4"	1150054	\$50.52	50	48	\$2,400.00	\$52.70	\$2,635.00	\$54.19	\$2,709.50	\$62.06	\$3,103.00		
4		6" w/2" tap	1150006	\$94.79	0	91.67	\$0.00	\$109.57	\$0.00	\$111.46	\$0.00	\$79.45	\$0.00		
5		6"	1150056	\$57.10	300	59.53	\$17,859.00	\$70.06	\$21,018.00	\$72.02	\$21,606.00	\$77.71	\$23,313.00		
6		8" w/2" tap	1150008	\$115.70	0	111.45	\$0.00	\$139.05	\$0.00	\$141.45	\$0.00	\$112.45	\$0.00		
7		8"	1150058	\$79.35	75	98.57	\$7,392.75	\$93.64	\$7,023.00	\$96.26	\$7,219.50	\$111.67	\$8,375.25		
8		10" w/2" tap	1150010	\$176.90	0	171.91	\$0.00	\$212.12	\$0.00	\$215.77	\$0.00	\$161.15	\$0.00		
9		10"	1150060	\$120.89	0	116.82	\$0.00	\$141.27	\$0.00	\$143.70	\$0.00	\$119.73	\$0.00		
10		12" w/2" tap	1150012	\$201.55	0	194.4	\$0.00	\$228.75	\$0.00	\$232.68	\$0.00	\$213.88	\$0.00		
11		12"	1150062	\$140.89	75	145.86	\$10,939.50	\$164.65	\$12,348.75	\$169.25	\$12,693.75	\$174.98	\$13,123.50		
12		14"	1150068	\$246.45	0	235.79	\$0.00	\$240.76	\$0.00	\$244.89	\$0.00	\$300.82	\$0.00		
13		16"	1150064	\$271.00	2	256.72	\$513.44	\$271.68	\$543.36	\$276.36	\$552.72	\$430.53	\$861.06		
14		20"	1150065	\$380.25	0	431.97	\$0.00	\$456.73	\$0.00	\$464.57	\$0.00	\$464.44	\$0.00		
15		24"	1150124	\$631.75	2	768.54	\$1,537.08	\$665.32	\$1,330.64	\$676.75	\$1,353.50	\$541.88	\$1,083.76		
Subtotal						\$40,641.77		\$44,898.75		\$46,134.97		\$49,859.57			
16	2. Standard Rings & Gaskets to convert standard couplings to transition for manufacturers model offered	4"	4002204	\$10.52	0	\$10.95	\$0.00	\$12.63	\$0.00	\$12.85	\$0.00	\$8.36	\$0.00		
17		6"	4002206	\$12.70	0	\$13.22	\$0.00	\$14.74	\$0.00	\$14.99	\$0.00	\$24.00	\$0.00		
18		8"	4002208	\$18.20	0	\$18.95	\$0.00	\$21.50	\$0.00	\$21.42	\$0.00	\$42.00	\$0.00		
19		10"	4002210	\$21.06	0	\$23.94	\$0.00	\$26.29	\$0.00	\$26.77	\$0.00	\$62.00	\$0.00		
20		12"	4002212	\$28.14	0	\$29.79	\$0.00	\$33.68	\$0.00	\$34.27	\$0.00	\$117.46	\$0.00		
21		14"	N/A	\$51.07	0	\$47.79	\$0.00	\$84.05	\$0.00	\$85.50	\$0.00	no bid	no bid		
22		16"	4002216	\$59.75	0	\$69.95	\$0.00	\$89.47	\$0.00	\$91.01	\$0.00	\$212.22	\$0.00		
23		20"	4002220	\$102.35	0	\$98.77	\$0.00	\$110.53	\$0.00	\$112.43	\$0.00	no bid	no bid		
24	24"	4002224	\$199.91	0	\$196.95	\$0.00	\$221.05	\$0.00	\$224.85	\$0.00	no bid	no bid			
Subtotal						\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00			
25	Standard - Extended Range Repair Couplings	4"	1150204	\$105.11	12	\$105.11	\$1,261.32	89.31	\$1,071.72	\$90.85	\$1,090.20	\$96.00	\$1,152.00	\$109.32	
26		6"	1150206	\$134.73	30	\$134.73	\$4,041.90	116.26	\$3,487.80	\$118.26	\$3,547.80	\$123.67	\$3,710.10	\$331.80	
27		8"	1150208	\$130.27	16	\$151.66	\$2,426.56	\$153.09	\$2,449.44	\$155.76	\$2,492.16	\$136.90	\$2,190.40		
28		12"	1150212	\$205.63	12	\$250.44	\$3,005.28	\$298.29	\$3,579.48	\$303.42	\$3,641.04	\$251.43	\$3,017.16		
Subtotal						\$10,735.06		\$10,588.44		\$10,771.20		\$10,069.66		\$0.00	
Total						\$51,376.83		\$55,487.19		\$56,906.17		\$59,929.23			
Manufacturer						Ford		Powerseal		Powerseal		Smith-Blair			
AWARD TOTAL						\$38,680.86		\$11,582.52		\$56,906.17		\$59,929.23		\$0.00	

Bid Signed: Yes

Planholders not submitting: Bid Ocean, Cardinal Sales, HD Supply, Masters Supply, Mueller, Onvia, Plumbers Sply, PV Inc., Thompson Dist. (MBE)

No bid submitted: None

(1) Math Corrected (2) less than \$450 difference therefore awarded to next low bid for contract maintenance ease

