

Buyer Estimate: \$110,000.00			Peyton's Barricade		A & A Safety		Saf-Ti-Co		Traffix Devices		
			DESCRIPTION	Est. Qty.	Prev. Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
ITEM 1:	Barricades, plain	1100	\$ 34.85	\$ 35.65	\$39,215.00	\$ 29.95	\$32,945.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 31.43	\$34,573.00
ITEM 2:	Lights/bulbs & PhotoCell (2)	250	\$ 13.95	\$ 14.25	\$3,562.50	\$ 13.75	\$3,437.50	\$ 13.75	\$3,437.50	\$ 22.12	\$5,530.00
ITEM 3:	Bulbs Only	600	\$ 0.45	\$ 0.45	\$270.00	\$ 5.50	\$3,300.00	\$ 0.49	\$294.00	\$ 1.17	\$702.00
ITEM 4:	PhotoCell Inserts Only	45	\$ 6.80	\$ 6.70	\$301.50	\$ 5.50	\$247.50	\$ 8.00	\$360.00	\$ 12.10	\$544.50
ITEM 5:	Traffic Cones 28"	7000	\$ 9.68	\$ 9.50	\$66,500.00	\$ 12.35	\$86,450.00	\$ 10.83	\$75,810.00	no bid	
Bid Total				\$109,849.00		\$126,380.00		\$79,901.50		\$41,349.50	
Delivery				7-14 days		not supplied		14 days		7-14 days	

Apparent Best Bid: Peyton's

Bid Signed: Yes

Planholders not submitting a bid: Bailey Tools, Bid Ocean, Bluegrass Uniforms, Onvia

Planholders submitting "No Bid": None