Bid Opened: July 20, 2016

BID #16-112 / Rebar Anchors

Contract Period Sept. 28, 2016 thru Sept. 30, 2019

Buyer: Renee Fromme

FINAL BID-TAB

Bid Estimate: $57,000.00

Bidders

Ferguson Metal Solutions
ltem Description Bar Total Est Prev.
Stock # | (Gate Valve | .. Bar ' Unit | Unit Price| Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
# . Size Quan. .
Size) Length Price
1 [4000004| 4" diameter | #4 62" 250 | $10.90 $7.59 $1,897.50 $7.65 $1,912.50
2 [4000006| 6" diameter | #4 68" 600 | $11.90 $8.07 $4,842.00 $8.15 $4,890.00
3 [4000008| 8" diameter | #4 76" 800 | $12.90 $8.57 $6,856.00 $8.60 $6,880.00
4 (4000012 |12" diameter| #6 | 103" | 1,500 | $23.50 | $22.85 | $34,275.00 $22.90 $34,350.00
5 N/A | 16" diameter| #8 155" 0 [$151.80| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 N/A [ 20" diameter| #10 | 218" 0 $344.08| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery 7 - 10 Days 30 Days
Total $47,870.50 $48,032.50
Award Total $47,870.50
Bids Signed: Yes Yes
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