

Bid 16-113 / Pipe Repair Couplings
Contract Period October 1, 2016 thru September 30, 2021

Project Estimate: \$64,000						BIDDERS					
Item #	Description	Nominal Size	Inventory Number	Prev. Unit Cost	Est. Qty	Viking Supply Inc.		Ferguson Waterworks		Utility Sales Agency of America	
						Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
1	1. Standard Water Line Repair Couplings For C900 PVC, C.I., D.I., & A.C. Pipe	3"	1150053	\$38.18	0	\$39.00	\$0.00	\$37.21	\$0.00	\$66.00	\$0.00
2		4" w/2" tap	1150004	\$77.57	0	\$60.00	\$0.00	\$75.60	\$0.00	\$106.70	\$0.00
3		4"	1150054	\$48.00	50	\$43.65	\$2,182.50	\$46.87	\$2,343.50	\$84.70	\$4,235.00
4		6" w/2" tap	1150006	\$91.67	0	\$76.00	\$0.00	\$89.24	\$0.00	\$133.10	\$0.00
5		6"	1150056	\$59.53	300	\$54.55	\$16,365.00	\$57.95	\$17,385.00	\$111.10	\$33,330.00
6		8" w/2" tap	1150008	\$111.45	0	\$108.00	\$0.00	\$108.51	\$0.00	\$159.50	\$0.00
7		8"	1150058	\$98.57	75	\$87.25	\$6,543.75	\$96.71	\$7,253.25	\$137.50	\$10,312.50
8		10" w/2" tap	1150010	\$171.91	0	\$156.00	\$0.00	\$167.97	\$0.00	\$199.10	\$0.00
9		10"	1150060	\$116.82	0	\$104.00	\$0.00	\$114.32	\$0.00	\$177.10	\$0.00
10		12" w/2" tap	1150012	\$194.40	0	\$215.00	\$0.00	\$189.64	\$0.00	\$232.10	\$0.00
11		12"	1150062	\$145.86	75	\$137.19	\$10,289.25	\$142.93	\$10,719.75	\$210.10	\$15,757.50
12		14"	1150068	\$235.79	0	\$241.00	\$0.00	\$230.75	\$0.00	\$643.50	\$0.00
13		16"	1150064	\$256.72	2	\$239.00	\$478.00	\$250.64	\$501.28	\$792.00	\$1,584.00
14		20"	1150065	\$431.97	0	\$406.00	\$0.00	\$421.75	\$0.00	\$959.20	\$0.00
15		24"	1150124	\$768.54	2	\$565.00	\$1,130.00	\$752.11	\$1,504.22	\$1,078.00	\$2,156.00
Subtotal						\$36,988.50		\$39,707.00		\$67,375.00	
16	2. Standard Rings & Gaskets to convert standard couplings to transition for manufacturers model offered	4"	4002204	\$10.52	0	\$18.00	\$0.00	\$10.74	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
17		6"	4002206	\$13.22	0	\$20.00	\$0.00	\$12.96	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
18		8"	4002208	\$18.95	0	\$25.00	\$0.00	\$18.58	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
19		10"	4002210	\$23.94	0	\$31.75	\$0.00	\$23.52	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
20		12"	4002212	\$29.79	0	\$47.40	\$0.00	\$29.21	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
21		14"	N/A	\$47.79	0	\$48.40	\$0.00	\$46.99	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
22		16"	4002216	\$69.95	0	\$74.75	\$0.00	\$68.87	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
23		20"	4002220	\$98.77	0	\$98.60	\$0.00	\$94.63	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
24		24"	4002224	\$196.95	0	\$100.00	\$0.00	\$192.74	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
Subtotal						\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	
25	Standard - Extended Range Repair Couplings	4"	1150204	\$105.11	20	\$75.35	\$1,507.00	\$105.64	\$2,112.80	No Bid	No Bid
26		6"	1150206	\$134.73	40	\$92.65	\$3,706.00	\$135.41	\$5,416.40	No Bid	No Bid
27		8"	1150208	\$151.66	20	\$164.75	\$3,295.00	\$152.42	\$3,048.40	No Bid	No Bid
28		12"	1150212	\$250.44	15	\$298.50	\$4,477.50	\$251.71	\$3,775.65	No Bid	No Bid
Subtotal						\$12,985.50		\$14,353.25		\$0.00	
Total						\$49,974.00		\$54,060.25		\$67,375.00	
Manufacturer						POWERSEAL		FORD		JCM	