LOUSVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 16-173 / 48-Inch Bell Joint Clamps
Bid Opening: December 14, 2016

Awardee: HD Supply
Buyer: Robin Heitz

BIDDERS

Utility Sales Agency of

Project Manager: David Collier HD Supply Hayes Pipe Supply Ferguson Waterworks [1] :

Project Manager's Estimate: $122,670 America, LLC [2]

Itzm Qty. Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 | 25 | 48" belljointleakclampwith | o0 000 00 | go5 70000 | $4307.00 | $107.67500 | $1.370.96 | $34.27400 | $3.824.38 | $95,609.50

standard hook
2 | o | 48 belljointleak clampwith 1 | o5 o 7 $0.00 $4,925.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/4" extended hook
3 | o [48"belljointleak clampwith /8" o, o) $0.00 $4,900.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
extended hook
Subtotal $95,700.00 $107,675.00 $34,274.00 $95,609.50
INDIVIDUAL JOINT COMPONENT / PRICING (for replacement purposes):

Itzm Qty. Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
4 16 1 1/4" Extended Hook $72.00 $1,152.00 $87.50 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 16 5/8" Extended Hook $69.00 $1,104.00 $84.00 $1,344.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 0 Standard Hook $66.50 $0.00 $90.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 0 Body Segment $268.00 $0.00 $360.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 0 Shoe $166.00 $0.00 $225.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 2 EPDM Gasket $504.00 $1,008.00 $614.00 $1,228.00 No Bid No Bid $118.00 $236.00

Subtotal $3,264.00 $3,972.00 $0.00 $236.00
Grand Total $98,964.00 $111,647.00 $34,274.00 $95,845.50
Manufacturer's Model Offered Romac Romac Ford Meter Box JCM 143
Days Delivered After Ordered 90 10-14 10 84 -98

[1], [2] Disqualified, deemed non-responsive. Product quoted did not meet specifications.
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