

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 17-150 / Transmission System Repairs and/or Capital Improvements
Bid Opening Date: December 20, 2017
Bid Estimate: \$1,000,000

Buyer's Name: Robin Heitz

Project Manager's Name: Daniel Tegene

If bid is listed as "under review" see LWC Bid Results webpage for further information.

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
Good Faith Effort Documents?:		Yes	Yes	Yes	No
Bid Signed?:		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Line #	LABOR RATES	Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour
1	Superintendent - Regular	\$90.00	\$70.00	\$66.90	\$75.00
2	Superintendent - Overtime	\$135.00	\$105.00	\$100.35	\$100.00
3	Superintendent - Holiday	\$180.00	\$140.00	\$133.80	\$125.00
4	Foreman - Regular	\$70.00	\$62.00	\$57.64	\$65.00
5	Foreman - Overtime	\$105.00	\$95.00	\$86.46	\$90.00
6	Foreman - Holiday	\$140.00	\$124.00	\$115.28	\$115.00
7	Hauler/Truck Driver - Regular	\$40.00	\$39.00	\$38.85	\$45.00
8	Hauler/Truck Driver - Overtime	\$60.00	\$59.00	\$57.53	\$67.50
9	Hauler/Truck Driver - Holiday	\$80.00	\$78.00	\$76.70	\$90.00
10	Operator - Regular	\$55.00	\$52.00	\$51.46	\$50.00
11	Operator - Overtime	\$82.50	\$81.00	\$77.19	\$75.00
12	Operator - Holiday	\$110.00	\$105.00	\$102.92	\$100.00
13	Laborer - Regular	\$45.00	\$42.00	\$36.21	\$45.00
14	Laborer - Overtime	\$67.50	\$63.00	\$54.32	\$67.50
15	Laborer - Holiday	\$90.00	\$84.00	\$72.42	\$90.00
16	Welder - Regular	\$75.00	\$55.00	\$71.67	\$45.00
17	Welder - Overtime	\$112.50	\$83.00	\$107.51	\$67.50
18	Welder - Holiday	\$150.00	\$110.00	\$143.34	\$90.00
19	Safety Officer - Regular	\$70.00	\$70.00	\$57.64	\$50.00
20	Safety Officer - Overtime	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$86.46	\$75.00
21	Safety Officer - Holiday	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$115.28	\$100.00
22	Police/Flagger-Regular	\$60.00	\$42.00	\$46.20	\$50.00
23	Police/Flagger-Overtime	\$90.00	\$63.00	\$69.30	\$75.00
24	Police/Flagger-Holiday	\$120.00	\$84.00	\$92.40	\$100.00
25	Project Administrator-Regular	\$90.00	\$40.00	\$66.90	\$65.00
26	Project Administrator-Overtime	\$135.00	\$60.00	\$100.35	\$90.00
27	Project Administrator-Holiday	\$180.00	\$80.00	\$133.80	\$115.00
28	Carpenter - Regular	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$51.46	\$45.00
29	Carpenter - Overtime	\$75.00	\$78.00	\$77.19	\$67.50
30	Carpenter - Holiday	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$102.92	\$90.00
31	Electrician - Regular	\$95.00	\$55.00	\$57.58	\$65.00
32	Electrician - Overtime	\$142.50	\$83.00	\$86.46	\$97.50
33	Electrician - Holiday	\$190.00	\$110.00	\$115.28	\$130.00
34	Plumber - Regular	\$95.00	\$55.00	\$55.59	\$65.00
35	Plumber - Overtime	\$142.50	\$83.00	\$83.39	\$97.50
36	Plumber - Holiday	\$190.00	\$110.00	\$111.18	\$130.00
37	Metal Worker - Regular	\$50.00	\$55.00	\$55.59	\$50.00
38	Metal Worker - Overtime	\$75.00	\$83.00	\$83.39	\$75.00
39	Metal Worker - Holiday	\$100.00	\$110.00	\$111.18	\$100.00
40	Pipe Fitter - Regular	\$74.75	\$52.00	\$55.59	\$50.00
41	Pipe Fitter - Overtime	\$112.19	\$78.00	\$83.39	\$75.00
42	Pipe Fitter - Holiday	\$149.50	\$104.00	\$111.18	\$100.00

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
43	Driver - Regular	\$40.00	\$41.00	\$54.10	\$30.00
44	Driver - Overtime	\$60.00	\$62.00	\$81.15	\$45.00
45	Driver - Holiday	\$80.00	\$82.00	\$108.20	\$60.00
46	Mobilization-Inside Waterson Expressway	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,500.00
47	Mobilization-Inside Watterson To Gene Snyder	\$2,500.00	\$1,000.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,000.00
48	Mobilization-Outside Gene Snyder	\$2,500.00	\$12,500.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,500.00
48a	Demobilization-Inside Waterson Expressway	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,500.00
48b	Demobilization-Inside Watterson To Gene Snyder	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,000.00
48c	Demobilization-Outside Gene Snyder	\$2,500.00	\$10,000.00	Hourly Rate	\$2,500.00
LARGE EQUIPMENT RATES		Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour
Crawler Cranes:					
49	12-1/2 ton / Daily	\$209.55	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$50.00
50	12-1/2 ton / Weekly	\$183.30	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$40.00
51	12-1/2 ton / Monthly	\$160.06	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$30.00
52	12-1/2 ton / Idle-Time	\$141.25	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$30.00
53	25 ton / Daily	\$209.55	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$70.00
54	25 ton / Weekly	\$181.30	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$60.00
55	25 ton / Monthly	\$160.06	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$50.00
56	25 ton / Idle-Time	\$141.25	No Bid	Cost + 12%	\$50.00
57	48 ton / Daily	\$209.55	\$160.00	Cost + 12%	\$110.00
58	48 ton / Weekly	\$181.30	\$160.00	Cost + 12%	\$100.00
59	48 ton / Monthly	\$160.06	\$160.00	Cost + 12%	\$80.00
60	48 ton / Idle-Time	\$141.25	\$160.00	Cost + 12%	\$80.00
Truck Cranes:					
61	12-1/2 ton / Daily	\$55.18	\$90.00	\$85.00	\$150.00
62	12-1/2 ton / Weekly	\$49.93	\$90.00	\$83.00	\$135.00
63	12-1/2 ton / Monthly	\$46.08	\$90.00	\$81.00	\$115.00
64	12-1/2 ton / Idle-Time	\$25.63	\$90.00	\$42.50	\$115.00
65	25 ton / Daily	\$82.98	\$110.00	Cost + 12%	\$200.00
66	25 ton / Weekly	\$73.35	\$110.00	Cost + 12%	\$190.00
67	25 ton / Monthly	\$66.36	\$110.00	Cost + 12%	\$180.00
68	25 ton / Idle-Time	\$46.88	\$110.00	Cost + 12%	\$180.00
Track Excavators:					
69	80-100 HP / Daily	\$93.88	\$93.00	\$92.25	\$70.00
70	80-100 HP / Weekly	\$81.13	\$93.00	\$90.00	\$50.00
71	80-100 HP / Monthly	\$71.60	\$93.00	\$88.00	\$30.00
72	80-100 HP / Idle-Time	\$63.13	\$93.00	\$46.13	\$30.00
73	110-160 HP / Daily	\$126.20	\$125.00	\$110.70	\$100.00
74	110-160 HP / Weekly	\$109.45	\$125.00	\$108.70	\$75.00
75	110-160 HP / Monthly	\$97.11	\$125.00	\$106.70	\$50.00
76	110-160 HP / Idle-Time	\$82.50	\$125.00	\$55.35	\$50.00
Track Dozers:					
77	70-90 HP / Daily	\$64.63	\$88.00	\$66.94	\$70.00
78	70-90 HP / Weekly	\$56.50	\$88.00	\$64.94	\$50.00
79	70-90 HP / Monthly	\$50.65	\$88.00	\$62.94	\$30.00
80	70-90 HP / Idle-Time	\$39.38	\$88.00	\$33.47	\$30.00
81	110-170 HP / Daily	\$96.63	\$110.00	\$104.34	\$110.00
82	110-170 HP / Weekly	\$84.88	\$110.00	\$102.34	\$85.00
83	110-170 HP / Monthly	\$75.89	\$110.00	\$100.34	\$40.00
84	110-170 HP / Idle-Time	\$59.38	\$110.00	\$52.17	\$40.00
Track Loaders:					

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
85	70-90 HP / Daily	\$58.48	\$76.00	\$70.20	\$45.00
86	70-90 HP / Weekly	\$51.60	\$76.00	\$68.20	\$30.00
87	70-90 HP / Monthly	\$46.37	\$76.00	\$66.20	\$20.00
88	70-90 HP / Idle-Time	\$34.38	\$76.00	\$35.10	\$20.00
89	120-150 HP / Daily	\$143.28	\$120.00	\$116.20	\$75.00
90	120-150 HP / Weekly	\$124.15	\$120.00	\$114.20	\$55.00
91	120-150 HP / Monthly	\$110.61	\$120.00	\$112.20	\$40.00
92	120-150 HP / Idle-Time	\$94.38	\$120.00	\$58.10	\$40.00
93	JD Excavator 850/ Daily	443.07 [1]	\$415.00	Cost + 12%	\$210.00
94	JD Excavator 850 / Weekly	385.11 [1]	\$415.00	Cost + 12%	\$125.00
95	JD Excavator 850 / Monthly	341.26 [1]	\$415.00	Cost + 12%	\$95.00
96	JD Excavator850 / Idle-Time	290.63 [1]	\$415.00	Cost + 12%	\$95.00
97	Pickup Truck / Daily	\$14.03	\$21.00	\$15.44	\$35.00
98	Pickup Truck / Weekly	\$12.65	\$21.00	\$14.44	\$30.00
99	Pickup Truck / Monthly	\$12.12	\$21.00	\$13.44	\$20.00
100	Pickup Truck / Idle-Time	\$6.63	\$21.00	\$7.72	\$20.00
101	Fuel Truck / Daily	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.58	\$35.00
102	Fuel Truck / Weekly	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.58	\$30.00
103	Fuel Truck / Monthly	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.58	\$20.00
104	Fuel Truck / Idle-Time	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.29	\$20.00
105	Air Compressor / Daily	\$25.58 [2]	\$56.00	\$23.10	\$20.00
106	Air Compressor / Weekly	\$23.08 [2]	\$56.00	\$22.10	\$20.00
107	Air Compressor / Monthly	\$21.18 [2]	\$56.00	\$21.10	\$15.00
108	Air Compressor / Idle-Time	\$12.38 [2]	\$56.00	\$11.55	\$15.00
109	Tri-axle Dump / Daily	\$75.00	\$78.00	\$58.04	\$95.00
110	Tri-axle Dump / Weekly	\$75.00	\$78.00	\$56.04	\$90.00
111	Tri-axle Dump / Monthly	\$75.00	\$78.00	\$54.04	\$85.00
112	Tri-axle Dump / Idle-Time	\$75.00	\$78.00	\$29.02	\$85.00
113	Tag-a-long Trailer / Daily	\$14.03	\$45.00	\$12.40	\$30.00
114	Tag-a-long Trailer / Weekly	\$12.65	\$45.00	\$11.40	\$30.00
115	Tag-a-long Trailer / Monthly	\$12.17	\$45.00	\$10.40	\$25.00
116	Tag-a-long Trailer / Idle-Time	\$6.63	\$45.00	\$6.20	\$25.00
117	Jack Hammer / Daily	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
118	Jack Hammer / Weekly	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.50	\$5.00
119	Jack Hammer / Monthly	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.25	\$5.00
120	Jack Hammer / Idle-Time	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$3.35	\$5.00
121	Shoring / Daily	\$71.25	\$83.00	\$35.00	\$25.00
122	Shoring / Weekly	\$38.10	\$83.00	\$35.00	\$22.00
123	Shoring / Monthly	\$21.54	\$83.00	\$35.00	\$20.00
124	Shoring / Idle-Time	\$71.25	\$83.00	\$35.00	\$20.00
125	2-Inch Water Pump / Daily	\$5.83	\$5.00	\$15.44	\$10.00
126	2-Inch Water Pump / Weekly	\$5.38	\$5.00	\$15.00	\$10.00
127	2-Inch Water Pump / Monthly	\$5.06	\$5.00	\$14.75	\$5.00
128	2-Inch Water Pump / Idle-Time	\$2.13	\$5.00	\$7.72	\$5.00
129	Rock Drill / Daily	\$230.10	\$140.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
130	Rock Drill / Weekly	\$200.23	\$140.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
131	Rock Drill / Monthly	\$177.57	\$140.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
132	Rock Drill / Idle-Time	\$150.00	\$140.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
133	Tower Light / Daily	\$20.00	\$28.00	\$26.40	\$15.00
134	Tower Light / Weekly	\$17.38	\$28.00	\$24.40	\$15.00
135	Tower Light / Monthly	\$15.26	\$28.00	\$22.40	\$10.00

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
136	Tower Light / Idle-Time	\$13.75	\$28.00	\$13.20	\$10.00
137	Steel Welding Rigs / Daily	\$100.00	\$115.00	\$36.02	\$10.00
138	Steel Welding Rigs / Weekly	\$100.00	\$115.00	\$34.02	\$10.00
139	Steel Welding Rigs / Monthly	\$100.00	\$115.00	\$32.02	\$0.00
140	Steel Welding Rigs / Idle-Time	\$100.00	\$115.00	\$18.01	\$10.00
141	Jack Hammer / Daily	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
142	Jack Hammer / Weekly	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
143	Jack Hammer / Monthly	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
144	Jack Hammer / Idle-Time	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
145	Link Belt 135 / Daily	\$93.88	\$70.00	\$76.00	\$70.00
146	Link Belt 135 / Weekly	\$81.13	\$70.00	\$74.00	\$50.00
147	Link Belt 135 / Monthly	\$71.60	\$70.00	\$72.00	\$30.00
148	Link Belt 135 / Idle-Time	\$63.13	\$70.00	\$38.00	\$30.00
149	Sheep Foot Roller Attachment / Daily	\$86.43	\$60.00	\$79.00	\$50.00
150	Sheep Foot Roller Attachment / Weekly	\$77.18	\$60.00	\$77.00	\$40.00
151	Sheep Foot Roller Attachment / Monthly	\$70.06	\$60.00	\$75.00	\$35.00
152	Sheep Foot Roller Attachment / Idle-Time	\$46.88	\$60.00	\$39.50	\$35.00
153	Link Belt 235 / Daily	\$126.20	\$104.00	\$94.00	\$100.00
154	Link Belt 235 / Weekly	\$109.45	\$104.00	\$92.00	\$70.00
155	Link Belt 235 / Monthly	\$97.11	\$104.00	\$91.00	\$50.00
156	Link Belt 235 / Idle-Time	\$82.50	\$104.00	\$47.00	\$50.00
157	JD Loader / Daily	\$82.18 [3]	\$115.00	\$46.00	\$35.00
158	JD Loader / Weekly	\$71.93 [3]	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$30.00
159	JD Loader / Monthly	\$64.36 [3]	\$115.00	\$42.00	\$25.00
160	JD Loader / Idle-Time	\$50.63 [3]	\$115.00	\$23.00	\$25.00
161	420 Backhoe / Daily	\$45.35	\$37.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
162	420 Backhoe / Weekly	\$39.98	\$37.00	\$33.00	\$30.00
163	420 Backhoe / Monthly	\$36.14	\$37.00	\$31.00	\$25.00
164	420 Backhoe / Idle-Time	\$26.00	\$37.00	\$17.50	\$25.00
165	Case 590 Backhoe with Hoe Ram / Daily	\$126.35 [4]	\$150.00	\$39.00	\$40.00
166	Case 590 Backhoe with Hoe Ram / Weekly	\$87.98 [4]	\$150.00	\$37.00	\$35.00
167	Case 590 Backhoe with Hoe Ram / Monthly	\$67.28 [4]	\$150.00	\$35.00	\$30.00
168	Case 590 Backhoe with Hoe Ram / Idle-Time	\$107.00 [4]	\$150.00	\$19.50	\$30.00
169	Air Chipping Hammers / Daily	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
170	Air Chipping Hammers / Weekly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
171	Air Chipping Hammers / Monthly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
172	Air Chipping Hammers / Idle-Time	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
173	Lowboy / Daily	\$225.00	\$126.00	\$48.63	\$100.00
174	Lowboy / Weekly	\$225.00	\$126.00	\$46.63	\$100.00
175	Lowboy / Monthly	\$225.00	\$126.00	\$44.63	\$100.00
176	Lowboy / Idle-Time	\$225.00	\$126.00	\$24.32	\$100.00
177	Vacuum Excavation / Daily	\$350.00	\$230.00	\$38.00	\$150.00
178	Vacuum Excavation / Weekly	\$350.00	\$230.00	\$37.00	\$140.00
179	Vacuum Excavation / Monthly	\$350.00	\$230.00	\$36.00	\$135.00
180	Vacuum Excavation / Idle-Time	\$350.00	\$230.00	\$18.00	\$135.00
181	Welder/Rig / Daily	\$175.00	\$105.00	\$107.69	\$100.00
182	Welder/Rig / Weekly	\$175.00	\$105.00	\$105.69	\$100.00
183	Welder/Rig / Monthly	\$175.00	\$105.00	\$103.69	\$100.00
184	Welder/Rig / Idle-Time	\$175.00	\$105.00	\$107.69	\$100.00
185	PC 400 Komatsu / Daily	\$243.23	\$200.00	Cost + 12%	\$150.00
186	PC 400 Komatsu / Weekly	\$215.10	\$200.00	Cost + 12%	\$125.00

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
187	PC 400 Komatsu / Monthly	\$193.94	\$200.00	Cost + 12%	\$100.00
188	PC 400 Komatsu / Idle-Time	\$140.63	\$200.00	Cost + 12%	\$100.00
189	Discharge/Suction Hose / Daily	\$5.63	\$10.00	\$25.29	\$50.00
190	Discharge/Suction Hose / Weekly	\$3.30	\$10.00	\$25.29	\$50.00
191	Discharge/Suction Hose / Monthly	\$2.24	\$10.00	\$25.29	\$50.00
192	Discharge/Suction Hose / Idle-Time	\$5.63	\$10.00	\$25.29	\$50.00
193	Steel Plates / Daily	\$17.98	\$6.00	\$2.60	\$20.00
194	Steel Plates / Weekly	\$8.55	\$6.00	\$2.60	\$20.00
195	Steel Plates / Monthly	\$5.52	\$6.00	\$2.60	\$20.00
196	Steel Plates / Idle-Time	\$17.98	\$6.00	\$2.60	\$20.00
SMALL EQUIPMENT RATES		Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour	Per Hour
Backhoe Loaders:					
197	70-90 HP / Daily	\$45.35	\$37.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
198	70-90 HP / Weekly	\$39.98	\$37.00	\$34.00	\$30.00
199	70-90 HP / Monthly	\$36.14	\$37.00	\$33.00	\$25.00
200	70-90 HP / Idle-Time	\$26.00	\$37.00	\$17.50	\$25.00
201	110-130 HP / Daily	\$89.93	\$42.00	\$36.00	\$40.00
202	110-130 HP / Weekly	\$78.43	\$42.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
203	110-130 HP / Monthly	\$69.84	\$42.00	\$34.00	\$30.00
204	110-130 HP / Idle-Time	\$56.88	\$42.00	\$18.00	\$25.00
Hydraulic Hammers:					
205	500 ft-lbs / Daily	\$23.81	\$62.00	\$8.00	\$70.00
206	500 ft-lbs / Weekly	\$14.36	\$62.00	\$7.75	\$55.00
207	500 ft-lbs / Hourly	\$4.80	\$6.00	\$7.50	\$30.00
208	500 ft-lbs / Idle-Time	\$23.81	\$62.00	\$4.00	\$30.00
209	1,000 ft-lbs / Daily	\$44.63	\$78.00	\$15.40	\$80.00
210	1,000 ft-lbs / Weekly	\$26.85	\$78.00	\$15.20	\$65.00
211	1,000 ft-lbs / Monthly	\$18.32	\$78.00	\$15.10	\$40.00
212	1,000 ft-lbs / Idle-Time	\$44.63	\$78.00	\$7.70	\$40.00
213	1,500 ft-lbs / Daily	\$81.00	\$124.00	\$25.10	\$90.00
214	1,500 ft-lbs / Weekly	\$48.00	\$124.00	\$25.00	\$75.00
215	1,500 ft-lbs / Monthly	\$33.14	\$124.00	\$24.50	\$50.00
216	1,500 ft-lbs / Idle-Time	\$81.00	\$124.00	\$12.50	\$50.00
217	3,000 ft-lbs / Daily	\$97.13	\$186.00	\$29.11	\$100.00
218	3,000 ft-lbs / Weekly	\$58.31	\$186.00	\$29.00	\$85.00
219	3,000 ft-lbs / Monthly	\$39.77	\$186.00	\$28.50	\$60.00
220	3,000 ft-lbs / Idle-Time	\$97.13	\$186.00	\$15.00	\$60.00
Dump Trucks:					
221	6 CY / Daily	\$48.35	\$47.00	\$29.00	\$70.00
222	6 CY / Weekly	\$45.23	\$47.00	\$28.75	\$65.00
223	6 CY / Monthly	\$43.04	\$47.00	\$28.50	\$55.00
224	6 CY / Idle-Time	\$15.00	\$47.00	\$14.50	\$55.00
225	10 CY / Daily	\$75.00	\$64.00	\$36.20	\$80.00
226	10 CY / Weekly	\$75.00	\$64.00	\$36.00	\$75.00
227	10 CY / Monthly	\$75.00	\$64.00	\$35.50	\$65.00
228	10 CY / Idle-Time	\$75.00	\$64.00	\$18.10	\$65.00
229	Tandem / Daily	\$75.00	No Bid	\$58.04	\$85.00
230	Tandem / Weekly	\$75.00	No Bid	\$56.04	\$80.00
231	Tandem / Monthly	\$75.00	No Bid	\$54.04	\$70.00
232	Tandem / Idle-Time	\$75.00	No Bid	\$29.02	\$70.00
General Trucks:					

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
233	1-ton utility / Daily	\$31.30	\$21.00	\$18.53	\$20.00
234	1-ton utility / Weekly	\$24.30	\$21.00	\$18.25	\$20.00
235	1-ton utility / Monthly	\$20.96	\$21.00	\$18.00	\$20.00
236	1-ton utility / Idle-Time	\$7.00	\$21.00	\$9.27	\$20.00
237	½ ton pick-up / Daily	\$14.03	\$21.00	\$15.44	\$10.00
238	½ ton pick-up / Weekly	\$12.65	\$21.00	\$15.20	\$10.00
239	½ ton pick-up / Monthly	\$12.17	\$21.00	\$15.00	\$10.00
240	½ ton pick-up / Idle-Time	\$6.63	\$21.00	\$7.72	\$10.00
241	Fuel / Daily	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00
242	Fuel / Weekly	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00
243	Fuel / Monthly	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00
244	Fuel / Idle-Time	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00
Trailers:					
245	Low-boy / Daily	\$225.00	\$26.00	\$47.25	\$100.00
246	Low-boy / Weekly	\$225.00	\$26.00	\$47.00	\$100.00
247	Low-boy / Monthly	\$225.00	\$26.00	\$46.75	\$100.00
248	Low-boy / Idle-Time	\$225.00	\$26.00	\$26.63	\$100.00
249	Tool / Daily	\$20.00	\$21.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
250	Tool / Weekly	\$20.00	\$21.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
251	Tool / Monthly	\$20.00	\$21.00	\$15.00	\$10.00
252	Tool / Idle-Time	\$20.00	\$21.00	\$15.00	\$10.00
Welders:					
253	225 amps / Daily	\$12.23	\$90.00	\$36.03	\$30.00
254	225 amps / Weekly	\$11.68	\$90.00	\$36.03	\$25.00
255	225 amps / Monthly	\$11.28	\$90.00	\$36.03	\$20.00
256	225 amps / Idle-Time	\$2.63	\$90.00	\$36.03	\$20.00
257	400 amps / Daily	\$12.23	\$105.00	No Bid	\$50.00
258	400 amps / Weekly	\$11.68	\$105.00	No Bid	\$45.00
259	400 amps / Monthly	\$11.28	\$105.00	No Bid	\$30.00
260	400 amps / Idle-Time	\$2.63	\$105.00	No Bid	\$30.00
Water Pumps:					
261	<100 gpm / Daily	\$5.83	\$31.00	\$15.44	\$10.00
262	<100 gpm / Weekly	\$5.38	\$31.00	\$15.00	\$10.00
263	<100 gpm / Monthly	\$5.06	\$31.00	\$14.75	\$5.00
264	<100 gpm / Idle-Time	\$2.13	\$31.00	\$7.77	\$5.00
265	200-500 gpm / Daily	\$13.40	\$42.00	\$21.61	\$15.00
266	200-500 gpm / Weekly	\$11.90	\$42.00	\$21.00	\$10.00
267	200-500 gpm / Monthly	\$10.84	\$42.00	\$20.50	\$5.00
268	200-500 gpm / Idle-Time	\$7.25	\$42.00	\$10.81	\$5.00
269	>1,000 gpm / Daily	\$27.50	\$52.00	\$48.30	\$25.00
270	>1,000 gpm / Weekly	\$25.00	\$52.00	\$47.50	\$20.00
271	>1,000 gpm / Monthly	\$23.15	\$52.00	\$47.00	\$15.00
272	>1,000 gpm / Idle-Time	\$12.25	\$52.00	\$24.15	\$15.00
Air Compressors:					
273	80 +/- HP / Daily	\$25.58	\$21.00	\$17.43	\$50.00
274	80 +/- HP / Weekly	\$23.08	\$21.00	\$17.00	\$45.00
275	80 +/- HP / Monthly	\$21.18	\$21.00	\$16.75	\$35.00
276	80 +/- HP / Idle-Time	\$12.38	\$21.00	\$9.00	\$35.00
277	100 +/- HP / Daily	\$31.85	\$52.00	\$36.61	\$75.00
278	100 +/- HP / Weekly	\$28.85	\$52.00	\$35.61	\$70.00
279	100 +/- HP / Monthly	\$26.62	\$52.00	\$34.61	\$60.00

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
280	100 +/- HP / Idle-Time	\$15.00	\$52.00	\$19.00	\$60.00
281	265 +/- HP / Daily	\$62.05	No Bid	\$66.90	\$100.00
282	265 +/- HP / Weekly	\$57.50	No Bid	\$65.90	\$95.00
283	265 +/- HP / Monthly	\$53.24	No Bid	\$64.90	\$85.00
284	265 +/- HP / Idle-Time	\$25.00	No Bid	\$33.45	\$85.00
Air Tools:					
285	drill or breaker / Daily	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$10.00
286	drill or breaker / Weekly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$10.00
287	drill or breaker / Monthly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
288	drill or breaker / Idle-Time	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
289	pavement breaker / Daily	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$10.00
290	pavement breaker / Weekly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$10.00
291	pavement breaker / Monthly	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
292	pavement breaker / Idle-Time	\$5.00	\$11.00	\$6.71	\$5.00
Portable Generators:					
293	8-12 HP / Daily	\$5.65	\$21.00	\$15.44	\$15.00
294	8-12 HP / Weekly	\$5.33	\$21.00	\$14.44	\$10.00
295	8-12 HP / Monthly	\$5.06	\$21.00	\$13.44	\$5.00
296	8-12 HP / Idle-Time	\$1.75	\$21.00	\$7.77	\$5.00
297	>12 HP / Daily	\$17.13	\$31.00	\$20.58	\$40.00
298	>12 HP / Weekly	\$15.63	\$31.00	\$19.58	\$35.00
299	>12 HP / Monthly	\$14.52	\$31.00	\$18.58	\$30.00
300	>12 HP / Idle-Time	\$7.38	\$31.00	\$10.29	\$30.00
301	Portable Light Plant: / Daily	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$25.73	\$35.00
302	Portable Light Plant: / Weekly	\$17.38	\$26.00	\$24.73	\$30.00
303	Portable Light Plant: / Monthly	\$15.26	\$26.00	\$23.73	\$25.00
304	Portable Light Plant: / Idle-Time	\$13.75	\$26.00	\$13.00	\$25.00
Construction Brooms:					
305	5' skid-loader / Daily	\$11.90	\$37.00	\$36.90	\$50.00
306	5' skid-loader / Weekly	\$10.53	\$37.00	\$36.50	\$45.00
307	5' skid-loader / Monthly	\$9.50	\$37.00	\$36.00	\$40.00
308	5' skid-loader / Idle-Time	\$6.75	\$37.00	\$18.45	\$40.00
309	8' with cab and A/C / Daily	\$32.20	\$47.00	\$43.05	\$75.00
310	8' with cab and A/C / Weekly	\$28.58	\$47.00	\$43.00	\$65.00
311	8' with cab and A/C / Monthly	\$25.69	\$47.00	\$42.50	\$60.00
312	8' with cab and A/C / Idle-Time	\$18.75	\$47.00	\$21.50	\$60.00
INTERNAL JOINT SEALS:					
		Each	Each	Each	Each
313	24" Standard Seal	\$1,075.00	\$1,090.00	\$960.00	No Bid
314	30" Standard Seal	\$1,200.00	\$1,170.00	\$990.00	No Bid
315	36" Standard Seal	\$1,225.00	\$1,230.00	\$1,040.00	No Bid
316	48" Standard Seal	\$1,300.00	\$1,360.00	\$1,150.00	No Bid
317	60" Standard Seal	\$1,450.00	\$1,530.00	\$1,600.00	No Bid
STEEL REINFORCING BANDS:					
	Pipe Internal Diameter (ID)/ Minum Plate Thickness (MPT) for Steel Reinforcing Bands	Each	Each	Each	Each
318	24" ID / 3/16 " MPT	\$807.55	\$1,500.00	\$702.22	No Bid
319	24" ID / 1/4" MPT	\$828.00	\$1,550.00	\$720.00	No Bid
320	24" ID / 5/16" MPT	\$859.95	\$1,600.00	\$747.78	No Bid
321	24" ID / 3/8" MPT	\$885.50	\$1,650.00	\$770.00	No Bid
322	30" ID / 3/16 " MPT	\$836.95	\$1,550.00	\$727.78	No Bid
323	30" ID / 1/4" MPT	\$875.28	\$1,600.00	\$761.11	No Bid

BIDDERS:		Garney Companies, Inc. [1] [2] [3] [4]	MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.	Southern Pipeline Construction Company (CWBE)	Basham construction & Rental Co., Inc.
324	30" ID / 5/16" MPT	\$907.22	\$1,650.00	\$788.89	No Bid
325	30" ID / 3/8" MPT	\$945.55	\$1,700.00	\$822.22	No Bid
326	36" ID / 3/16 " MPT	\$856.11	\$1,600.00	\$744.44	No Bid
327	36" ID / 1/4" MPT	\$894.45	\$1,650.00	\$777.78	No Bid
328	36" ID / 5/16" MPT	\$939.17	\$1,700.00	\$816.67	No Bid
329	36" ID / 3/8" MPT	\$977.50	\$1,750.00	\$850.00	No Bid
330	48" ID / 3/16 " MPT	\$1,003.05	\$1,700.00	\$872.22	No Bid
331	48" ID / 1/4" MPT	\$1,060.55	\$1,800.00	\$922.22	No Bid
332	48" ID / 5/16" MPT	\$1,111.67	\$1,900.00	\$966.67	No Bid
333	48" ID / 3/8" MPT	\$1,169.17	\$2,000.00	\$1,016.67	No Bid
334	60" ID / 3/16 " MPT	\$1,169.17	\$2,200.00	\$1,016.67	No Bid
335	60" ID / 1/4" MPT	\$1,239.45	\$2,400.00	\$1,077.78	No Bid
336	60" ID / 5/16" MPT	\$1,322.50	\$2,500.00	\$1,150.00	No Bid
337	60" ID / 3/8" MPT	\$1,392.78	\$2,600.00	\$1,211.11	No Bid
Concrete Core Repair and Internal Joint Grouting					
	Pipe Internal Diameter	Cost Per Joint Cleaned and Grouted	Cost Per Joint Cleaned and Grouted	Cost Per Joint Cleaned and Grouted	Cost Per Joint Cleaned and Grouted
338	24" ID / 1 to 10 Each	\$762.00	\$2,800.00	\$2,500.00	No Bid
339	24" ID / 11 to 25 Each	\$762.00	\$1,100.00	\$880.00	No Bid
340	24" ID / 26 to 50 Each	\$430.00	\$950.00	\$755.00	No Bid
341	24" ID / 51 to 100 Each	\$304.00	\$710.00	\$600.00	No Bid
342	24" ID / Greater than 100 Each	\$252.00	\$600.00	\$495.00	No Bid
343	30" ID / 1 to 10 Each	\$732.00	\$2,800.00	\$2,500.00	No Bid
344	30" ID / 11 to 25 Each	\$732.00	\$1,100.00	\$880.00	No Bid
345	30" ID / 26 to 50 Each	\$400.00	\$950.00	\$755.00	No Bid
346	30" ID / 51 to 100 Each	\$274.00	\$710.00	\$600.00	No Bid
347	30" ID / Greater than 100 Each	\$222.00	\$650.00	\$520.00	No Bid
348	36" ID / 1 to 10 Each	\$720.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,500.00	No Bid
349	36" ID / 11 to 25 Each	\$720.00	\$1,150.00	\$890.00	No Bid
350	36" ID / 26 to 50 Each	\$388.00	\$1,000.00	\$765.00	No Bid
351	36" ID / 51 to 100 Each	\$262.00	\$750.00	\$610.00	No Bid
352	36" ID / Greater than 100 Each	\$210.00	\$710.00	\$575.00	No Bid
353	48" ID / 1 to 10 Each	\$720.00	\$3,500.00	\$3,000.00	No Bid
354	48" ID / 11 to 25 Each	\$720.00	\$1,200.00	\$905.00	No Bid
355	48" ID / 26 to 50 Each	\$388.00	\$1,100.00	\$825.00	No Bid
356	48" ID / 51 to 100 Each	\$262.00	\$850.00	\$700.00	No Bid
357	48" ID / Greater than 100 Each	\$210.00	\$770.00	\$615.00	No Bid
358	60" ID / 1 to 10 Each	\$720.00	\$3,700.00	\$3,000.00	No Bid
359	60" ID / 11 to 25 Each	\$720.00	\$1,300.00	\$925.00	No Bid
360	60" ID / 26 to 50 Each	\$388.00	\$1,200.00	\$850.00	No Bid
361	60" ID / 51 to 100 Each	\$262.00	\$900.00	\$725.00	No Bid
362	60" ID / Greater than 100 Each	\$210.00	\$825.00	\$650.00	No Bid

[1] Shipping cost for 850 Excavator is +15% mobilization cost.

[2] AirCompressor -185

[3] JD Loader - 624K

[4] 1500# Hammer