

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY  
 BID 19-25 / PVC PIPE DUCTILE IRON PIPE  
 CONTRACT PERIOD: PURCHASE DELIVER

Items	Quantity Required	Previous Unit Cost	American Cast Iron Pipe Company		Consolidated Pipe and Supply Company Inc.		Core & Main		Ferguson Waterworks		Plumbers Supply Company	
			UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost
1398408 - 8" PVC Pipeline	5000	\$6.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.6	\$ 38,000.0	\$ 6.56	\$ 32,800.0	\$ 6.55	\$ 32,750.0	\$ 6.6	\$ 33,000.0
1398406 - 6" PVC Pipeline	13000	\$3.73	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.39	\$ 57,069.99	\$ 3.78	\$ 49,140.0	\$ 3.78	\$ 49,140.0	\$ 3.8046	\$ 49,459.8
<b>Total PVC Pipe</b>						<b>\$95,070.00</b>		<b>\$81,940.00</b>		<b>\$81,890.00</b>		<b>\$82,459.80</b>
1398208 - 8" Ductile Iron Pipe	1900	\$12.05	\$ 16.46	\$ 31,274.0	\$ 15.75	\$ 29,925.0	\$ 14.27	\$ 27,113.0	\$ 15.78	\$ 29,982.0	\$ 15.798	\$ 30,016.2
<b>Total Ductile Iron Pipe</b>				<b>\$ 31,274.0</b>		<b>\$ 29,925.0</b>		<b>\$ 27,113.0</b>		<b>\$ 29,982.0</b>		<b>\$ 30,016.2</b>