

**LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY**  
**Bid 19-44 / Restraint Joint Clamps**  
**Bid Opening Date: 4/24/19**

| Awardee: Core & Main<br>Buyer: Robin Heitz<br>Project Manager: Brian Bobbitt |                      |                    | Core & Main                           |             | Ferguson Waterworks<br>[1] |             | Hayes Pipe Supply<br>[1]     |             | Plumbers Supply<br>Company |              | The C.I. Thornburg Co.,<br>Inc.                   |             | Viking Supply      |            |
|--|----------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------------|-------------|----------------------------|-------------|------------------------------|-------------|----------------------------|--------------|---|-------------|--------------------|------------|
| Line #   | Item # / Description | Estimated Quantity | Unit Price                            | Total Cost  | Unit Price                 | Total Cost  | Unit Price                   | Total Cost  | Unit Price                 | Total Cost   | Unit Price  | Total Cost  | Unit Price         | Total Cost |
| <b>Category 1</b>  |                      |                    |                                       |             |                            |             |                              |             |                            |              |   |             |                    |            |
| 1  | 1250304 / 4"         | 450                | \$ 17.08                              | \$7,685.99  | \$ 19.18                   | \$8,631.00  | \$ 18.91                     | \$8,509.50  | No Bid                     | No Bid       | \$17.20   | \$7,740.00  | No Bid             | No Bid     |
| 2  | 1250306 / 6"         | 1200               | \$ 19.55                              | \$23,460.00 | \$ 21.97                   | \$26,364.00 | \$ 21.67                     | \$26,004.00 | No Bid                     | No Bid       | \$19.70   | \$23,640.00 | No Bid             | No Bid     |
| 3  | 1250308 / 8"         | 450                | \$ 29.95                              | \$13,477.50 | \$ 33.63                   | \$15,133.50 | \$ 33.18                     | \$14,931.00 | No Bid                     | No Bid       | \$ 30.45  | \$13,702.50 | No Bid             | No Bid     |
| 4  | 1250312 / 12"        | 210                | \$66.65                               | \$13,996.50 | \$73.34                    | \$15,403.49 | \$72.40                      | \$15,204.00 | No Bid                     | No Bid       | \$65.80   | \$13,818.00 | No Bid             | No Bid     |
| Category 1 Total   |                      |                    | \$58,619.99                           |             | \$65,531.99                |             | \$64,648.50                  |             | No Bid                     |              | \$58,900.50                                       |             | No Bid             |            |
| <b>Category 2</b>  |                      |                    |                                       |             |                            |             |                              |             |                            |              |   |             |                    |            |
| 5  | 1250316 / 16"        | 90                 | \$ 101.99                             | \$9,179.10  | \$103.00                   | \$9,270.00  | \$103.00                     | \$9,270.00  | \$ 140.65                  | \$12,658.50  | \$104.70  | \$9,423.00  | \$110.00           | \$9,900.00 |
| 6  | 1250320 / 20"        | 45                 | \$ 179.43                             | \$ 8,074.35 | \$ 181.21                  | \$8,154.45  | \$ 181.23                    | \$8,155.35  | \$ 232.13                  | \$ 10,445.85 | \$ 184.25   | \$ 8,291.25 | \$200.00           | \$9,000.00 |
| 7  | 1250324 / 24"        | 18                 | \$ 249.13                             | \$ 4,484.34 | \$ 251.62                  | \$4,529.16  | \$ 251.64                    | \$4,529.52  | \$ 314.54                  | \$ 5,661.72  | \$ 255.85   | \$4,605.30  | \$277.00           | \$4,986.00 |
| Category 2 Total   |                      |                    | \$21,737.79                           |             | \$21,953.61                |             | \$21,954.87                  |             | \$28,766.07                |              | \$22,319.55                                       |             | \$23,886.00        |            |
| Total Category 1 & 2   |                      |                    | \$80,357.79                           |             | \$ 87,485.61               |             | \$86,603.37                  |             | \$ 28,766.07               |              | \$ 81,220.05                                      |             | \$23,886.00        |            |
| Manufacturer?  |                      |                    | Cat. 1 - Romac<br>Cat. 2 - Sigma Corp |             | Approved Manufacturer      |             | Pre-approved<br>Manufacturer |             | Star Pipe Products         |              | Romac for Gripper Gland<br>Star Pipe for Mega Lug |             | Star Pipe Products |            |
| Delivery days after order receipt?   |                      |                    | 15                                    |             | 14                         |             | 3                            |             | 30                         |              | 10  |             | 5                  |            |
| Bid Signed?  |                      |                    | Yes                                   |             | Yes                        |             | Yes                          |             | Yes                        |              | Yes   |             | Yes                |            |

Planholders not submitting bids: Grade A Recycling, Masters Supply, Mueller Co., and American Procurement Council.

[1] Bidders took exceptions but were not evaluated since they were not low bidder.