

Bid 14-08 / Major Engine Transmission Repairs - One Ton and Over

Bid Opened: February 5, 2014

Awardees: Nationwide Truck Service, Republic Diesel, All-State Ford and Peterson GMC-Kenworth Inc.

Buyer: Robin Heitz

Project Manager: Greg Armenta

Bid Estimate: \$177,600.00				BIDDERS									
				Nationwide Truck Service		Republic Diesel		All-State Ford		Peterson GMC-Kenworth Inc.		S&S Transmission	
Bid Signed				Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Major Engine Repairs													
Item #	Mfg.	Estimated Hours	Prev. Hourly Rate	Unit Price (Hourly Rate)	Estimated Total Cost	Unit Price (Hourly Rate)	Estimated Total Cost	Unit Price (Hourly Rate)	Estimated Total Cost	Unit Price (Hourly Rate)	Estimated Total Cost	Unit Price (Hourly Rate)	Estimated Total Cost
1	Ford	400	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 26,000.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 29,600.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 39,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
2	Mercedes	25	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 1,375.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 1,625.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 1,850.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 2,475.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	CAT	250	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 13,750.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 16,250.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 18,500.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 24,750.00	No Bid	No Bid
4	Intrnational	75	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 4,875.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 5,550.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 7,425.00	No Bid	No Bid
5	Isuzu	150	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 8,250.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 9,750.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 11,100.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 14,850.00	No Bid	No Bid
6	Freightliner	400	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 26,000.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 29,600.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 39,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
7	Other*	100	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 7,400.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 9,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
* Mitsubishi, Yanmar, Perkins, John Deere, Case or Kubota													
Transmission Repairs													
8	Ford	150	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 8,250.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 9,750.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 11,100.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 14,850.00	No Bid	No Bid
9	Allison	50	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 2,750.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 3,250.00	_	\$ -	\$ 99.00	\$ 4,950.00	No Bid	No Bid
Miscellaneous Repairs													
10	Ford	200	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 14,800.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 19,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
11	GM	400	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 26,000.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 29,600.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 39,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
12	CAT	225	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 12,375.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 14,625.00	_	\$ -	\$ 99.00	\$ 22,275.00	No Bid	No Bid
13	JCB	60	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 3,900.00	_	\$ -		\$ -	No Bid	No Bid
14	Cummins	100	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 7,400.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 9,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
15	John Deere	275	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 15,125.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 17,875.00	_	\$ -		\$ -	No Bid	No Bid
16	Other*	100	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 6,500.00	_	\$ -		\$ -	No Bid	No Bid
*Mitsubishi, Yanmar, Perkins, John Deere, Case or Kubota													
Percent Markup for Engine and Transmission parts				20%		25%		15%		30%			
Percent Markdown for Engine and Transmission parts													
Estimated Total				\$ 162,800.00		\$ 192,400.00		\$ 166,500.00		\$ 249,975.00		No Bid	

Contract Period: March 1, 2014 to February 29, 2016