

Bid Opened: August 13, 2014 This bid is currently under review and requires approval(s) before final contract award is authorized.

**Preliminary Bid Tab  
14-129 / Propylene Glycol**

Buyer David W. Collier

Project Estimate: \$32,000			Bidders							
			Southern Water		PVS Nolwood		Kost USA		Douglas Products	
	Qty. (Gal.)	Prev Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost
250-300 Gallon Tote	3,500	\$7.09	\$8.46	\$29,610.00	\$8.96	\$31,374.00	\$9.49	\$33,215.00	\$10.20	\$35,700.00
<b>MANUFACTURER</b>			Lyondel		Kost		Kost USA		Douglas Products	
<b>TOTAL</b>			<b>\$29,610.00</b>		<b>\$31,374.00</b>		<b>\$33,215.00</b>		<b>\$35,700.00</b>	
			Bidders							
			Chemical Resources		Univar		GEO Specialty			
	Qty. (Gal.)	Prev Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost	Cost Per Gallon	Total Cost		
250-300 Gallon Tote	3,500	\$7.09	\$10.28	\$35,980.00	\$11.54	\$40,390.00	NO BID	NO BID		
<b>MANUFACTURER</b>			Huntsman		Kost		NO BID	NO BID		
<b>TOTAL</b>			<b>\$35,980.00</b>		<b>\$40,390.00</b>		NO BID	NO BID		

**Apparent Best Bid: Southern Water Treatment**

**Bid Signed: Yes**

Planholders submitting "No Bid": None

Planholders not submitting : Bid Ocean, Big Meadow Oil Co., BKM Resources, Brentagg Mid South, Cole Chemical, Marubeni Specialty Chemicals, Onvia

Contract period: Purchase and Deliver w/delivery schedule of not before October 29, 2014.

**Bid Opened: August 13, 2014 This bid is currently under review and requires approval(s) before final contract award is authorized.**

**Preliminary Bid Tab  
14-129 / Propylene Glycol**

**Buyer David W. Collier**

Planholders submitting "No Bid": None

Contract period: Purchase and Deliver w/delivery schedule of not before October 29, 2014.