

14-177/ Ductile Iron Pipe

Category # 1 Purchase & Deliver

		Bidders		C. I. Thornburg/ US Pipe				Hayes Pipe Supply/US Pipe			H D Supply / US Pipe			Ferguson Waterworks / Clow		
Line Item #	Inventory Number	Size	Est. QTY	past cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost
1	1398206	6"	12,960	9.32	2160	9.38	121,564.80	2160	9.41	121,953.60	2160	9.40	121,824.00	2160	10.37	134,395.20
2	1398208	8"	6,480	11.57	1620	12.21	79,120.80	1620	12.22	79,185.60	1620	12.24	79,315.20	1620	12.17	78,861.60
3	1398212	12"	13,608	18.39	972	20.25	275,562.00	972	20.24	275,425.92	972	20.31	276,378.48	972	20.41	277,739.28
4	1398216	16"	1,730	31.08	600	32.58	56,363.40	600	32.52	56,259.60	600	32.67	56,519.10	600	31.55	54,581.50
5	1390020	20	1,600		400	45.49	72,784.00	400	45.4	72,640.00	400	45.64	73,024.00	400	43.97	70,352.00
6	1398224	24"	40	N/A	324	60.78	2,431.20	324	60.65	2,426.00	324	60.99	2,439.60	324	59.6	2,384.00
7	1398317	16" Restraint Pipe	160	N/A	600	47.81	7,649.60	600	47.72	7,635.20	600	47.97	7,675.20	600	53.44	8,550.40
Totals						615,475.80			615,525.92			617,175.58			626,863.98	

Category # 2 2015 Additional quantities & Job Site Delivery

		Bidders														
Line Item #	Inventory Number	Size	Est. QTY	past cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost
1																
2	1398206	6"	2,160	9.32	2160	9.64	20,822.40	2160	9.61	20,757.60	2160	9.70	20,952.00	2160	10.37	22,399.20
3	1398208	8"	1,620	11.57	1620	12.54	20,314.80	1620	12.5	20,250.00	1620	12.6	20,412.00	1620	12.17	19,715.40
4	1398212	12"	972	18.39	972	20.81	20,227.32	972	20.75	20,169.00	972	20.93	20,343.96	972	20.41	19,838.52
5	1398216	16"	630	31.08	600	33.43	21,060.90	600	33.36	21,016.80	600	33.61	21,174.30	600	31.55	19,876.50
Totals						82,425.42			82,193.40			82,882.26			81,829.62	

		Bidders				Fortiline Waterworks / US Pipe		Consolidated Pipe/Clow			Thompson Dist(MBE)/US Pipe			American Pipe		
Line Item #	Inventory Number	Size	Est. QTY	past cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost
1	1398206	6"	12,960	9.32	2160	9.56	123,897.60		10.41	134,913.60	2160	9.70	125,712.00	2160	10.49	135,950.40
2	1398208	8"	6,480	11.57	1620	12.44	80,611.20		12.21	79,120.80	1620	12.75	82,620.00	1440	13.98	90,590.40
3	1398212	12"	13,608	18.39	972	20.70	281,685.60		20.54	279,508.32	972	20.85	283,726.80	960	23.07	313,936.56
4	1398216	16"	1,730	31.08	600	33.00	57,090.00		31.67	54,789.10	600	33.89	58,629.70	600	37.18	64,321.40
5	1390020	20"	1,600		400	46.00	73,600.00		44.32	70,912.00	400	47.33	75,728.00	480	51.61	82,576.00
6	1398224	24"	40	N/A	324	62.03	2,481.20		59.83	2,393.20	324	63.49	2,539.60	360	69.77	2,790.80
7	1398317	16" Restraint Pipe	160	N/A	600	48.95	7,832.00		53.65	8,584.00	600	49.74	7,958.40	600	66.12	10,579.20
		Totals					627,197.60			630,221.02			636,914.50			700,744.76

Category # 2 2015 Additional

		Bidders														
Line Item #	Inventory Number	Size	Est. QTY	past cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost	QTY / T/L	Unit Cost per foot	Total Cost
1																
2	1398206	6"	2,160	9.32	2160	No Bid	No Bid		10.41	22,485.60	2160	9.96	21,513.60	2160	10.9	23,544.00
3	1398208	8"	1,620	11.57	1620	No Bid	No Bid		12.21	19,780.20	1620	12.97	21,011.40	1440	14.53	23,538.60
4	1398212	12"	972	18.39	972	No Bid	No Bid		20.54	19,964.88	972	21.5	20,898.00	960	23.98	23,308.56
5	1398216	16"	630	31.08	600	No Bid	No Bid		31.67	19,952.10	600	34.58	21,785.40	600	38.64	24,343.20
		Totals				No Bid	No Bid			82,182.78			85,208.40			94,734.36

Apparent Low Bid and signed: CI Thornburg & Ferguson Waterworks
 Planholders that did not submit a bid: Bid Ocean, EJ Prescott, Lewis Municipal Sales, Onvia

Contract Period: Spot Purchase & Additional Quantities for Allmond Facility & Job Site Delivery for 2015 Delivery

Opened December 3, 2014

Preliminary Bid Tab, Does not constitute an award

14-177/ Ductile Iron Pipe

Buyer: David W. Collier