

LOUSVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 17-122 / Barricade Rental, Worksite Security, and Safety Sign Purchase
 Bid Opening Date: October 11, 2017
 Estimate: \$532,000.00

Recommended Awardees: Peyton's Barricade & Sign and Off Duty Police Services Inc.

Buyer: Robin Heitz

Project Manager: Joe Schmitt

SECTION 1: BARRICADES AND TRAFFIC CONTROL				BIDDERS					
SECTION 1A: BARRICADES, CONES, LIGHTS, etc.				Peyton's Barricade & Sign Co. [1]		Off Duty Police Services Inc.		AWP, Inc.	
			Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	TOTAL	Unit Price	TOTAL	Unit Price	TOTAL
Barricades with lights	9000319	Daily	1700	\$ 1.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.00	\$ 18,700.00
	9000320	Weekly	350	\$ 7.00	\$ 2,450.00 [1]	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33.00	\$ 11,550.00
	9000321	Monthly	150	\$ 30.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 99.00	\$ 14,850.00
	9000322	Mobilization	2	\$ 120.00	\$ 240.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 256.00
Arrowboard / Power Supply	9000323	Daily	10	\$ 45.00	\$ 450.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 50.00	\$ 500.00
	9000324	Weekly	1	\$ 245.00	\$ 245.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00
	9000325	Monthly	1	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00
	9000326	Mobilization	2	\$ 150.00	\$ 300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 150.00	\$ 300.00
8' Type III Barricades with Lights	9000327	Daily	225	\$ 6.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.00	\$ 2,475.00
	9000328	Weekly	50	\$ 42.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33.00	\$ 1,650.00
	9000329	Monthly	1	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 99.00	\$ 99.00
	9000330	Mobilization	15	\$ 120.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 1,920.00
12' Type III Barricades with Lights	9000331	Daily	725	\$ 6.00	\$ 4,350.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.00	\$ 7,975.00
	9000332	Weekly	105	\$ 42.00	\$ 4,410.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33.00	\$ 3,465.00
	9000333	Monthly	15	\$ 180.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 99.00	\$ 1,485.00
	9000334	Mobilization	60	\$ 120.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 7,680.00
Signs (e.g. Detour, road Closed, etc.)	9000335	Daily	715	\$ 4.00	\$ 2,860.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5.00	\$ 3,575.00
	9000336	Weekly	125	\$ 28.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 15.00	\$ 1,875.00
	9000337	Monthly	10	\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 45.00	\$ 450.00
	9000338	Mobilization	4	\$ 120.00	\$ 480.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 64.00	\$ 256.00

28" Traffic Cones	9000339	Daily	2300	\$ 1.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.50	\$ 1,150.00
	9000340	Weekly	290	\$ 7.00	\$ 2,030.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.50	\$ 435.00
	9000341	Monthly	70	\$ 30.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4.50	\$ 315.00
	9000342	Mobilization	6	\$ 120.00	\$ 720.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 768.00
TOTAL SECTION 1A:				\$51,325.00 [1]		No Bid		\$ 82,329.00	

SECTION 1B: TRAFFIC CONTROL PACKAGES									
PACKAGE DESCRIPTIONS	LWC #		Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	TOTAL	Unit Price	TOTAL	Unit Price	TOTAL
Package A	9000300	Daily	85	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 110.00	\$ 9,350.00
	9000301	Weekly	15	\$ 140.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 330.00	\$ 4,950.00
	9000302	Monthly	3	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 990.00	\$ 2,970.00
	9000303	Mobilization	1	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00
TOTAL PACKAGE A:				\$ 5,750.00		No Bid		\$ 17,334.00	
Package B	9000304	Daily	12	\$ 75.00	\$ 900.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 70.00	\$ 840.00
	9000305	Weekly	1	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 210.00	\$ 210.00
	9000306	Monthly	2	\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 630.00	\$ 1,260.00
	9000307	Mobilization	50	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 64.00	\$ 3,200.00
TOTAL PACKAGE B:				\$ 7,200.00		No Bid		\$ 5,510.00	
Package C	9000308	Daily	975	\$ 50.00	\$ 48,750.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 170.00	\$ 165,750.00
	9000343	Weekly	200	\$ 315.00	\$ 63,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 510.00	\$ 102,000.00
	9000309	Monthly	31	\$ 600.00	\$ 18,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 47,430.00
	9000310	Mobilization	470	\$ 150.00	\$ 70,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 64.00	\$ 30,080.00
TOTAL PACKAGE C:				\$ 200,850.00		No Bid		\$ 345,260.00	
Package D	9000311	Daily	480	\$ 200.00	\$ 96,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 255.00	\$ 122,400.00
	9000312	Weekly	55	\$ 875.00	\$ 48,125.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 765.00	\$ 42,075.00
	9000313	Monthly	2	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 5,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,295.00	\$ 4,590.00
	9000314	Mobilization	270	\$ 175.00	\$ 47,250.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 34,560.00
TOTAL PACKAGE D:				\$ 196,475.00		No Bid		\$ 203,625.00	
Package E	9000315	Daily	95	\$ 400.00	\$ 38,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 510.00	\$ 48,450.00
	9000316	Weekly	2	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 3,060.00
	9000317	Monthly	1	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,590.00	\$ 4,590.00
	9000318	Mobilization	60	\$ 350.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 128.00	\$ 7,680.00
TOTAL PACKAGE E:				\$ 67,700.00		No Bid		\$ 63,780.00	
TOTAL SECTION 1B:				\$ 477,975.00		No Bid		\$ 635,509.00	
GRAND TOTAL SECTION 1A AND 1B:				\$529,300.00 [1]		No Bid		\$ 717,838.00	

SECTION 2: PURCHASE OF SIGNS			Peyton's Barricade & Sign Co.		Off Duty Police Services Inc.		AWP, Inc.	
Item Master #	Description	Est. Quantity	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
9000361	48" x 48" Roll Up Super Bright Sign "UTILITY WORK"	30	\$ 180.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 290.00	\$ 8,700.00
9000362	48" x 48" Roll Up Super Bright Sign "ROAD CLOSED"	30	\$ 140.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 290.00	\$ 8,700.00
9000363	48" x 48" Roll Up Super Bright Sign "SIDEWALK CLOSED"	25	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 290.00	\$ 7,250.00
9000364	C-202-S-DDSH Sign Stand	20	\$ 190.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 175.00	\$ 3,500.00
TOTAL:			\$ 16,900.00		No Bid		\$ 28,150.00	

SECTION 3: SWORN UNIFORMED POLICE TRAFFIC CONTROL OFFICER		BIDDERS					
		Peyton's Barricade & Sign Co.		Off Duty Police Services Inc.		AWP, Inc.	
Description	Hours Per Year	Hourly Rate	Total Price	Hourly Rate	Total Price	Hourly Rate	Total Price
Scheduled Work Request							
Sworn Uniformed Police Traffic Control Officer Rate	1250	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35.00	\$ 43,750.00	\$ 85.00	\$106,250.00
Short Notice Work Request							
Sworn Uniformed Police Traffic Control Officer Rate	1250	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 45.00	\$ 56,250.00	\$ 85.00	\$106,250.00
Holiday Work Request							
Sworn Uniformed Police Traffic Control Officer Rate	40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 55.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 3,400.00
TOTAL:		No Bid		\$ 102,200.00		\$ 215,900.00	

SECTION 4: NON-SWORN UNIFORMED TRAFFIC CONTROL OFFICER		BIDDERS					
		Peyton's Barricade & Sign Co.		Off Duty Police Services Inc.		AWP, Inc.	
Description	Hours Per Year	Hourly Rate	Total Price	Hourly Rate	Total Price	Hourly Rate	Total Price
Scheduled Work Request							
Non-Sworn Uniformed Traffic Control Officer Rate	7500	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 23.50	\$ 176,250.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 637,500.00
Short Notice Work Request							
Non-Sworn Uniformed Traffic Control Officer Rate	500	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25.00	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 42,500.00
Holiday Work Request							
Non-Sworn Uniformed Traffic Control Officer Rate	40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 3,400.00
TOTAL:		No Bid		\$ 189,950.00		\$ 683,400.00	
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM 1:		Yes		Yes		Yes	
BID SIGNED:		Yes		Yes		Yes	

Planholders not submitting a bid: Morgan Security Services, Oilfield Supply Company, and Saf-Ti-Co Inc.

[1] Buyer corrected math error.