PM: John Azzara

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

Bid 18-48 / Electro-Mechanical Work for Water Treatment or Distribution Facilities
Bid Opening: April 11, 2018

Buyer: Renee Fromme B|DDERS
. . Morgan Electric Motor . . . . . Ward Engineerin, Walter B. Diecks Electric
Annual Estimate - $50,000 Gatterdam Glenwood Electric, Inc. | Mohler technology, Inc. 8 | Ready Electric Company | Schardein Mechanical Triton Services, Inc. & €
Sales & Service Co. Inc. Company, Inc. Co. Inc.
| Description Est. Qty Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
Classification
1 [PumpWork
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 $78.00 $7,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.00 $9,400.00 $77.00 $7,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 $115.00 | $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.00 $1,410.00 $99.00 $990.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 $156.00 $468.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $188.00 $564.00 $121.00 $363.00 No Bid No Bid
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 $45.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $7,200.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 $70.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.00 $1,080.00 $74.00 $740.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 $90.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.00 $432.00 $88.00 $264.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $14,888.00 $12,880.00 $20,086.00 $16,057.00
2 |Electrical Work / Non-Water Quality Instrumentation
Electrician
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid $69.00 $6,900.00 $118.00 $11,800.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $64.75 $6,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $6,500.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid $93.00 $930.00 $165.00 $1,650.00 $75.00 $750.00 $89.20 $892.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 $910.00
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid $125.00 $375.00 $165.00 $495.00 $85.00 $255.00 $13.65 $40.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.00 $348.00
Electrical Apprentice
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid $48.00 $4,800.00 $107.00 $10,700.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $25.90 $2,590.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.00 $4,900.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid $62.00 $620.00 $149.00 $1,490.00 $65.00 $650.00 $36.00 $360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.00 $670.00
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid $77.00 $231.00 $149.00 $447.00 $75.00 $225.00 $46.10 $138.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.00 $249.00
TOTAL $13,856.00 $26,582.00 $12,880.00 $10,496.25 $13,577.00
3 _|Piping & Valve Work
Pipefitter
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid $72.00 $7,200.00 $94.00 $9,400.00 $77.00 $7,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid $108.00 $1,080.00 $141.00 $1,410.00 $99.00 $990.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $255.00 No Bid No Bid $44.00 $132.00 $188.00 $564.00 $121.00 $363.00 No Bid No Bid
Pipefitter Apprentice
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid $63.00 $6,300.00 $72.00 $7,200.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $102.00 $1,020.00 $108.00 $1,080.00 $74.00 $740.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid $136.00 $408.00 $144.00 $432.00 $88.00 $264.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $12,880.00 $16,140.00 $20,086.00 $16,057.00




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

Bid 18-48 / Electro-Mechanical Work for Water Treatment or Distribution Facilities
Bid Opening: April 11, 2018

4 Drive and Gearbox Work
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.00 $9,400.00 $77.00 $7,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.00 $1,410.00 $99.00 $990.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $188.00 $564.00 $121.00 $363.00 No Bid No Bid
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $7,200.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.00 $1,080.00 $74.00 $740.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.00 $432.00 $88.00 $264.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $12,880.00 $20,086.00 $16,057.00
5 Air Compressor Work
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 $7,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00 $990.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.00 $363.00 No Bid No Bid
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.00 $740.00 No Bid No Bid
Holiday) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $88.00 $264.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $12,880.00 $16,057.00
pst + % Mark-up 18% 10% 20% 15% 10% 15% 15% 15% 15%
TOTAL COST $14,888.00 $13,856.00 $26,582.00 $64,400.00 $10,496.25 $16,140.00 $60,258.00 $64,228.00 $13,577.00
Acknowledgment of Addendum
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Is Signed
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




