

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
 Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
 Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

Awardees: A.Y. McDonald, Core & Main, Hayes Pipe Supply, and Mueller Co. LLC
 Buyer: Terri Young
 Project Manager: Brian Bobbitt
 Bid Estimate: \$260,000.00

Bidders:							AY McDonald			Core & Main (1)			Hayes Pipe Supply			Mueller Co. LLC			Southern Fasteners (2)		
Bid Signed:							Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		
Acknowledged Receipt of Addendum #1:							Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		
#	Item	Master Item #	Model	Unit	Previous Unit Price	Estimated Quantity	Manufacturer / Model #	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Manufacturer / Model #	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Manufacturer / Model #	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Manufacturer / Model #	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Manufacturer / Model #	Unit Cost	Total Cost
1	1" Spring Check Valve FIP x FIP	1630001	Mueller H14243N Ford HS11-444NL	Each	\$20.78	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HS11-444NL	\$ 24.57	\$98.28	Mueller 014243	\$ 46.25	\$185.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	1-1/2" Spring Check Valve FIP x FIP	1630015	Mueller H14243N Ford HS11-666NL	Each	\$99.47	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HS11-666-NL	\$ 117.38	\$704.28	Mueller 014243	\$ 126.15	\$756.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	2" Spring Check Valve FIP x FIP	1630020	Mueller H14243N Ford HS11-777NL	Each	\$125.73	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HS11-777-NL	\$ 148.38	\$890.28	Mueller 014243	\$ 150.85	\$905.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	3/4" Valve Check Angle	2640107	A.Y. McDonald 7 02-3HT 43 Ford HA34-323GNL Cambridge Brass 590NL-T3F3	Each	\$25.83	226	AYM / 702-3HT 43	\$ 27.74	\$6,269.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HA34-323-G-NL	\$ 31.28	\$7,069.28	Mueller 014269	\$37.30	\$8,429.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	1" Valve Check Angle	2640110	Ford HA34-444N	Each	\$29.52	6	AYM / 702-4HT 54	\$ 31.98	\$191.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HA34-444-NL	\$ 33.46	\$200.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Ball Valve Pilotometer 1-1/4 FIP x 1-1/4 FIP	2640125	Ford B11-455N	Each	\$67.19	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford B11-455-NL	\$ 74.65	\$149.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	2" Angle Ball Valve FIP x Flange	2640220	Mueller B24286N Ford BFA13-777NL A.Y.MCDONALD 74604B	Each	\$169.98	6	AYM / 74604B 2"	\$ 181.72	\$1,090.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford BFA13-777-NL	\$196.89	\$1,181.34	MUELLER 024286	\$204.37	\$1,226.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Angle Meter Valve 5/8 Flare x 3/4 Mtr Coupling	2530000	Ford KV 23-332W A.Y.MCDONALD 4602 Mueller H14255	Each	\$24.79	2	AYM / 74602 3/4"	\$ 26.52	\$53.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV23-332w-NL	\$ 27.59	\$55.18	MUELLER 014255	\$27.48	\$54.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Angle Meter Valve OS 5/8 Copper x 3/4 Mtr Coupling	2570115	Ford KV 23-332W-05	Each	\$24.79	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV23-332W-OS-NL	\$ 27.59	\$55.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	3/4" Angle Meter Valve Compression x Meter	2531006	Mueller H14258N Ford KV43-332WSMBNL A.Y. McDonald 7 4602ST	Each	\$23.63	3000	AYM / 74602ST 3/4"	\$ 25.37	\$76,110.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV43-332W-SN-G-NL	\$ 29.41	\$88,230.00	MUELLER 014258	\$29.30	\$87,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Angle Meter Valve 3/4 Copper x 1 Meter	2570315	Ford KV23-342WMSB A.Y.McDonald 74602	Each	\$26.46	16	AYM / 74602 1"X3/4"	\$ 28.42	\$454.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV23-342W-SN-NL	\$ 30.66	\$490.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	1" Angle Meter Valve Compression x Meter	2531010	Mueller H14258 Ford KV43-444GMSB A.Y.McDonald 74602T	Each	\$34.38	160	AYM / 74602T 1"	\$ 36.92	\$5,907.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV43-444W-SN-G-NL	\$ 40.26	\$6,441.60	MUELLER 014258	\$ 40.13	\$6,420.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	3/4" Valve Check Angle "Short"	2640109	Ford HA31-323GN	Each	\$22.27	0	AYM / 702-3HE 43	\$ 23.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HA31-323-NL	\$25.40	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	1" Stop Tee Head Female In & Out with handle	2560010	Ford B11-444 W/HB-34N A.Y.McDonald 76101H	Each	\$56.14	6	AYM / 76101WHDLB 1"	\$ 59.75	\$358.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford B11-444-HB-34	\$ 62.39	\$374.34	MUELLER 02028303	\$ 65.17	\$391.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	1-1/2" Ball Valve FIP x FIP	2530014	Mueller H20283N Ford B11-666NL A.Y.McDonald 76101	Each	\$104.49	6	AYM / 76101 1 1/2"	\$ 112.21	\$673.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford B11-666-NL	\$ 121.04	\$726.24	MUELLER 020283	\$125.60	\$753.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	2" Ball Valve FIP x FIP	2530020	Mueller H20283N Ford B11-777NL A.Y.McDonald 76101	Each	\$148.47	250	AYM / 76101 2"	\$ 158.72	\$39,680.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford B11-777-NL	\$ 177.03	\$44,257.50	MUELLER 020283	\$183.80	\$45,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Tee-Handle for 2" Ball Valve FIP x FIP	9050562	Mueller H10298N Ford HB-67SNL McDonald 76120BS	Each	\$6.84	0	AYM / 6120BS 1 1/2"X2"	\$ 7.35	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford HB-67S	\$7.80	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Angle Meter Valve 5/8 x 5/8	2560105	Ford K23-331WNL	Each	\$23.07	16	AYM / 74602 3/4"X5/8"	\$ 25.22	\$403.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV23-331W-NL	\$ 26.01	\$416.16	MUELLER 014265	\$ 21.84	\$349.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Angle Meter Valve 3/4 Meter x 1 Copper	2570415	Ford KV43-342-WNL Mueller 14258N A.Y.McDonald 746022T	Each	\$28.08	10	AYM / 74602T 1"X3/4"	\$ 30.16	\$301.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV43-342W-NL	\$ 32.53	\$325.30	MUELLER 014258	\$ 32.38	\$323.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Angle Valve 3/4 x 1	2570500	Ford KV63-332W-GNL A.Y.McDonald 74602-3T	Each	\$28.53	2	AYM / 74602-3G 3/4"	\$ 30.64	\$61.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford KV63-332W-G-NL	\$ 32.53	\$65.06	MUELLER 014259	\$ 39.49	\$78.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	5/8" Stop Corp Cock Copper Flare Connection	2120005	Ford F600-2NL	Each	\$17.95	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford F600-2-NL	\$ 19.97	\$119.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	3/4" Stop Corp Cock Copper Flare Connection	2120006	Mueller H15000N Ford F600-3NL A.Y.McDonald 74701	Each	\$19.20	2	AYM / 74701 3/4"	\$ 20.80	\$41.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford F600-3-NL	\$ 22.41	\$44.82	MUELLER 015000	\$ 22.98	\$45.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	1" Stop Corp Cock Copper Flare Connection	2120010	Mueller H15000N Ford F600-4NL A.Y.McDonald 74701	Each	\$29.33	226	AYM / 74701 1"	\$31.50	\$7,119.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford F600-4-NL	\$32.30	\$7,299.80	MUELLER 015000	\$ 35.08	\$7,928.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

53	5/8" Branch Piece w/Two Stops	2050005	Ford UV43-41W-65-GNL	Each	\$68.96	2	AYM / 709UTAW 1"x5/8"x6.5	\$73.70	\$147.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford UV43-41W-65-G-NL	\$ 82.41	\$164.82	MUELLER 01536303	\$ 86.75	\$173.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54	3/4 x 3/4 x 3/4 Branch Piece w/Two Stops	2050007	Ford UV43-32W-65-GNL	Each	\$68.22	300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford UV43-32W-65-G-NL	\$ 80.5	\$24,150.00	MUELLER 01536303	\$ 91.56	\$27,468.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
55	3/4 x 3/4 x 1 Branch Piece w/Two Stops	2050006	Ford UV43-42W-65-GNL	Each	\$71.70	10	AYM / 709UTAW 1"x3/4"x6.5	\$ 76.63	\$766.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford UV43-41W-65-G-NL	\$ 84.63	\$846.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
56	1x1x1 Branch piece w/two stops	2050010	Mueller 681363	Each	\$18.23	26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford UV43-44W-14-AW-G-NL	\$ 142.54	\$3,706.04	MUELLER 681363	\$ 18.18	\$472.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
57	5/8" x 3/4" S-Tubes	2510100	Ford ST-2NL AY McDonald 74619S3	Each	\$26.31	126	AYM / 4619S 5/8"x3/4"x4.50	\$ 28.12	\$3,543.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford ST-2	\$ 29.95	\$3,773.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
58	5/8" S-Tubes	2510099	Ford ST-1NL AY McDonald 74619S3	Each	\$24.77	2	AYM / 4619S 5/8"x4.50	\$ 26.61	\$53.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford ST-1	\$ 28.23	\$56.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
59	1" S-Tubes	2510101	Ford ST-4NL AY McDonald 74619S3	Each	\$47.64	40	AYM / 4619S 1"x5.50	\$ 51.16	\$2,046.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford ST-4	\$ 54.25	\$2,170.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60	2" Ell Flanged 2" FIP Outlet	2330020	Ford LF31-77NL AY McDonald 74783FF	Each	\$33.87	2	AYM / 74783FF 2"	\$ 80.04	\$160.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford LF31-77-NL	\$ 86.69	\$173.38	MUELLER 010129	\$ 44.11	\$88.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
61	1-1/2" Meter Flange MIP	2330514	Ford LF38-66-2NL AY McDonald 7610M	Each	\$31.12	2	AYM / 7610M 1 1/2"	\$ 31.95	\$63.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CF38-66-2-NL	\$ 34.6	\$69.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
62	2" Meter Flange MIP	2330500	Ford LF38-77-2-125NL AY McDonald 7610M	Each	\$39.67	2	AYM / 7610M 2"X2 1/8"	\$ 42.6	\$85.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CF38-77-2-125-NL	\$ 46.17	\$92.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
63	1-1/2" Meter Flange FIP	2330614	Ford CF31-66NL Cambridge Brass 803450295MNL AYMcDonald 7610F	Each	\$28.09	2	AYM / 7610F 1 1/2"	\$ 30.17	\$60.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CF31-66-NL	\$ 32.07	\$64.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
64	2" Meter Flange FIP	2330600	Ford CF31-77NL Cambridge Brass 50390MNL AYMcDonald 7610F	Each	\$36.68	2	AYM / 7610F 2"	\$ 39.39	\$78.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CF31-77-NL	\$ 41.82	\$83.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65	1-1/2" Union Brass GJ	2621014	Lee	Each	\$46.46	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$21.50	\$43.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
66	2" Union Brass GJ	2621020	Lee	Each	\$62.75	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$33.50	\$67.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
67	Bushing Brass 5/8" x 3/4" Meter	2070508	Mueller H10888N Ford A123NL	Each	\$2.18	1100	AYM / 10J12	\$ 2.33	\$2,563.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford A12S-NL	\$ 3.67	\$4,037.00	MUELLER 010888	\$ 14.86	\$16,346.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68	Bushing Brass 3/4 MIP x 1/2 FIP	2070604	Ford C18-13NL	Each	\$1.47	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$1.59	\$3.18	Pre-Approved	\$3.10	\$6.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44509LF	\$ 2.95	\$5.90
69	Bushing Brass 1 MIP x 3/4 FIP	2071006	Ford C18-34NL	Each	\$2.24	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$2.40	\$4.80	Pre-Approved	\$ 3.85	\$7.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44513LF	\$ 4.48	\$8.96
70	Bushing Brass CC Tapered 1 CC x 3/4 CC	2071106	Mueller H10036N Ford BBAA-43NL	Each	\$8.41	2	AYM / 747011 1"x3/4"	\$ 9.12	\$18.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford BBAA-43-NL	\$ 10.49	\$20.98	MUELLER 010036	\$ 26.79	\$53.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
71	Bushing Brass CC Tapered 1-1/2 CC x 1 CC	2071156	Mueller 10036N Ford BBAA-64NL Cambridge Brass 83NL-A6A4	Each	\$22.64	2	AYM / 747011 1 1/2"x1"	\$ 43.17	\$86.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford BBAA-64-NL	\$ 28.36	\$56.72	MUELLER 010036	\$ 30.16	\$60.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72	Bushing Brass CC Tapered 2 CC x 1-1/2 CC	2071175	Mueller 10036N Ford BBAA-76NL Cambridge Brass 83NL-A7A6	Each	\$27.59	2	AYM / 747011 2"X1 1/2"	\$ 29.37	\$58.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford BBAA76-NL	\$ 34.52	\$69.04	MUELLER 010036	\$ 44.77	\$89.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
73	Bushing Brass 1-1/4 MIP x 3/4 FIP	2071206	Ford C18-35NL	Each	\$3.81	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 4.08	\$8.16	Pre-Approved	\$ 9.22	\$18.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44517LF	\$ 7.62	\$15.24
74	Bushing Brass 1-1/4 MIP x 1 FIP	2071210	Ford C18-45NL	Each	\$3.81	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 4.08	\$204.00	Pre-Approved	\$ 7.42	\$371.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44518LF	\$ 7.62	\$381.00
75	Bushing Brass 1-1/2 MIP x 3/4 FIP	2071406	Ford C18-36NL Lee	Each	\$6.59	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 6.37	\$12.74	Pre-Approved	\$ 15.58	\$31.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44522LF	\$ 11.92	\$23.84
76	Bushing Brass 1-1/2 MIP x 1 FIP	2071410	Ford C18-46NL Lee	Each	\$4.87	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 5.21	\$10.42	Pre-Approved	\$ 15.58	\$31.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44523LF	\$ 9.74	\$19.48
77	Bushing Brass 2 MIP x 3/4 FIP	2072006	Ford C18-37NL Lee	Each	\$8.68	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$9.30	\$18.60	Pre-Approved	\$ 16.24	\$32.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44528LF	\$ 14.85	\$29.70
78	Bushing Brass 2 MIP x 1 FIP	2072010	Ford C18-47NL Lee	Each	\$8.68	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$9.30	\$18.60	Pre-Approved	\$ 15.04	\$30.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44529LF	\$17.40	\$34.80
79	Bushing Brass 2 MIP x 1-1/2 FIP	2072014	Ford C18-67NL Lee	Each	\$7.21	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$7.71	\$15.42	Pre-Approved	\$15.00	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44531LF	\$ 14.45	\$28.90
80	Bushing Brass 3 MIP x 2 FIP	2073020	Ford Lee	Each	\$22.00	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$23.33	\$46.66	Pre-Approved	\$ 22.66	\$45.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44538LF	\$ 60.15	\$120.30
81	Coupling Straight Meter 3/4 Meter x 2.5 Length	2151106	Mueller H10896N Ford C38-23-2.5NL AY McDonald 74620	Each	\$6.46	2	AYM / 74620 3/4"x3/4"x2.50	\$6.70	\$13.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C38-23-2-5-NL	\$ 7.19	\$14.38	MUELLER 010896	\$ 21.21	\$42.42	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

82	Coupling Straight Mtr 1 Meter x 2.625 Length	2151110	Ford 38-44-2-625NL	Each	\$9.72	2	AYM / 74620 1"X1"X2.63	\$ 10.43	\$20.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C38-44-2-625-NL	\$ 11.08	\$22.16	MUELLER 010896	\$ 11.07	\$22.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
83	Coupling Copper Tube Straight 3/4" Compression	2155006	Mueller H15403N Ford C44-33-GNL AY McDonald 74758T	Each	11.71	550	AYM / 74758T 3/4"	\$ 12.58	\$6,919.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-33-G-NL	\$ 13.46	\$7,403.00	MUELLER 015403	\$ 13.77	\$7,573.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
84	Coupling Copper Tube Straight 1" Compression	2155010	Mueller H15403 Ford C44-44-G AY McDonald 4758T	Each	\$13.53	2	AYM / 74758T 1"	\$ 14.53	\$29.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-44-G-NL	\$ 15.39	\$30.78	MUELLER 015403	\$ 15.02	\$30.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
85	Coupling Copper Tube Straight 5/8 Comp x 3/4 Compression	2155015	Ford C44-23-GNL Cambridge Brass 118NL-H3B2 Mueller 15403N AY McDonald 74758T	Each	\$13.74	250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-23-G-NL	\$ 15.26	\$3,815.00	MUELLER 015403	\$19.60	\$4,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
86	Coupling Copper Tube Straight 1 Comp x 3/4 comp	2155016	Mueller H15403N Ford C44-34-GNL AY McDonald 74758T	Each	\$13.75	2	AYM / 74758T 3/4"X1"	\$ 14.76	\$29.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-34-G-NL	\$ 15.64	\$31.28	MUELLER 015403	\$ 15.19	\$30.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
87	Coupling Copper Tube Straight 1/2 Comp x 3/4 Compression	2155013	Ford C44-13-GNL AY McDonald 74758-22	Each	\$12.11	76	AYM / 74758-22 1/2"X3/4"	\$14.00	\$1,064.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C14-13-G-NL	\$ 13.81	\$1,049.56	MUELLER 015403	\$ 18.85	\$1,432.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
88	Coupling 3/4 Copper x 3/4 PVC	2155106	Ford C47-33-GNL AY McDonald 74758T-44	Each	\$15.99	226	AYM / 74758T-44 3/4"	\$ 17.17	\$3,880.42	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C47-33-G-NL	\$ 16.19	\$3,658.94	MUELLER E15443	\$ 17.77	\$4,016.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	Coupling 3/4 Copper x 1 PVC	2155107	Ford C47-34-GNL AY McDonald 74758T-44	Each	\$22.38	100	AYM / 74758T-44 3/4"X1"	\$ 24.04	\$2,404.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C47-34-G-NL	\$ 25.44	\$2,544.00	MUELLER V15441	\$ 24.38	\$2,438.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	Coupling 1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 PVC	2154115	AY McDonald 74758T-44 1 1/2"	Each	\$62.33	2	AYM / 74758T-44 1 1/2"	\$ 66.93	\$133.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C47-66-G-NL	\$ 71.05	\$142.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
91	Coupling 2 Copper x 2 PVC	2154120	Ford C47-77-GNL AY McDonald 74758T-44	Each	\$72.75	2	AYM / 74758T-44 2"	\$ 78.13	\$156.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C47-77-G-NL	\$ 82.91	\$165.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
92	Coupling 1 Copper x 1 PVC	2154210	AY McDonald 74758T-3G 1"	Each	\$21.36	20	AYM / 74758T-3G 1"	\$ 23.15	\$463.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C47-44-G-NL	\$ 26.36	\$527.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
93	Coupling 1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 MIP	2155814	Mueller H15428N Ford C84-66-GNL AY McDonald 74753T	Each	\$30.91	2	AYM / 74753T 1 1/2"	\$ 33.19	\$66.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C84-66-G-NL	\$ 35.95	\$71.90	MUELLER 015428	\$ 36.87	\$73.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
94	Coupling Compression 2 Compress x 2 MIP	2155820	Mueller H15428N Ford C84-77-GNL AY McDonald 74753T	Each	\$45.03	50	AYM / 74753T 2"	\$ 48.13	\$2,406.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C84-77-G-NL	\$ 52.37	\$2,618.50	MUELLER 015428	\$ 53.72	\$2,686.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
95	Coupling Compression 1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 IPS	2154415	Ford C45-66-GNL AY McDonald 74758-55	Each	\$58.59	2	AYM / 74758T-55 1 1/2"	\$ 62.91	\$125.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C45-66-G-NL	\$ 66.81	\$133.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
96	Coupling Compression 2 Copper x 2 IPS	2154420	Ford C45-77-GNL AY McDonald 74758T-55	Each	\$63.66	2	AYM / 74758T-55 2"	\$ 68.36	\$136.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C45-77-G-NL	\$72.60	\$145.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
97	Coupling Compression 3/4 PVC x 3/4 IPS	2155407	Mueller H15403N Ford C77-33-GNL AY McDonald 74758-44	Each	\$17.27	20	AYM / 74758-44 3/4"	\$ 18.55	\$371.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C77-33-NL	\$ 19.72	\$394.40	MUELLER 015403	\$ 13.77	\$275.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
98	Coupling Compression 1 PVC x 1 IPS	2155411	Ford C46-44-GNL AY McDonald 74758T-3T	Each	\$29.34	2	AYM / 74758-44 1"	\$ 31.51	\$63.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C77-44-NL	\$ 33.46	\$66.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
99	Coupling Compression 1-1/2 PVC x 1-1/2 IPS	2155414	Ford C47-66-GNL	Each	\$57.26	2	AYM / 74758-44 1 1/2"	\$ 61.49	\$122.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C77-66-NL	\$ 65.29	\$130.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
100	Coupling Compression 2 PVC x 2 IPS	2155420	Ford C77-77-G AY McDonald 4758-44	Each	\$86.63	2	AYM / 74758-44 2"	\$ 93.02	\$186.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C77-77-NL	\$ 98.75	\$197.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
101	Coupling Compression 1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 Copper	2155714	Mueller H15403N Ford C44-66-GNL AY McDonald 74758T	Each	\$44.39	50	AYM / 74758T 1 1/2"	\$ 47.67	\$2,383.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-66-G-NL	\$ 51.65	\$2,582.50	MUELLER 015403	\$ 52.96	\$2,648.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
102	Coupling Compression 2 Copper x 2 Copper	2155720	Mueller H15403N Ford C44-77-GNL Cambridge Brass 119NL-H7H7 AY McDonald 74758-22	Each	\$59.95	2	AYM / 74758T 2"	\$ 64.38	\$128.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C44-77-G-NL	\$ 69.72	\$139.44	MUELLER 015403	\$ 71.52	\$143.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
103	Coupling Compression 1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 FIP	2155830	Mueller H15451N Ford C14-66-GNL Cambridge 117NL-BXB AY McDonald 74754-22	Each	\$40.33	2	AYM / 74754T 1 1/2"	\$ 43.31	\$86.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C14-66-G-NL	\$ 45.98	\$91.96	MUELLER 015451	\$ 47.14	\$94.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
104	Coupling Compression 2 Copper x 2 FIP	2155835	Mueller H15451N Ford C14-77-GNL AY McDonald 74754T	Each	\$48.02	2	AYM / 74754T 2"	\$ 51.56	\$103.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C14-77-G-NL	\$ 54.75	\$109.50	MUELLER 015451	\$ 56.18	\$112.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
105	Coupling Lead Pac OS 5/8 x 3/4	2362169	Ford Q32-23GNL AY McDonald 74758C-68	Each	\$18.00	2	AYM / 74758C-68 3/4"X5/8"	\$ 19.33	\$38.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford Q32-23-NL	\$ 20.76	\$41.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
106	Coupling Lead Pac 3/4 x 3/4	2362171	Ford Q22-33GNL AY McDonald 74758C-67	Each	\$21.28	2	AYM / 74758C-67 3/4"	\$ 22.84	\$45.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford Q22-33-NL	\$ 24.52	\$49.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
107	Coupling Lead Pac 5/8 x 3/4	2362170	Ford Q22-23GNL AY McDonald 74758C-67	Each	\$16.85	2	AYM / 74758C-67 3/4"X5/8"	\$ 18.09	\$36.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford Q22-23-NL	\$ 19.41	\$38.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
108	Coupling Lead Pac 1 x 1	2362172	Ford Q22-44GNL AY McDonald 74758C-67	Each	\$26.73	2	AYM / 74758C-67 1"	\$ 28.7	\$57.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford Q22-44-NL	\$ 30.83	\$61.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
109	5/8" Pressure Regulator Adaptor	2430005	Ford RA1NL AY McDonald 74619	Each	\$5.74	36	AYM / 74619 5/8"	\$ 9.06	\$326.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford RA-1-NL	\$ 6.38	\$229.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

110	3/4" Pressure Regulator Adaptor	2430006	Ford RA2 AY McDonald 4619	Each	\$6.32	100	AYM / 74619 3/4"	\$7.40	\$740.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford RA-2-NL	\$ 7.21	\$721.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
111	1" Pressure Regulator Adaptor	2430010	Ford RA4NL AY McDonald 74619	Each	\$8.38	30	AYM / 74619 1"	\$9.00	\$270.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford RA-4-NL	\$ 18.66	\$559.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
112	1-1/2" Gate Valve FIP x FIP	2640014	Milwaukee 1151 Kitz 42-200 Mueller H10914N	Each	\$20.36	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$ 24.19	\$483.80	MUELLER 010914	\$ 172.08	\$3,441.60	Midland-940136	\$51.00	\$1,020.00
113	2" Gate Valve FIP x FIP Rising Stem	2640020	Milwaukee 1151 Kitz 42-200	Each	\$119.30	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$ 141.35	\$2,827.00	MUELLER 010914	\$ 232.72	\$4,654.40	Midland-940137	\$67.00	\$1,340.00
114	3/4" Swing Check Valve FIP x FIP	2640106	Milwaukee 509 Kitz	Each	\$6.47	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$11.50	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-940353	\$15.33	\$30.66
115	3/4" Stop Tee Head w/ Handle	2540306	Cambridge Brass 02NL-F3F3H	Each	\$33.34	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford Z11-333SW-HB-34-NL	\$ 47.55	\$95.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
116	3/4" Backflow Preventer	2160006	Watts #7	Each	\$51.68	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Watts #7	\$55.00	\$1,650.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
117	Tee, Threaded 3/4 FIP x 3/4 FIP	2602996	Lee	Each	\$3.39	2	AYM / 72230 3/4"	\$ 4.52	\$9.04	Brecco	\$ 3.64	\$7.28	Pre-Approved	\$ 3.53	\$7.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44524LF	\$6.80	\$13.60
118	Tee, Threaded 1 FIP x 1 FIP	2602998	Lee	Each	\$6.03	2	AYM / 72230 1"	\$ 8.06	\$16.12	Brecco	\$ 6.45	\$12.90	Pre-Approved	\$ 6.27	\$12.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44255LF	\$ 12.08	\$24.16
119	Tee, Threaded 1-1/2 FIP x 1-1/2 FIP	2603000	Lee	Each	\$11.63	2	AYM / 72230 1 1/2"	\$ 15.45	\$30.90	Brecco	\$ 12.45	\$24.90	Pre-Approved	\$ 12.09	\$24.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44257LF	\$ 23.31	\$46.62
120	Tee, Threaded 1-1/2 FIP x 3/4 FIP	2603006	Lee	Each	\$14.39	10	AYM / 72230 1 1/2"X3/4"	\$ 19.19	\$191.90	Brecco	\$ 15.43	\$154.30	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.98	\$149.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44316LF	\$ 46.05	\$460.50
121	Tee, Threaded 1-1/2 FIP x 1 FIP	2603010	Lee	Each	\$14.39	2	AYM / 72230 1 1/2"X1"	\$ 19.19	\$38.38	Brecco	\$ 15.43	\$30.86	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.98	\$29.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44318LF	\$ 46.05	\$92.10
122	Tee, Threaded 2 FIP x 3/4 FIP	2604006	Lee	Each	\$23.53	2	AYM / 72230 2"X3/4"	\$ 31.42	\$62.84	Brecco	\$ 25.21	\$50.42	Pre-Approved	\$ 24.48	\$48.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44328LF	\$ 77.07	\$154.14
123	Tee, Threaded 2 FIP x 2 FIP	2604000	Lee	Each	\$19.05	2	AYM / 72230 2"	\$ 25.43	\$50.86	Brecco	\$ 20.41	\$40.82	Pre-Approved	\$ 19.82	\$39.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44528LF	\$ 38.21	\$76.42
124	Tee, Threaded 2 FIP x 1 FIP	2604010	Lee	Each	\$23.53	6	AYM / 72230 2"X1"	\$ 31.42	\$188.52	Brecco	\$ 25.21	\$151.26	Pre-Approved	\$ 24.48	\$146.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44330LF	\$ 42.32	\$253.92
125	Tee, Threaded 2 FIP x 1-1/2 FIP	2604014	Lee	Each	\$23.53	2	AYM / 72230 2"X1 1/2"	\$ 31.42	\$62.84	Brecco	\$ 25.21	\$50.42	Pre-Approved	\$ 24.48	\$48.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44336LF	\$ 77.07	\$154.14
126	Tee 1-1/2 x 3/4	2605146	Lee	Each	\$14.39	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 15.43	\$30.86	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.98	\$29.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44316LF	\$ 47.15	\$94.30
127	Tee 2 x 3/4	2605206	Dresser 65	Each	\$101.30	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Brecco	\$ 25.21	\$50.42	Pre-Approved	\$135.00	\$270.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44328LF	\$ 77.07	\$154.14
128	Tee Compression 1 x 1	2602010	A.Y McDonald 74760T	Each	\$30.64	2	AYM / 74760T 1"	\$ 28.52	\$57.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford T444-444-G-NL	\$ 34.94	\$69.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
129	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 3/4" x 1/2"	2420604	Lee	Each	\$2.69	2	AYM / 72210 3/4"X1/2"	\$ 3.57	\$7.14	Brecco	\$ 2.88	\$5.76	Pre-Approved	\$2.80	\$5.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44438LF	\$ 5.37	\$10.74
130	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 1" x 3/4"	2421006	Lee	Each	\$4.46	2	AYM / 72210 1"X3/4"	\$ 5.91	\$11.82	Brecco	\$ 4.78	\$9.56	Pre-Approved	\$ 4.65	\$9.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44442LF	\$ 8.94	\$17.88
131	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 1-1/2" x 3/4"	2421406	Lee	Each	\$10.25	2	AYM / 72210 1 1/2"X3/4"	\$ 13.61	\$27.22	Brecco	\$ 10.98	\$21.96	Pre-Approved	\$ 10.66	\$21.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44448LF	\$ 20.55	\$41.10
132	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 2" x 3/4"	2422006	Lee	Each	\$15.24	2	AYM / 72210 2" X 3/4"	\$ 20.19	\$40.38	Brecco	\$ 16.33	\$32.66	Pre-Approved	\$ 15.86	\$31.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44451LF	\$ 42.08	\$84.16
133	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 2" x 1"	2422010	Lee	Each	\$15.24	2	AYM / 72210 2"X1"	\$ 20.19	\$40.38	Brecco	\$ 16.33	\$32.66	Pre-Approved	\$ 15.86	\$31.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44452LF	\$ 30.57	\$61.14
134	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 2" x 1-1/2"	2422014	Lee	Each	\$13.52	2	AYM / 72210 2"X1 1/2"	\$ 17.96	\$35.92	Brecco	\$ 14.48	\$28.96	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.07	\$28.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44454LF	\$27.10	\$54.20
135	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 1-1/2" x 1"	2421410	Lee	Each	\$9.09	2	AYM / 72210 1 1/2"X1"	\$ 12.11	\$24.22	Brecco	\$ 9.75	\$19.50	Pre-Approved	\$ 9.47	\$18.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44449LF	\$ 18.25	\$36.50
136	Bell Reducer Brass Threaded 2-1/2" x 2"	2422420	Lee	Each	\$23.95	2	AYM / 72210 2 1/2"X2"	\$ 31.81	\$63.62	Brecco	\$ 25.66	\$51.32	Pre-Approved	\$ 24.93	\$49.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44462LF	\$ 66.15	\$132.30
137	3/4" Plug Brass Std.	2411206	Lee	Each	\$1.61	2	AYM / 72203 3/4"	\$ 2.97	\$5.94	Brecco	\$ 1.73	\$3.46	Pre-Approved	\$ 1.68	\$3.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44654LF	\$ 3.61	\$7.22
138	1-1/4" Plug Brass Std.	2411212	Lee	Each	\$3.18	2	AYM / 72203 1 1/4"	\$ 9.07	\$18.14	Brecco	\$ 3.40	\$6.80	Pre-Approved	\$ 3.30	\$6.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44656LF	\$ 6.35	\$12.70

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

139	1-1/2" Plug Brass Std.	2411214	Lee	Each	\$4.04	2	AYM / 72203 1 1/2"	\$ 11.76	\$23.52	Brecco	\$ 4.33	\$8.66	Pre-Approved	\$4.20	\$8.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44657LF	\$ 16.64	\$33.28
140	5/8" Plug Brass Threaded NS SQ Head Nut (10)	2412005	Lee	Each	\$3.09	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$10.00	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
141	3/4" Plug Brass Threaded NS SQ Head Nut (10)	2412006	Lee	Each	\$1.61	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$1.68	\$3.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
142	1-1/2" Plug Brass Threaded NS SQ Head Nut (10)	2412014	Lee	Each	\$4.04	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pre-Approved	\$4.20	\$8.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
143	3/4" Plug Tapered AWWA	2412406	Ford CSP-3ANL AYMcDonald 73206	Each	\$5.11	2	AYM / 73206 3/4"	\$ 4.64	\$9.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CSP-3-A-NL	\$ 5.69	\$11.38	MUELLER 010035	\$ 13.22	\$26.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
144	1" Plug Tapered AWWA	2412410	Ford CSP-4ANL AYMcDonald 73206	Each	\$7.46	2	AYM / 73206 1"	\$ 6.75	\$13.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CSP-4-A-NL	\$ 8.28	\$16.56	MUELLER 010035	\$ 14.58	\$29.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
145	1-1/2" Plug Tapered AWWA	2412414	Ford CSP-6ANL AYMcDonald 73206	Each	\$16.81	2	AYM / 73206 1 1/2"	\$ 15.14	\$30.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CSP-6-A-NL	\$22.40	\$44.80	MUELLER 010035	\$18.00	\$36.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
146	2" Plug Threaded Brass Tapered AWWA	2412420	Ford CSP-7ANL Cambridge Brass 98NL-A7 AYMcDonald 73206	Each	\$21.80	2	AYM / 73206 2"	\$ 19.64	\$39.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford CSP-7-A-NL	\$ 38.38	\$76.76	MUELLER 010035	\$ 33.38	\$66.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
147	2" Plug Threaded Brass	2415020	Lee	Each	\$6.36	200	AYM / 72203 2"	\$ 18.63	\$3,726.00	Brecco	\$ 6.82	\$1,364.00	Pre-Approved	\$ 6.63	\$1,326.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44658LF	\$ 12.78	\$2,556.00
148	Piggy Back Nut 5/8" x 3/4"	2400005	Ford C02-32NL	Each	\$8.68	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C02-32-NL	\$ 9.62	\$19.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
149	Piggy Back Nut 3/4 x 5/8	2400006	Ford C102-23NL AYMcDonald 74742	Each	\$10.11	2	AYM / 74742 5/8"X3/4"	\$ 11.18	\$22.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C102-23-NL	\$13.70	\$27.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
150	Piggy Back Nut 3/4 x 1	2400010	Ford C02-43NL AYMcDonald 74755	Each	\$12.81	50	AYM / 74755 3/4"X1"	\$ 12.06	\$603.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C02-43-NL	\$ 14.76	\$738.00	MUELLER 015062	\$ 18.59	\$929.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
151	Piggy Back Nut OS 3/4 x 5/8	2400025	Ford C104-23GNL	Each	\$12.33	2	AYM / 74742T 5/8"X3/4"	\$ 12.68	\$25.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ford C104-23-G-NL	\$ 14.38	\$28.76	MUELLER 015062	\$ 15.68	\$31.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
152	1-1/2" Ell Brass Threaded	2213014	Lee	Each	\$8.44	2	AYM / 72290 1 1/2"	\$ 11.29	\$22.58	Brecco	\$ 12.59	\$25.18	Pre-Approved	\$8.80	\$17.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44107LF	\$ 16.94	\$33.88
153	2" Ell Brass Threaded	2213020	Lee	Each	\$13.76	76	AYM / 72290 2"	\$ 18.36	\$1,395.36	Brecco	\$ 14.74	\$1,120.24	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.32	\$1,088.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44108LF	\$27.00	\$2,052.00
154	3/4" Ell Brass Street	2214006	Lee	Each	\$3.60	30	AYM / 72291 3/4"	\$ 4.84	\$145.20	Brecco	\$ 3.85	\$115.50	Pre-Approved	\$ 3.74	\$112.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44164LF	\$7.20	\$216.00
155	1" Ell Brass Street	2214010	Lee	Each	\$5.95	2	AYM / 72291 1"	\$ 7.92	\$15.84	Brecco	\$ 6.37	\$12.74	Pre-Approved	\$ 6.19	\$12.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44165LF	\$ 11.92	\$23.84
156	1-1/2" Ell Brass Street	2214014	Lee	Each	\$11.86	2	AYM / 72291 1 1/2"	\$ 15.84	\$31.68	Brecco	\$12.70	\$25.40	Pre-Approved	\$ 12.36	\$24.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44167LF	\$ 23.77	\$47.54
157	2" Ell Brass Street	2214020	Lee	Each	\$20.09	2	AYM / 72291 2"	\$ 26.87	\$53.74	Brecco	\$ 21.54	\$43.08	Pre-Approved	\$ 20.92	\$41.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44168LF	\$40.30	\$80.60
158	Ell Brass Reducing 2" x 1-1/2"	2222014	Lee	Each	\$19.28	26	AYM / 72290 2"X1 1/2"	\$ 25.74	\$669.24	Brecco	\$ 20.66	\$537.16	Pre-Approved	\$ 20.07	\$521.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44142LF	\$ 48.28	\$1,255.28
159	Ell Brass Reducing 2-1/2" x 2"	2222020	Lee	Each	\$32.67	50	AYM / 72290 2 1/2"X2"	\$ 43.62	\$2,181.00	Brecco	\$ 35.01	\$1,750.50	Pre-Approved	\$ 33.99	\$1,699.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44146LF	\$128.00	\$6,400.00
160	Coupling Brass Threaded 3/4 FIP x 3/4 FIP	2152006	Lee	Each	\$2.24	16	AYM / 72210 3/4"	\$ 2.96	\$47.36	Brecco	\$2.40	\$38.40	Pre-Approved	\$ 2.33	\$37.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44414LF	\$4.48	\$71.68
161	Coupling Brass Threaded 1-1/2 FIP x 1-1/2 FIP	2152014	Lee	Each	\$7.21	2	AYM / 72210 1 1/2"	\$ 9.56	\$19.12	Brecco	\$ 7.71	\$15.42	Pre-Approved	\$ 7.49	\$14.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44417LF	\$14.44	\$28.88
162	Coupling Brass Threaded 2 FIP x 2 FIP	2152020	Lee	Each	\$11.86	100	AYM / 72210 2"	\$ 15.73	\$1,573.00	Brecco	\$12.70	\$1,270.00	Pre-Approved	\$ 12.34	\$1,234.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44418LF	\$23.50	\$2,350.00
163	Nipple Brass 3/4 x CL (12)	2361006	Merit Trenton	Each	\$1.33	26	AYM / 2200 3/4"	\$ 1.58	\$41.08	Brecco	\$1.33	\$34.58	Pre-Approved	\$ 1.37	\$35.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-44080	\$3.20	\$83.20
164	Nipple Brass 1 x CL	2361010	Merit Trenton	Each	\$1.20	50	AYM / 2200 1"	\$ 2.34	\$117.00	Brecco	\$1.96	\$98.00	Pre-Approved	\$ 2.02	\$101.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40100	\$4.68	\$234.00
165	Nipple Brass 1-1/2 x CL	2361014	Merit Trenton	Each	\$3.87	2	AYM / 2200 1 1/2"	\$ 4.61	\$9.22	Brecco	\$ 3.85	\$7.70	Pre-Approved	\$ 3.95	\$7.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40140	\$9.20	\$18.40
166	Nipple Brass 2 x CL	2361020	Merit Trenton	Each	\$5.88	30	AYM / 2200 2"	\$7.00	\$210.00	Brecco	\$ 5.85	\$175.50	Pre-Approved	\$ 6.02	\$180.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40160	\$14.02	\$420.60
167	Nipple Brass 3/4 x 6	2361066	Merit Trenton	Each	\$4.28	2	AYM / 2200 3/4"X6"	\$ 5.09	\$10.18	Brecco	\$ 4.26	\$8.52	Pre-Approved	\$ 4.38	\$8.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40090	\$ 10.22	\$20.44

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 20-24 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: September 16, 2020
Term: October 28, 2020 - October 27, 2022

168	Nipple Brass 1 x 5	2361105	Merit Trenton	Each	\$5.24	2	AYM / 2200 1"X5"	\$ 6.22	\$12.44	Brecco	\$ 5.21	\$10.42	Pre-Approved	\$ 5.36	\$10.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40107	\$ 13.66	\$27.32
169	Nipple Brass 1-1/2 x 3	2361143	Merit Trenton	Each	\$5.51	2	AYM / 2200 1 1/2"X3"	\$ 6.79	\$13.58	Brecco	\$ 5.69	\$11.38	Pre-Approved	\$ 5.85	\$11.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40143	\$14.00	\$28.00
170	Nipple Brass 1-1/2 x 4	2361144	Merit Trenton	Each	\$7.45	2	AYM / 2200 1 1/2"X4"	\$ 8.85	\$17.70	Brecco	\$ 7.42	\$14.84	Pre-Approved	\$ 7.63	\$15.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40145	\$17.00	\$34.00
171	Nipple Brass 1-1/2 x 5	2361145	Merit Trenton	Each	\$9.26	2	AYM / 2200 1 1/2"X5"	\$ 10.99	\$21.98	Brecco	\$ 9.22	\$18.44	Pre-Approved	\$ 9.47	\$18.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40147	\$22.10	\$44.20
172	Nipple Brass 1-1/2 x 6	2361146	Merit Trenton	Each	\$11.00	2	AYM / 2200 1 1/2"X6"	\$ 13.05	\$26.10	Brecco	\$ 10.97	\$21.94	Pre-Approved	\$ 11.26	\$22.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40149	\$ 26.16	\$52.32
173	Nipple Brass 2 x 3	2361203	Merit Trenton	Each	\$7.57	66	AYM / 2200 2"X3"	\$ 8.67	\$572.22	Brecco	\$ 7.28	\$480.48	Pre-Approved	\$ 7.49	\$494.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40162	\$17.50	\$1,155.00
174	Nipple Brass 2 x 4	2361204	Merit Trenton	Each	\$9.58	26	AYM / 2200 2"X4"	\$ 11.37	\$295.62	Brecco	\$ 9.54	\$248.04	Pre-Approved	\$9.80	\$254.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40164	\$ 22.88	\$594.88
175	Nipple Brass 2 x 5	2361205	Merit Trenton	Each	\$11.85	26	AYM / 2200 2"X5"	\$ 14.09	\$366.34	Brecco	\$ 11.79	\$306.54	Pre-Approved	\$ 12.12	\$315.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40166	\$28.30	\$735.80
176	Nipple Brass 2 x 6	2361206	Merit Trenton	Each	\$14.13	126	AYM / 2200 2"X6"	\$ 16.79	\$2,115.54	Brecco	\$ 14.08	\$1,774.08	Pre-Approved	\$ 14.13	\$1,780.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Midland-40168	\$34.00	\$4,284.00
177	Nipple Brass for Blow Off 2 x 12	2361212	Merit Trenton	Each	\$27.86	100	AYM / 2200 2"X12"	\$ 33.08	\$3,308.00	Brecco	\$ 27.75	\$2,775.00	Pre-Approved	\$ 27.68	\$2,768.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
178	Nipple Brass 2 x 18	2361218	Merit Trenton	Each	\$44.14	176	AYM / 2200 2"X18"	\$ 52.46	\$9,232.96	Brecco	\$ 43.69	\$7,689.44	Pre-Approved	\$ 44.14	\$7,768.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total Cost:							\$237,556.90	\$21,160.84			\$296,737.40			\$278,603.58			\$27,921.90				
Awarded Total Cost:							\$202,998.32	\$11,246.24			\$51,479.42			\$1,442.18							
Combined Total Cost:							\$267,166.16														

(1) Bidder listed Brecco as Manufacturer, after further investigation the manufacturer name is Lansdale Valve and Manufacturing. The items were reviewed and approved by LWC Material Spec Team.

(2) For ease of contract administration, Line item # 113 was awarded to next low bidder.

Planholders not submitting bids: 7 PM Group, ASSD, BBR Printers, Bingham and Taylor Corporation, Caledonia, LLC, EJ, Masters Supply, Onvia, Plumbers Supply Company, RFx Analyst, Inc., Shay Enterprise, Smartprocure Inc., and Water Technology Resources Inc.