

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY  
20-46 Cold Water Meters  
Contract Period: August 1, 2020 thru July 31, 2021

#	Items	Quantity Required	Allied Utility Solutions, LLC		Badger Meter Inc		Ferguson Waterworks		Neptune Technology Group		The C.I. Thornburg Co, Inc.		Zenner Performance Meters (dba Zenner USA)	
			UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost
1														
#1-1	9000902 - 3/4" Displacement Type (Direct Read)	20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65	\$ 1,300.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.58	\$ 1,131.6	\$ 116.95	\$ 2,339.0	\$ 70.67	\$ 1,413.4
2														
#2-1	9000912 - 1 1/2 "Turbine Type (Direct Read)	20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 450	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 1,299.0	\$ 25,980.0	\$ 450	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 826.4	\$ 16,528.0	\$ 471.95	\$ 9,439.0
3														
#3-1	9000915 - 3" Turbine Type with Strainer (Encoder )	30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 875	\$ 26,250.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,033.5	\$ 31,005.0	\$ 1,205.8	\$ 36,174.0	\$ 837.79	\$ 25,133.69
#3-2	9000935 - 3" Turbine Type without strainer (Encoder)	20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 750	\$ 15,000.0	\$ 1,699.0	\$ 33,980.0	\$ 885	\$ 17,700.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 550.25	\$ 11,005.0
#3-3	9000916 - 4" Turbine with Strainer (Encode)	5	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,495.0	\$ 7,475.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,288.5	\$ 6,442.5	\$ 2,316.2	\$ 11,581.0	\$ 1,141.45	\$ 5,707.25
#3-4	9000936 - 4" Turbine without strainer (Encode)	5	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,350.0	\$ 6,750.0	\$ 2,125.0	\$ 10,625.0	\$ 1,111.0	\$ 5,555.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 739.4	\$ 3,697.0
#3-5	9000917 - 6" Turbine with Strainer (Encode)	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,075.0	\$ 9,225.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,331.5	\$ 6,994.5	\$ 4,143.5	\$ 12,430.5	\$ 1,854.14	\$ 5,562.42
#3-6	9000937 - 6" Turbine without strainer (Encoder Type)	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,790.0	\$ 5,580.0	\$ 3,549.0	\$ 7,098.0	\$ 2,029.0	\$ 4,058.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,058.58	\$ 2,117.16
#3-7	9000918 - 8" Turbine with Strainer (Encoder Type)	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,614.5	\$ 7,229.0	\$ 7,008.9	\$ 14,017.8	\$ 3,034.46	\$ 6,068.92
#3-8	9000938 - 8" Turbine without Strainer (Encoder Type)	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,999.0	\$ 2,999.0	\$ 5,159.0	\$ 5,159.0	\$ 2,927.0	\$ 2,927.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,926.26	\$ 1,926.26
#3-9	9000919 - 10" Turbine with Strainer (Encoder Type)	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,815.0	\$ 5,815.0	\$ 9,128.0	\$ 9,128.0	No Bid	No Bid
#3-10	9000949 - 10" Turbine without Strainer (Encoder Type)	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,999.0	\$ 3,999.0	\$ 10,059.0	\$ 10,059.0	\$ 4,790.0	\$ 4,790.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4														
#4-1	9000921 - 3" Compound Type with strainer (Encoder Type- 500W Compatible)	12	\$ 1,822.74	\$ 21,872.88	\$ 1,569.0	\$ 18,828.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,776.5	\$ 21,318.0	\$ 1,727.2	\$ 20,726.4	No Bid	No Bid
#4-2	9001921 - 3" Compound Type without strainer (Encoder Type - 500W Compatible)	13	\$ 1,278.5	\$ 16,620.5	\$ 1,269.0	\$ 16,497.0	\$ 1,699.0	\$ 22,087.0	\$ 1,628.0	\$ 21,164.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#4-3	9000922 - 4" Compound Type with strainer (Encoder Type - 500W Compatible)	25	\$ 2,783.85	\$ 69,596.25	\$ 2,189.0	\$ 54,725.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,366.5	\$ 59,162.5	\$ 2,976.1	\$ 74,402.5	No Bid	No Bid
#4-4	9001922 - 4" Compound Type without strainer (Encoder Type - 500W Compatible)	25	\$ 1,902.5	\$ 47,562.5	\$ 1,789.0	\$ 44,725.0	\$ 2,125.0	\$ 53,125.0	\$ 2,189.0	\$ 54,725.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#4-5	9000923 - 6" Compound Type with Strainer (Encoder Type - 500W Compatible)	5	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,395.0	\$ 21,975.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,817.5	\$ 19,087.5	\$ 5,116.6	\$ 25,583.0	No Bid	No Bid
#4-6	9001923 - 6" Compound Type without strainer (Encoder Type - 500W Compatible)	5	\$ 4,242.38	\$ 21,211.9	\$ 3,795.0	\$ 18,975.0	\$ 3,559.0	\$ 17,795.0	\$ 3,515.0	\$ 17,575.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5														
#5-1	9000924 - 4" Fire Domestic Type (Encoder)	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,558.18	\$ 9,116.36	\$ 4,199.0	\$ 8,398.0	\$ 3,518.0	\$ 7,036.0	\$ 6,566.9	\$ 13,133.8	No Bid	No Bid
#5-2	9000925 - 6" Fire Domestic Type (Encoder)	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6,314.0	\$ 12,628.0	\$ 6,199.0	\$ 12,398.0	\$ 5,502.0	\$ 11,004.0	\$ 8,729.0	\$ 17,458.0	No Bid	No Bid
#5-3	9000926 - 8" Fire Domestic Type (Encoder)	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8,296.42	\$ 16,592.84	\$ 7,999.0	\$ 15,998.0	\$ 8,400.0	\$ 16,800.0	\$ 13,052.6	\$ 26,105.2	No Bid	No Bid
#5-4	900927 - 10" Fire Domestic Type (Encoder)	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14,595.0	\$ 14,595.0	\$ 10,599.0	\$ 10,599.0	\$ 11,200.0	\$ 11,200.0	\$ 18,655.8	\$ 18,655.8	No Bid	No Bid