

21-24 Ductile Iron Fittings Accessories
 Bid Opening: June 2, 2021

Items	Size	Description&Category	Quantity	Ferguson Waterworks		Hayes Pipe Supply	
				UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost
1010304	4"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	44	\$ 73	\$ 3,212.0	\$ 59.5	\$ 2,618.0
1010305	4" x 3"	Adapter Flange X MJ (3" Flg) (non-standard)	40	\$ 131	\$ 5,240.0	\$ 116.5	\$ 4,660.0
1010306	6"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	50	\$ 100	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 73.53	\$ 3,676.5
1010308	8"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	10	\$ 150	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 110.5	\$ 1,105.0
1010310	10"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	0	\$ 250	\$ 0	\$ 191.68	\$ 0.0
1010312	12"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	0	\$ 350	\$ 0	\$ 245.23	\$ 0.0
1010316	16"	Adapter Flange X MJ (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 444.55	\$ 0.0
1010503	3"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 216	\$ 0
1010504	4"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 140.8	\$ 0.0
1010506	6"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 175.47	\$ 0.0
1010508	8"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 252.27	\$ 0.0
1010510	10"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 324.8	\$ 0.0
1010512	12"	Adapter Flange X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 422.94	\$ 0.0
1030804	4"	Bend 11 1/4 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.88	\$ 0.0
1030806	6"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.33	\$ 0.0
1030808	8"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 124.1	\$ 0.0
1030812	12"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 201.45	\$ 0.0
1030816	16"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 464.53	\$ 0.0
1033804	4"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.58	\$ 0.0
1033806	6"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 86.28	\$ 0.0
1033808	8"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 131.75	\$ 0.0
1033812	12"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X PE (non-standard)	5	\$ 320	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 232.48	62.4
1033816	16"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 716.55	\$ 0.0
1034804	4"	Bend 45 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.3	\$ 0.0
1034806	6"	Bend 45 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.3	\$ 0.0
1034808	8"	Bend 45 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 131.75	\$ 0.0
1034812	12"	Bend 45 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 277.1	\$ 0.0
1034816	16"	Bend 45 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 517.23	\$ 0.0
1035804	4"	Bend 90 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.73	\$ 0.0
1035806	6"	Bend 90 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 110.08	\$ 0.0
1035808	8"	Bend 90 MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 156.4	\$ 0.0
1035812	12"	Bend 90 MJ X PE (non-standard)	2	\$ 441	\$ 882	\$ 320.03	\$ 640.06
1090304	4"	Cap MJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	40	\$ 59	\$ 2,360.0	\$ 43.78	\$ 1,751.2
1090306	6"	Cap MJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	20	\$ 81	\$ 1,620.0	\$ 59.93	\$ 1,198.6
1090308	8"	Cap MJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	45	\$ 113	\$ 5,085.0	\$ 83.3	\$ 3,748.5
1090312	12"	Cap MJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	20	\$ 186	\$ 3,720.0	\$ 136.85	\$ 2,737.0
1090316	16"	Cap MJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	0	\$ 359	\$ 0	\$ 264.35	\$ 0.0
1389104	4" x 12"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	4	\$ 279	\$ 1,116.0	\$ 155.98	\$ 623.92
1389106	6" x 12"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	5	\$ 555	\$ 2,775.0	\$ 194.65	\$ 973.25
1389108	8" x 12"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	8	\$ 618	\$ 4,944.0	\$ 314.5	\$ 2,516.0
1389112	12" x 12"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	0	\$ 1,297.0	\$ 0	\$ 565.68	\$ 0.0
1389116	16" x 12"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	3	\$ 3,118.0	\$ 9,354.0	\$ 6,100.0	\$ 18,300.0
1389206	6" x 18"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	15	\$ 510	\$ 7,650.0	\$ 274.98	\$ 4,124.70
1389208	8" x 18"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	12	\$ 758	\$ 9,096.0	\$ 354.45	\$ 4,253.4
1389212	12" x 18"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	5	\$ 1,605.0	\$ 8,025.0	\$ 771.38	\$ 3,856.9
1389216	16" x 18"	Offset MJ X PE (non-standard)	1	\$ 3,503.0	\$ 3,503.0	\$ 6,100.0	\$ 6,100.0
1419104	4"	Plug TJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	3	\$ 66	\$ 198	\$ 46.75	\$ 140.25
1419106	6"	Plug TJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	3	\$ 96	\$ 288	\$ 76.08	\$ 228.24
1419108	8"	Plug TJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	3	\$ 129	\$ 387	\$ 93.93	\$ 281.79
1419112	12"	Plug TJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	4	\$ 199	\$ 796	\$ 149.6	\$ 598.4
1419116	16"	Plug TJ W/2" IPT Tap (non-standard)	5	\$ 495	\$ 2,475.0	\$ 1,503.23	\$ 7,516.15
1436064	6" x 4"	Reducers MJ x PE - 4" PE (non-standard)	0	\$ 500	\$ 0	\$ 83.73	\$ 0.0
1436084	8" x 4"	Reducers MJ x PE - 4" PE (non-standard)	0	\$ 600	\$ 0	\$ 94.78	\$ 0.0
1436086	8" x 6"	Reducers MJ x PE - 6" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.5	\$ 0.0
1436126	12" x 6"	Reducers MJ x PE - 6" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 170.43	\$ 0.0
1436128	12" x 8"	Reducers MJ x PE - 8" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 175.95	\$ 0.0
1437064	6" x 4"	Reducers MJ x PE - 6" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.25	\$ 0.0
1437084	8" x 4"	Reducers MJ x PE - 8" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 92.23	\$ 0.0
1437086	8" x 6"	Reducers MJ x PE - 8" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.73	\$ 0.0
1437126	12" x 6"	Reducers MJ x PE - 12" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 183.6	\$ 0.0
1437128	12" x 8"	Reducers MJ x PE - 12" PE (non-standard)	1	\$ 196	\$ 196	\$ 144.08	\$ 144.08

21-24 Ductile Iron Fittings Accessories

Bid Opening: June 2, 2021

1437168	16" x 8"	Reducers MJ x PE - 16" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 376.98	\$ 0.0
1437612	16" x 12"	Reducers MJ x PE - 12" PE (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 348.93	\$ 0.0
1438043	4" x 3"	Reducer Flg x Flg (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.98	\$ 0.0
1438063	6" x 3"	Reducer Flg x Flg (non-standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 115.18	\$ 0.0
1438064	6" x 4"	Reducer Flg x Flg (non-standard)	2	\$ 150	\$ 300	\$ 152.58	\$ 305.16
4000304	4"	4" Accessory Pack	3000	\$ 22	\$ 66,000.0	\$ 19.13	\$ 57,390.0
4000306	6"	6" Accessory Pack	3000	\$ 29	\$ 87,000.0	\$ 26.35	\$ 79,050.0
4000308	8"	8" Accessory Pack	3000	\$ 33	\$ 99,000.0	\$ 28.9	\$ 86,700.0
4000312	12"	12" Accessory Pack	3000	\$ 49	\$ 147,000.0	\$ 43.93	\$ 131,790.0
5000871	6" x 13"	Valve Connection Piece (standard)	220	\$ 204	\$ 44,880.0	\$ 149.6	\$ 32,912.0
5000872	6" x 24"	Valve Connection Piece (standard)	70	\$ 303	\$ 21,210.0	\$ 222.7	\$ 15,589.0
5000873	6" x 36"	Valve Connection Piece (standard)	13	\$ 260	\$ 3,380.0	\$ 282.63	\$ 3,674.19
5000879	6"	Valve Connection 90-degree bend (standard)	30	\$ 238	\$ 7,140.0	\$ 174.68	\$ 5,240.40
1030904	4"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	5	\$ 58	\$ 290	\$ 42.5	\$ 212.5
1030906	6"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	35	\$ 96	\$ 3,360.0	\$ 70.98	\$ 2,484.3
1030908	8"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	40	\$ 130	\$ 5,200.0	\$ 96.05	\$ 3,842.0
1030912	12"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	45	\$ 260	\$ 11,700.0	\$ 191.68	\$ 8,625.6
1030916	16"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	20	\$ 630	\$ 12,600.0	\$ 464.1	\$ 9,282.0
1030920	20"	Bend 11 1/4" MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 710.6	\$ 0.0
1033904	4"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	25	\$ 60	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 44.2	\$ 1,105.0
1033906	6"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	10	\$ 92	\$ 920	\$ 67.58	\$ 675.8
1033908	8"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	40	\$ 144	\$ 5,760.0	\$ 105.83	\$ 4,233.2
1033912	12"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	30	\$ 278	\$ 8,340.0	\$ 204.43	\$ 6,132.90
1033916	16"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	50	\$ 596	\$ 29,800.0	\$ 438.6	\$ 21,930.0
1033920	20"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 754.38	\$ 0.0
1033924	24"	Bend 22 1/2" MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,012.78	\$ 0.0
1034904	4"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	35	\$ 64	\$ 2,240.0	\$ 46.75	\$ 1,636.25
1034906	6"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	80	\$ 101	\$ 8,080.0	\$ 74.38	\$ 5,950.4
1034908	8"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	190	\$ 147	\$ 27,930.0	\$ 108.38	\$ 20,592.2
1034912	12"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	150	\$ 318	\$ 47,700.0	\$ 233.75	\$ 35,062.5
1034916	16"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	10	\$ 621	\$ 6,210.0	\$ 457.3	\$ 4,573.0
1034920	20"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 722.08	\$ 0.0
1034924	24"	Bend 45 MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,096.93	\$ 0.0
1035904	4"	Bend 90 MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.1	\$ 0.0
1035906	6"	Bend 90 MJ X MJ (standard)	4	\$ 125	\$ 500	\$ 91.8	\$ 367.2
1035908	8"	Bend 90 MJ X MJ (standard)	4	\$ 180	\$ 720	\$ 132.6	\$ 530.4
1035912	12"	Bend 90 MJ X MJ (standard)	8	\$ 384	\$ 3,072.0	\$ 282.63	\$ 2,261.04
1035916	16"	Bend 90 MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 639.63	\$ 0.0
1090204	4"	Cap MJ (standard)	7	\$ 29	\$ 203	\$ 21.25	\$ 148.75
1090206	6"	Cap MJ (standard)	20	\$ 51	\$ 1,020.0	\$ 37.4	\$ 748.0
1090208	8"	Cap MJ (standard)	18	\$ 83	\$ 1,494.0	\$ 61.2	\$ 1,101.60
1090212	12"	Cap MJ (standard)	19	\$ 155	\$ 2,945.0	\$ 114.33	\$ 2,172.27
1090216	16"	Cap MJ (standard)	7	\$ 312	\$ 2,184.0	\$ 229.5	\$ 1,606.5
1090220	20"	Cap MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 374.43	\$ 0.0
1090224	24"	Cap MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 514.25	\$ 0.0
1170060	6"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 191.68	\$ 0.0
1170086	8" x 6"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	20	\$ 270	\$ 5,400.0	\$ 198.9	\$ 3,978.0
1170080	8" x 8"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	1	\$ 284	\$ 284	\$ 209.1	\$ 209.1
1170120	12"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	22	\$ 797	\$ 17,534.0	\$ 586.93	\$ 12,912.46
1170124	12" x 4"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 328.1	\$ 0.0
1170126	12" x 6"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 323.43	\$ 0.0
1170128	12" x 8"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 371.45	\$ 0.0
1170206	16" x 6"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 702.1	\$ 0.0
1170208	16" x 8"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 812.18	\$ 0.0
1170212	16" x 12"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,115.2	\$ 0.0
1170216	16" x 16"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,622.23	\$ 0.0
1170228	20" x 8"	Cross MJ X MJ X MJ X MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,394.43	\$ 0.0
1415104	4"	Plug MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.35	\$ 0.0
1415106	6"	Plug MJ (standard)	2	\$ 67	\$ 134	\$ 49.3	\$ 98.6
1415108	8"	Plug MJ (standard)	15	\$ 99	\$ 1,485.0	\$ 72.68	\$ 1,090.2
1415112	12"	Plug MJ (standard)	13	\$ 170	\$ 2,210.0	\$ 235.2	\$ 3,057.6
1415116	16"	Plug MJ (standard)	17	\$ 447	\$ 7,599.0	\$ 328.95	\$ 5,592.15
1415120	20"	Plug MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 553.35	\$ 0.0

21-24 Ductile Iron Fittings Accessories
 Bid Opening: June 2, 2021

1415124	24"	Plug MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 767.55	\$ 0.0
1418104	4"	Plug TJ (standard)	6	\$ 44	\$ 264	\$ 33.15	\$198.90
1418106	6"	Plug TJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 53.55	\$ 0.0
1418108	8"	Plug TJ (standard)	2	\$ 90	\$ 180	\$ 72.25	\$ 144.5
1418112	12"	Plug TJ (standard)	2	\$ 186	\$ 372	\$ 128.5	\$ 257.0
1418116	16"	Plug TJ (standard)	2	\$ 251	\$ 502	\$ 1,279.25	\$ 2,558.5
1418120	20"	Plug TJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,051.03	\$ 0.0
1418124	24"	Plug TJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,478.15	\$ 0.0
1435043	4" x 3"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.45	\$ 0.0
1435064	6" x 4"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	2	\$ 73	\$ 146	\$ 53.55	\$ 107.1
1435084	8" x 4"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	2	\$ 99	\$ 198	\$ 72.68	\$ 145.36
1435086	8" x 6"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	25	\$ 105	\$ 2,625.0	\$ 77.78	\$ 1,944.5
1435124	12"x 4"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 149.6	\$ 0.0
1435126	12" x 6"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	5	\$ 179	\$ 895	\$ 131.33	\$656.65
1435128	12" x 8"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	3	\$ 182	\$ 546	\$ 133.88	\$ 401.64
1435129	12" x 10"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	4	\$ 202	\$ 808	\$ 148.75	\$ 595.0
1435142	14" x 12"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 233.75	\$ 0.0
1435166	16" x 6"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 340	\$ 0
1435168	16" x 8"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 326.4	\$ 0.0
1435170	16" x 14"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 385.05	\$ 0.0
1435208	20" x 8"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 590.75	\$ 0.0
1435212	20" x 12"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 519.35	\$ 0.0
1435246	24" x 16"	Reducers MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 824.5	\$ 0.0
1608040	4" x 4"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 138.4	\$ 0.0
1608064	6" x 4"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	2	\$ 167	\$ 334	\$ 122.4	\$ 244.8
1608066	6" x 6"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	2	\$ 179	\$ 358	\$ 131.75	\$ 263.5
1608080	8" x 8"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	20	\$ 268	\$ 5,360.0	\$ 197.2	\$ 3,944.0
1608084	8" x 4"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	2	\$ 194	\$ 388	\$ 142.38	\$ 284.76
1608086	8" x 6"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	10	\$ 222	\$ 2,220.0	\$ 163.2	\$ 1,632.0
1608120	12" x 12"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	15	\$ 534	\$ 8,010.0	\$ 392.7	\$ 5,890.5
1608124	12" x 4"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	5	\$ 362	\$ 1,810.0	\$ 266.48	\$ 1,332.4
1608126	12" x 6"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 266.48	\$ 0.0
1608128	12" x 8"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	7	\$ 417	\$ 2,919.0	\$ 306.43	\$ 2,145.01
1608160	16"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	7	\$ 1,216.0	\$ 8,512.0	\$ 896.33	\$ 6,274.31
1608166	16" x 6"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 546.98	\$ 0.0
1608168	16" x 8"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 594.15	\$ 0.0
1608169	16" x 12"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	9	\$ 965	\$ 8,685.0	\$ 710.18	\$ 6,391.62
1608162	20"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,233.35	\$ 0.0
1608206	20"x6"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 899.3	\$ 0.0
1608208	20" x 8"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 919.7	\$ 0.0
1608164	20" x 12"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,137.73	\$ 0.0
1608216	20" x 16"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,119.88	\$ 0.0
1608242	24" x 12"	Tee MJ x MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,272.45	\$ 0.0
1483004	4"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	10	\$ 68	\$ 680	\$ 49.73	\$497.30
1483006	6"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	130	\$ 113	\$ 14,690.0	\$ 83.3	\$ 10,829.0
1483008	8"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	200	\$ 182	\$ 36,400.0	\$ 83.3	\$ 16,660.0
1483012	12"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	140	\$ 293	\$ 41,020.0	\$ 215.48	\$30,167.20
1483016	16"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	20	\$ 558	\$ 11,160.0	\$ 411.83	\$ 8,236.6
1483020	20"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 655.78	\$ 0.0
1483024	24"	Solid Sleeves MJ x MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 863.18	\$ 0.0
1483030	30"	Solid Sleeve 32.00-32.00 (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,654.1	\$ 0.0
1607060	6" x 6"	Tee Hydt Valve Anchoring MJ (standard)	70	\$ 206	\$ 14,420.0	\$ 151.73	\$10,621.10
1607086	8" x 6"	Tee Hydt Valve Anchoring MJ (standard)	65	\$ 258	\$ 16,770.0	\$ 189.98	\$12,348.70
1607126	12" x 6"	Tee Hydt Valve Anchoring MJ (standard)	5	\$ 371	\$ 1,855.0	\$ 273.28	\$1,366.40
1607166	16" x 6"	Tee Hydt Valve Anchoring MJ (standard)	8	\$ 660	\$ 5,280.0	\$ 485.78	\$ 3,886.24
1607206	20" x 6"	Tee Hydt Valve Anchoring MJ (standard)	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 863.18	\$ 0.0
5000874	6 x 12	6 x 12 Fire Hydt offset swivel connection piece	90	\$ 336	\$ 30,240.0	\$ 475	\$ 42,750.0
N/A	4"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.1	\$ 0.0
N/A	6"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.1	\$ 0.0
N/A	8"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.53	\$ 0.0
N/A	10"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.65	\$ 0.0
N/A	12"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.5	\$ 0.0
N/A	16"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.45	\$ 0.0

21-24 Ductile Iron Fittings Accessories

Bid Opening: June 2, 2021

N/A	20"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17	\$ 0
N/A	24"	Mechanical Joint Gasket	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.25	\$ 0.0
N/A	3/4 x 4	T-Head Bolts	6000	\$ 4.5	\$ 27,000.0	\$ 1.84	\$ 11,040.0
N/A	3/4 x 4 1/2	T-Head Bolts	5000	\$ 6.5	\$ 32,500.0	\$ 2.05	\$ 10,250.0
N/A	3/4 x 5	T-Head Bolts	5000	\$ 7.5	\$ 37,500.0	\$ 2.24	\$ 11,200.00
N/A	3/4 x 5 1/2	T-Head Bolts	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.45	\$ 0.0
N/A	1 x 6	T-Head Bolts	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.49	\$ 0.0
4000316	16"	Acessory Packs (Nuts, bolts, Rubbers)	1000	\$ 57	\$ 57,000.0	\$ 41.65	\$ 41,650.0
4000320	20"	Acessory Packs (Nuts, bolts, Rubbers)	120	\$ 92	\$ 11,040.0	\$ 48.45	\$ 5,814.0
4000324	24"	Acessory Packs (Nuts, bolts, Rubbers)	60	\$ 110	\$ 6,600.0	\$ 57.8	\$ 3,468.0
4000330	30"	Acessory Packs (Nuts, bolts, Rubbers)	20	\$ 211	\$ 4,220.0	\$ 112.63	\$ 2,252.6
4000404	4"	MJ Ring	600	\$ 12	\$ 7,200.0	\$ 8.93	\$ 5,358.0
4000406	6"	MJ Ring	600	\$ 15	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 10.2	\$ 6,120.0
4000408	8"	MJ Ring	600	\$ 18	\$ 10,800.0	\$ 13.18	\$ 7,908.0
4000412	12"	MJ Ring	600	\$ 29	\$ 17,400.0	\$ 20.4	\$ 12,240.0
4000416	16"	MJ Ring	600	\$ 48	\$ 28,800.0	\$ 32.73	\$ 19,638.00
4000420	20"	MJ Ring	200	\$ 112	\$ 22,400.0	\$ 76.08	\$ 15,216.0
4000424	24"	MJ Ring	200	\$ 194	\$ 38,800.0	\$ 113.05	\$ 22,610.0
4000430	30"	MJ Ring	100	\$ 282	\$ 28,200.0	\$ 164.48	\$ 16,448.0
N/A	4"-12"	Fittings - 4" - 12"	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
N/A	14"-16"	Fittings - 14" - 16"	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
N/A	20" and lar	Fittings - 20" and Larger	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid