
LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

BID 21-12 / GROUNDS MAINTENANCE, LANDSCAPING AND SNOW REMOVAL 

Bid Opening Date: March 17, 2021

Inital Term: April 1, 2021 - March 31, 2022

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #1 - Location #1 BE Payne Treatment Plant - Mowing 44.00 7400 River Road Bi-weekly 18 $1,300.50 $23,409.00 $1,423.00 $25,614.00 $1,600.00 $28,800.00 $2,180.00 $39,240.00

2 Site #1 - Location #2 BEP Drainage Lot - Mowing 0.50 Mayfair Ave Bi-weekly 8 $42.50 $340.00 $75.00 $600.00 $50.00 $400.00 $95.00 $760.00

3 Site #1 - Location #3 BEP Lagoons & Field - bushhog 22.50 7400 Upper River Road Bi-Monthly 4 $874.50 $3,498.00 $1,600.00 $6,400.00 $972.81 $3,891.24 $1,912.50 $7,650.00

4 Site #1 - Location #4 BEP Mayfair RBI - Mowing 10.00 Transylvania Beach Road Bi-weekly 18 $246.00 $4,428.00 $269.00 $4,842.00 $301.00 $5,418.00 $280.00 $5,040.00

5 Site #1 - Location #5 Weeding - landscape beds N/A 7400 River Road Bi-weekly 18 $81.00 $1,458.00 $33.43 $601.74 $75.00 $1,350.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

6 Site #1 - Location #5 Trimming - Landscape bushes and trees N/A 7400 River Road Bi-Monthly 4 $400.00 $1,600.00 $120.00 $480.00 $100.00 $400.00 $485.00 $1,940.00

7 Site #1 - Location #5 Herbicide - whole site, spot treatments N/A 7400 River Road Monthly 8 $122.00 $976.00 $75.00 $600.00 $100.00 $800.00 $290.00 $2,320.00

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #2 - Location #1 Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Mowing 40.00 201 Stilz Ave Bi-Weekly 18 $1,435.50 $25,839.00 $1,526.00 $27,468.00 No Bid No Bid $3,800.00 $68,400.00

2 Site #2 - Location #2 Blackburn/Clairmont Lots - Mowing 1.00 Blackburn Ave/ Clairmont Ave Bi-weekly 18 $42.50 $765.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $990.00

3 Site #2 - Location #3 Weeding - landscape beds N/A 201 Stilz Ave Bi-weekly 18 $98.50 $1,773.00 $50.00 $900.00 No Bid No Bid $140.00 $2,520.00

4 Site #2 - Location #3 Trimming - Landscape bushes and trees N/A 201 Stilz Ave Bi-Monthly 4 $560.00 $2,240.00 $200.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid $400.00 $1,600.00

5 Site #2 - Location #3 Herbicide - whole site, spot treatments N/A 201 Stilz Ave Monthly 8 $105.50 $844.00 $75.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $290.00 $2,320.00

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #3 - Location #1 Zorn Median - Mowing 4.75 Zorn Ave Bi-Weekly 18 $159.00 $2,862.00 $275.00 $4,950.00 $198.00 $3,564.00 $580.00 $10,440.00

2 Site #3 - Location #2 Zorn Pump Station - Mowing 25.50 3005 River Rd Bi-Weekly 18 $582.50 $10,485.00 $541.00 $9,738.00 $550.00 $9,900.00 $1,630.00 $29,340.00

3 Site #3 - Location #3
Louisville Water Tower Park Museum Building - 

Mowing
1.91 3005 River Rd Weekly 35 $168.50 $5,897.50 $75.00 $2,625.00 $150.00 $5,250.00 $145.00 $5,075.00

4 Site #3 - Location #4 Weeding - landscape beds N/A 3005 River Rd Weekly 35 $10.00 $350.00 $20.00 $700.00 $10.00 $350.00 $90.00 $3,150.00

5 Site #3 - Location #4 Trimming - Landscape bushes and trees N/A 3005 River Rd Bi-Monthly 4 $45.00 $180.00 $238.00 $952.00 $30.00 $120.00 $480.00 $1,920.00

6 Site #3 - Location #4 Herbicide - whole site, spot treatments N/A 3005 River Rd Monthly 8 $48.50 $388.00 $75.00 $600.00 $100.00 $800.00 $190.00 $1,520.00

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #4 - Location #1 Allmond Distribution Center - mowing 2.00 4801 Allmond Avenue Bi-Weekly 18 $96.00 $1,728.00 $77.50 $1,395.00 $200.00 $3,600.00 $190.00 $3,420.00

2 Site #4 - Location #1 Allmond - Weeding - landscape beds N/A 4801 Allmond Avenue Bi-weekly 18 $41.00 $738.00 $20.00 $360.00 $10.00 $180.00 $180.00 $3,240.00

3 Site #4 - Location #1 Allmond - Trimming - Landscape bushes and trees N/A 4801 Allmond Avenue Bi-Monthly 4 $242.00 $968.00 $125.00 $500.00 $150.00 $600.00 $600.00 $2,400.00

4 Site #4 - Location #1 Allmond - Herbicide - whole site, spot treatments N/A 4801 Allmond Avenue Monthly 8 $58.50 $468.00 $60.00 $480.00 $30.00 $240.00 $320.00 $2,560.00

5 Site #4 - Location #2 John L. Huber Building - mowing 0.25 550 S. 3rd St Weekly 35 $50.00 $1,750.00 $65.00 $2,275.00 $150.00 $5,250.00 $150.00 $5,250.00

6 Site #4 - Location #2 John L Huber - Weeding - landscape beds N/A 550 S. 3rd St Weekly 35 $20.00 $700.00 $20.00 $700.00 $10.00 $350.00 $90.00 $3,150.00

7 Site #4 - Location #2 John L Huber - Trimming - Landscape bushes and trees N/A 550 S. 3rd St Bi-Monthly 4 $120.00 $480.00 $50.00 $200.00 $200.00 $800.00 $420.00 $1,680.00

8 Site #4 - Location #2 John L Huber - Herbicide - whole site, spot treatments N/A 550 S. 3rd St Monthly 8 $25.00 $200.00 $60.00 $480.00 $25.00 $200.00 $200.00 $1,600.00

9 Site #4 - Location #3 Aiken BPS - mowing 0.15 16911 Aiken Rd. Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $25.00 $450.00 $85.00 $1,530.00

10 Site #4 - Location #4 Apple Patch Tank - mowing 0.15 7206 Apple Patch Way Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $85.00 $1,530.00

11 Site #4 - Location #5 Bardstown Rd Standpipe - mowing 3.75 8612 Old Bardstown Rd Bi-weekly 18 $77.00 $1,386.00 $110.00 $1,980.00 $100.00 $1,800.00 $210.00 $3,780.00

12 Site #4 - Location #6 Billtown BPS - mowing 0.50 9701 Fairground Rd Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $85.00 $1,530.00

13 Site #4 - Location #7 Billtown Tank - mowing 5.50 5907 Billtown Rd Bi-weekly 18 $160.00 $2,880.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $55.00 $990.00 $225.00 $4,050.00

14 Site #4 - Location #8 Blankenbaker BPS - mowing 0.75 10850 Bluegrass Pkwy Bi-weekly 18 $52.00 $936.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $30.00 $540.00 $100.00 $1,800.00

15 Site #4 - Location #9 Blankenbaker Tank - mowing 1.25 2702 Electron Drive Bi-weekly 18 $65.00 $1,170.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $120.00 $2,160.00

16 Site #4 - Location #10 Brooks Hill BPS - mowing 0.10 1245 Brooks Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $38.00 $684.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $90.00 $1,620.00

17 Site #4 - Location #11 Brooks Hill Standpipe - mowing 0.25 409 Old Brooks Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $38.00 $684.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $110.00 $1,980.00

18 Site #4 - Location #12 Cane Run Road Lot - mowing 0.25 Opposite 4049 Strotman Rd Bi-weekly 18 $38.00 $684.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $90.00 $1,620.00

19 Site #4 - Location #13 Cardinal Hill Field - bushhog 7.50 7907 Cardinal Hill Rd Bi-Monthly 4 $502.00 $2,008.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $800.00 $3,200.00

20 Site #4 - Location #14 Cardinal Hill Reservoir - mowing 9.00 7907 Cardinal Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $205.00 $3,690.00 $325.00 $5,850.00 $700.00 $12,600.00 $480.00 $8,640.00

21 Site #4 - Location #15 Cedar Creek ECV - mowing 0.10 370 Cedar Creek Road Bi-Monthly 4 $33.50 $134.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $120.00 $480.00

22 Site #4 - Location #16 Cedar Grove BPS - mowing 0.25 1350 Cedar Grove Rd Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $90.00 $1,620.00

23 Site #4 - Location #17 Cedar Grove Standpipe I (West) & II (East) - mowing 1.00 230 Ohm Dr Bi-weekly 18 $36.50 $657.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $105.00 $1,890.00

24 Site #4 - Location #18 Chapeze Lane BPS - mowing 0.25 634 Chapeze Ln Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $42.00 $756.00 $120.00 $2,160.00

25 Site #4 - Location #19 Clear Run Ct Spoils Site - mowing 0.25 Clear Run Ct Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $42.00 $756.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

26 Site #4 - Location #20 Clermont Tank - mowing 0.50 389 Clermont Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $100.00 $1,800.00

27 Site #4 - Location #21 Conestoga Tank - mowing 0.50 190 Water Tank Road Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $55.00 $990.00 $125.00 $2,250.00

28 Site #4 - Location #22 Crestwood Tank - mowing 1.00 6428 W. Hwy 146 Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $40.00 $720.00 $130.00 $2,340.00

29 Site #4 - Location #23 Eastwood Fisherville ECV - mowing 0.10 912 Eastwood Fishersville Rd Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $25.00 $450.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

30 Site #4 - Location #24 English Station Standpipe - mowing 2.00 207 N. English Station Rd Bi-Weekly 18 $64.50 $1,161.00 $110.00 $1,980.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $210.00 $3,780.00

Mowing and Landscaping - Site #1: BE Payne Water Treatment Plant Area

Mowing and Landscaping - Site #2: Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant Area

Mowing and Landscaping - Site #3: Zorn Avenue Area

Mowing and Landscaping - Site #4: Allmond Avenue, John L. Huber Bldg., and all other surrounding areas

Greenway Landscape 

Services Inc.

Yes

Yes

$58,660.00

$75,830.00

$51,445.00

$35,709.00 $39,137.74 $41,059.24

Yes

Awardee: Integrated Service Inc. & Klausing Group

Buyer: Terri Young

Project Manager: Blaine Tivitt

Bid Estimate: $370,000

Bid Signed:

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum #1 & #2

Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Ward Brothers Mowing & 

Tree Service LLC

$0.00

$19,984.00

Klausing GroupBidders: Integrated Services Inc.

Total for Site #1:

Total for Site #3:

$31,461.00 $30,848.00

$20,162.50 $19,565.00

Total for Site #2:



LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

BID 21-12 / GROUNDS MAINTENANCE, LANDSCAPING AND SNOW REMOVAL 

Bid Opening Date: March 17, 2021

Inital Term: April 1, 2021 - March 31, 2022

31 Site #4 - Location #25 Fern Valley Temporary BPS (GE Plant) - mowing 0.10 6020 Fern Valley Rd Bi-Monthly 4 $33.50 $134.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $200.00 $800.00

32 Site #4 - Location #26 Finley Hill Pump Station - mowing 0.10 8112 Glimmer Way Bi-Monthly 4 $53.50 $214.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $200.00 $800.00

33 Site #4 - Location #27 Finley Hill Standpipe - mowing 0.15 8100 Glimmer Way Bi-Monthly 4 $56.00 $224.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $180.00 $720.00

34 Site #4 - Location #28 Forest Hill Detention Basin - bushhog 4.00 7603 Pimlico Dr Bi-Monthly 4 $240.00 $960.00 $260.00 $1,040.00 $260.00 $1,040.00 $385.00 $1,540.00

35 Site #4 - Location #29 Forest Hill Hydro - mowing 0.10 1485 Forest Hill Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

36 Site #4 - Location #30 Freys Hill BPS - mowing 1.00 3381 Frey's Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $40.00 $720.00 $110.00 $1,980.00

37 Site #4 - Location #31 Old 1793 PRV - mowing 1.50 Hwy 1793 and Hwy 3222 Bi-weekly 18 $37.50 $675.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $50.00 $900.00 $170.00 $3,060.00

38 Site #4 - Location #32 Hikes Point BPS - mowing 0.25 3836 Taylorsville Rd Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

39 Site #4 - Location #33 Holsclaw Hill BPS - mowing 0.25 11401 Holsclaw Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

40 Site #4 - Location #34 Hurstbourne PRV - mowing 0.25 9401 Shelbyville Rd. Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

41 Site #4 - Location #35 I-64 BPS - mowing 0.50 300 English Station Way Bi-weekly 18 $33.50 $603.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $50.00 $900.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

42 Site #4 - Location #36 I-64 Tank - mowing 1.75 1305 Clark Station Rd Bi-weekly 18 $50.50 $909.00 $85.00 $1,530.00 $50.00 $900.00 $170.00 $3,060.00

43 Site #4 - Location #37 Jefferson Memorial Tank - mowing 0.25 12304 Holsclaw Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

44 Site #4 - Location #38 Juniper Beach Lots - mowing 1.25 5614 Juniper Beach Road Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $50.00 $900.00 $150.00 $2,700.00

45 Site #4 - Location #39 Kenwood Hill BPS - mowing 0.25 500 Kenwood Dr Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

46 Site #4 - Location #40 Rollingwood BPS - mowing 0.25 5209 Rollingwood Rd Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $33.00 $594.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

47 Site #4 - Location #41 Kosmosdale Tank - mowing 2.50 7206 Shipley Lane Bi-weekly 18 $72.50 $1,305.00 $100.00 $1,800.00 $100.00 $1,800.00 $190.00 $3,420.00

48 Site #4 - Location #42 KT #3 BPS - mowing 0.25 6381 Cedar Gove Rd (Hwy 480) Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

49 Site #4 - Location #43 KY Hwy 245 BPS - mowing 0.25 2744 Clermont Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.50 $603.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $110.00 $1,980.00

50 Site #4 - Location #44 KY Hwy 245 Fill Station - mowing 0.15 465 Old Ky 245 West Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

51 Site #4 - Location #45 KY Hwy 44 Fill Station - mowing 0.15 12101 Stites Station Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

52 Site #4 - Location #46 Lonesome Hollow BPS - mowing 0.10 2317 Lonesome Hollow Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

53 Site #4 - Location #47 Martin Hill BPS - mowing 0.15 1053 Martin Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

54 Site #4 - Location #48 Martin Hill Tank - mowing 1.25 4454 Highway 44W Bi-weekly 18 $62.50 $1,125.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $68.00 $1,224.00 $200.00 $3,600.00

55 Site #4 - Location #49 Millers Ln BPS - mowing 0.50 3854 Cedar Grove Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

56 Site #4 - Location #50 Millers Ln Tank - mowing 1.75 282 Millers Lane Bi-weekly 18 $70.00 $1,260.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $55.00 $990.00 $200.00 $3,600.00

57 Site #4 - Location #51 Minor BPS - mowing 0.35 5545 Minors Ln Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $33.00 $594.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

58 Site #4 - Location #52 Mitchell Hill Hydro - mowing 0.25 11514 Mitchell Hill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $15.00 $270.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

59 Site #4 - Location #53 Mitchell Hill Standpipe - mowing 0.25 210 Rayhill Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

60 Site #4 - Location #54 North Nelson Master Meter - mowing 0.10 6234 Clermont Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $40.00 $720.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

61 Site #4 - Location #55 North Oldham Tank - mowing 0.50 12351 Hwy 42 Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $50.00 $900.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

62 Site #4 - Location #56 Oak Hill BPS - mowing 0.25 2504 Stephan Drive Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

63 Site #4 - Location #57 Oak Hill Standpipe - mowing 0.25 1513 Dawn Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $48.00 $864.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

64 Site #4 - Location #58 Oak Point Estates Hydro - mowing 0.10 496 Oak Point Dr Bi-Monthly 4 $33.00 $132.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $200.00 $800.00

65 Site #4 - Location #59 Oakwood Drive Hyrdo - mowing 0.10 125 Oakwood Dr. Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

66 Site #4 - Location #60 Old Henry Tank  - mowing 1.00 2599 Terra Crossings Blvd Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $50.00 $900.00 $100.00 $1,800.00

67 Site #4 - Location #61 Overlook Acres BPS - mowing 0.10 305 Overlook Acres Bi-Monthly 4 $33.00 $132.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $150.00 $600.00

68 Site #4 - Location #62 Parkridge Tank - mowing 0.50 1913 Grand Ridge Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $50.00 $900.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

69 Site #4 - Location #63 Peaceful Valley BPS - mowing 0.25 1158 Omega Pkwy Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $20.00 $360.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

70 Site #4 - Location #64 Peaceful Valley Standpipe - mowing 0.25 285 W Peaceful Ct. Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

71 Site #4 - Location #65 Possum Path Lot - mowing 0.50 across from 329 Coon Trail Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

72 Site #4 - Location #66 Rams Run BPS - mowing 0.10 356 Rams Run Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

73 Site #4 - Location #67 Reamers Tank - mowing 2.50 13401 Reamers Rd Bi-weekly 18 $77.00 $1,386.00 $80.00 $1,440.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $200.00 $3,600.00

74 Site #4 - Location #68 Riverside (aka Goshen Well) - mowing 0.10 1012 Riverside Dr, Prospect Bi-Monthly 4 $33.00 $132.00 $75.00 $300.00 $65.00 $260.00 $200.00 $800.00

75 Site #4 - Location #69 Smyrna Reservoir & BPS - mowing 3.00 7801 Smyrna Rd Bi-weekly 18 $95.00 $1,710.00 $95.00 $1,710.00 $150.00 $2,700.00 $315.00 $5,670.00

76 Site #4 - Location #70 South Park BPS - mowing 0.25 631 South Park Road Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $95.00 $1,710.00

77 Site #4 - Location #71 Standard Tank - mowing 0.75 Behind 2707 Colonel Dr Bi-Monthly 4 $38.00 $152.00 $75.00 $300.00 $50.00 $200.00 $200.00 $800.00

78 Site #4 - Location #72 Sugar Tree BPS - mowing 0.10 2957 Knob Creek Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $115.00 $2,070.00

79 Site #4 - Location #73 Sugar Tree Tank - mowing 0.15 6908 Knob Creek Road Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $115.00 $2,070.00

80 Site #4 - Location #74 Taylorsville Fill Station - mowing 0.25 14520 Old Taylorsville Rd Bi-weekly 18 $35.00 $630.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $43.00 $774.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

81 Site #4 - Location #75 Top Hill Lot - mowing 0.50 2106 Top Hill Road Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

82 Site #4 - Location #76 Trolley Line - mowing 2.00 See provided layouts Bi-Monthly 4 $85.00 $340.00 $125.00 $500.00 $200.00 $800.00 $320.00 $1,280.00

83 Site #4 - Location #77 Weavers Run BPS - mowing 0.10 2318 Weavers Run Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $35.00 $630.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

84 Site #4 - Location #78 Weavers Run Tank - mowing 0.50 4205 Weavers Run Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $45.00 $810.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

85 Site #4 - Location #79 Westport Tank & Transfer Station  - mowing 1.75 4610 Holzheimer Ln Pump Bi-weekly 18 $65.00 $1,170.00 $95.00 $1,710.00 $90.00 $1,620.00 $145.00 $2,610.00

86 Site #4 - Location #80 Windsor Forest Tank - mowing 0.25 Behind 8609 Lakeridge Dr. Bi-weekly 18 $36.00 $648.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $50.00 $900.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

87 Site #4 - Location #81 Zoneton PRV - mowing 0.10 4512 Zoneton Rd Bi-weekly 18 $33.00 $594.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $30.00 $540.00 $82.00 $1,476.00

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #1 - Location #1
John L Huber Building - Pretreat - apply salt or ice melt 

prior to a snow or ice event. No plowing
N/A N/A N/A 10 $360.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Site #1 - Location #1
John L Huber Building - Remove 1" - 3" of snow and 

apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 6 $675.00 $4,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Site #1 - Location #1
John L Huber Building - Remove 3" - 8" of snow and 

apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 4 $780.00 $3,120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Site #1 - Location #1
John L Huber Building - Remove 8" - 10+" of snow and 

apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 2 $885.00 $1,770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Site #1 - Location #1
John L Huber Building - Same day, second service due 

to continuing snow or ice with less than 2"
N/A N/A N/A 10 $675.00 $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Snow Removal Sites (Contingency Basis)

John L. Huber Building - Site #1 Location #1

$176,960.00

$0.00$19,290.00 $0.00Total for Site #1:

$65,810.00 $83,202.00

$0.00

$98,370.00Total for Site #4:



LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

BID 21-12 / GROUNDS MAINTENANCE, LANDSCAPING AND SNOW REMOVAL 

Bid Opening Date: March 17, 2021

Inital Term: April 1, 2021 - March 31, 2022

Item # Site # / Location # Location and/or Description
Approx. 

Acreage
Address Cycle Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Site #2 - Location #1
Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Pretreat - apply 

salt or ice melt prior to a snow or ice event. No plowing
N/A N/A N/A 10 $1,800.00 $18,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Site #2 - Location #1
Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Remove 1" - 3" 

of snow and apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 6 $2,450.00 $14,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Site #2 - Location #1
Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Remove 3" - 8" 

of snow and apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 4 $2,950.00 $11,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Site #2 - Location #1
Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Remove 8" - 10+" 

of snow and apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 2 $3,450.00 $6,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Site #2 - Location #1

Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant - Same day, 

second service due to continuing snow or ice with less 

than 2"

N/A N/A N/A 10 $2,450.00 $24,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Site #2 - Location #2

Zorn Ave. Pumping Station and/or Zorn Water Tower 

Park - Pretreat - apply salt or ice melt prior to a snow 

or ice event. No plowing

N/A N/A N/A 10 $900.00 $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Site #2 - Location #2
Zorn Ave. Pumping Station and/or Zorn Water Tower 

Park - Remove 1" - 3" of snow and apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 6 $1,200.00 $7,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Site #2 - Location #2
Zorn Ave. Pumping Station and/or Zorn Water Tower 

Park - Remove 3" - 8" of snow and apply salt/ice melter
N/A N/A N/A 4 $1,450.00 $5,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Site #2 - Location #2

Zorn Ave. Pumping Station and/or Zorn Water Tower 

Park - Remove 8" - 10+" of snow and apply salt/ice 

melter

N/A N/A N/A 2 $1,850.00 $3,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Site #2 - Location #2

Zorn Ave. Pumping Station and/or Zorn Water Tower 

Park - Same day, second service due to continuing 

snow or ice with less than 2"

N/A N/A N/A 10 $1,200.00 $12,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Combined Total for all Awarded Sites (Grounds Maintenance & Landscaping and Snow Removal): 

Planholders not submitting a bid: Billy Goats Hauling and Property Preservation, Class A Lawn & Landscape, Inc., Intertech General Contracting and Montgomery integrated Networking Co. LLC, 

Total for Snow Removal: $132,890.00

$101,519.00 $50,413.00

$0.00$0.00$113,600.00 $0.00Total for Site #2:

Snow Removal Sites (Contingency Basis)

Site #2 - Location #1: Crescent Hill Water Treatment Plant and Site #2 Location #2: Zorn Avenue Pumping Station and Zorn Water Tower Park Museum

Combined Total for Grounds Maintenance & Landscaping: $151,932.00

$284,822.00

Total for Grounds Maintenance & Landscaping Per Bidder:


