21-149/ Pipe Repair Sleeves
January 1, 2022 - December 31, 2022

Hayes Pipe Supply Mueller Co. LLC
Quantity
Items Required [|UnitPrice | TotalCost UnitPrice | TotalCost
1478402 - 2 inch 0 $103.06 $0.00 $ 68.47 $0.00
1478401 - 2 1/4 inch 0 $106.95 $0.00 $76.15 $0.00
1478403 - 3 inch 0 $115.59 $0.00 $82.62 $0.00
1478404 - 4 inch 15 $108.07 | $1,621.05 $90.14 $1,352.10
1478506 - 6 inch 450 $124.67 | $56,101.50 || $103.84 | $46,728.00
1478508 - 8 inch 150 $122.13 | $18,319.50 || $124.39 | $18,658.50
1478510 - 10 inch 2 $149.3 $298.60 $143.84 $287.68
1478512 - 12 inch 25 $168.8 $4,220.00 $194.33 $4,858.25
1478514 - 14 inch 0 $379.75 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1478516 - 16 inch 5 $377.63| $1,888.15 No Bid No Bid
1478520 - 20 inch 0 $760.28 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1478524 - 24 inch 0 $1,431.59 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1478604 - 4 inch 0 $114.64 $0.00 $97.02 $0.00
1478606 - 6 inch 8 S 124.67 $997.36 $108.53 $868.24
1478608 - 8 inch 0 S 147.69 $0.00 $127.1 $0.00
1478610 - 10 inch 0 $157.59 $0.00 $155.9 $0.00
1478612 - 12 inch 4 $176.45 $705.80 S 173 $692.00
1478614 - 14 inch 0 $387.14 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1110514 - 4 inch with 3/4 inch CC 0 $134.38 $0.00 $116.45 $0.00
1110504 - 4 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $134.38 $0.00 $120.33 $0.00
1110516 - 6 inch with 3/4 inch CC 25 $133.69 | $3,342.25 $134.03 $3,350.75
1110507 - 6 inch with 1 inch CC 5 $133.69 $668.45 $134.03 $670.15
1110506 - 6 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $162.45 $0.00 $ 146.96 $0.00
1110518 - 8 inch with 3/4 inch CC 15 $147.99 | $2,219.85 S 148.53 $2,227.95
1110509 - 8 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $147.99 $0.00 $154.57 $0.00
1110508 - 8 inch with 2 inch CC 2 $163.54 $327.08 $167.5 $335.00
1110510 - 10 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $184.89 $0.00 $177.04 $0.00
1110520 - 12 inch with 3/4 inch CC 3 S 194.67 $584.01 $224.52 $673.56
1110513 - 12 inch with 1 inch CC 0 S 194.67 $0.00 $224.52 $0.00
1110522 - 12 inch with 2 inch CC 2 $210.21 $420.42 $237.45 $474.90
Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet (13)
1110424 - 4 inch with 3/4 inch CC 2 $127.31 $254.62 $127.22 $254.44
1110404 - 4" with 1 inch CC 0 $127.31 $0.00 $127.22 $0.00
1110426 - 6 inch with 3/4 inch CC 2 $142.04 $284.08 $138.72 $277.44
1110406 - 6 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $142.04 $0.00 $138.72 $0.00
1110407 - 6 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $162.45 $0.00 $151.66 $0.00
1110428 - 8 inch with 32/4 inch CC 4 $150.24 $600.96 $157.29 $629.16
1110408 - 8 inch with 1 Inch CC 0 $150.24 $0.00 $157.29 $0.00
1110409 - 8 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $180.46 $0.00 $170.23 $0.00
1110410 - 10 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $213.88 $0.00 $196.02 $0.00
1110430 - 12 inch with 3/4 inch CC 1 $202.31 $202.31 $231.4 $231.40
1110412 - 12 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $202.31 $0.00 $231.4 $0.00
1110413 - 12 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $229.96 $0.00 $238.83 $0.00
1110414 - 14 inch with 1 inch CC 2 S 414.44 $828.88 No Bid No Bid
$93,884.87 $82,569.52




