
LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

21-94 / PIPE REPAIR SLEEVES

BID OPENED September 8, 2021

PM: ERIC MCGIVENEY

Category Description Est. Qty Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478402 - 2 inch 0 $ 103.06 $0.00 $ 61.32 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478401 - 2 1/4 inch 0 $ 106.95 $0.00 $ 68.19 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478403 - 3 inch 0 $ 115.59 $0.00 $ 73.99 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478404 - 4 inch 15 $ 108.065 $1,620.98 $ 80.72 $1,210.80

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478506 - 6 inch 450 $ 124.67 $56,101.50 $ 92.99 $41,845.50

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478508 - 8 inch 150 $ 122.13 $18,319.50 $ 111.39 $16,708.50

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478510 - 10 inch 2 $ 149.3 $298.60 $ 128.81 $257.62

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478512 - 12 inch 25 $ 168.8 $4,220.00 $ 174.03 $4,350.75

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478514 - 14 inch 0 $ 379.75 $0.00 No Bid $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478516 - 16 inch 5 $ 377.63 $1,888.15 No Bid $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478520 - 20 inch 0 $ 760.28 $0.00 No Bid $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves 1478524 - 24 inch 0 $ 1,431.59 $0.00 No Bid $0.00

$82,448.73 $64,373.17

Category Description Est. Qty Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478604 - 4 inch 0 $ 114.64 $0.00 $ 86.89 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478606 - 6 inch 8 $ 124.67 $997.36 $ 97.19 $777.52

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478608 - 8 inch 0 $ 147.69 $0.00 $ 113.82 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478610 - 10 inch 0 $ 157.59 $0.00 $ 139.61 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478612 - 12 inch 4 $ 176.45 $705.80 $ 154.93 $619.72

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe 1478614 - 14 inch 0 $ 387.14 $0.00 No Bid $0.00

$1,703.16 $1,397.24

Category Description Est. Qty Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110514 - 4 inch with 3/4 inch CC 0 $ 134.38 $0.00 $ 104.28 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110504 - 4 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 134.38 $0.00 $ 107.75 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110516 - 6 inch with 3/4 inch CC 25 $ 133.69 $3,342.25 $ 120.02 $3,000.50

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110507 - 6 inch with 1 inch CC 5 $ 133.69 $668.45 $ 120.02 $600.10

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110506 - 6 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $ 162.45 $0.00 $ 131.61 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110518 - 8 inch with 3/4 inch CC 15 $ 147.99 $2,219.85 $ 133.01 $1,995.15

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110509 - 8 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 147.99 $0.00 $ 138.42 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110508 - 8 inch with 2 inch CC 2 $ 163.54 $327.08 $ 111.38 $222.76

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110510 - 10 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 184.89 $0.00 $ 158.54 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110520 - 12 inch with 3/4 inch CC 3 $ 194.67 $584.01 $ 201.06 $603.18

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110513 - 12 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 194.67 $0.00 $ 201.06 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for Cast & Ductile  with Outlets 1110522 - 12 inch with 2 inch CC 2 $ 210.21 $420.42 $ 212.65 $425.30

$7,562.06 $6,846.99Total

Mueller Co. LLCHayes Pipe Supply

Total

Total
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Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110424 - 4 inch with 3/4 inch CC 2 $ 127.31 $254.62 $ 113.93 $227.86

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110404 - 4" with 1 inch CC 0 $ 127.31 $0.00 $ 113.93 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110426 - 6 inch with 3/4 inch CC 2 $ 142.04 $284.08 $ 124.23 $248.46

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110406 - 6 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 142.04 $0.00 $ 124.23 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110407 - 6 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $ 162.45 $0.00 $ 135.82 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110428 - 8 inch with 32/4 inch CC 4 $ 150.24 $600.96 $ 140.86 $563.44

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110408 - 8 inch with 1 Inch CC 0 $ 150.24 $0.00 $ 140.86 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110409 - 8 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $ 180.46 $0.00 $ 152.45 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110410 - 10 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $ 213.88 $0.00 $ 175.54 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110430 - 12 inch with 3/4 inch CC 1 $ 202.31 $202.31 $ 207.23 $207.23

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110412 - 12 inch with 1 inch CC 0 $ 202.31 $0.00 $ 207.23 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110413 - 12 inch with 2 inch CC 0 $ 229.96 $0.00 $ 213.88 $0.00

Stainless Steel Repair Sleeves for A.C. Pipe with Outlet 1110414 - 14 inch with 1 inch CC 2 $ 414.44 $828.88 No Bid $0.00

$2,170.85 $1,246.99

Total All $93,884.80 $73,864.39Subtract No Bids $91,167.77 $73,864.39

Total


