LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

Bid 22-29 / Major Engine Transmission Repairs - Under One Ton
Bid Opening Date: May 11, 2022

Initial Term: May 30, 2022 - May 29, 2023

Awardees: AAMCO Transmission and James Collin Ford
Buyer: Terri Young

Project Manager: Wayne Dunn
Bid Estimate: $150,000

Bidders: AAMCO Transmission James Collins Ford
Bid Signed: Yes Yes
Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum #1 & #2: Yes Yes
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(Avg) Hours Rate) Cost Rate) Cost
1 |Major Engine Repairs - Ford $83.56 400 $115.00 $46,000.00 $85.00 $34,000.00
2 |Major Engine Repairs - GM $83.56 75 $115.00 $8,625.00 No Bid $0.00
3 |Major Engine Repairs - Jeep $83.56 200 $115.00 $23,000.00 No Bid $0.00
4 |Major Engine Repairs - Toyota $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
5 |Major Engine Repairs - Dodge $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
6 |Transmission Repairs - Ford $83.56 160 $115.00 $18,400.00 $85.00 $13,600.00
7 |Transmission Repairs - GM $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
8 |Transmission Repairs - Jeep $83.56 120 $115.00 $13,800.00 No Bid $0.00
9 |[Transmission Repairs - Toyota $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
10 |Transmission Repairs - Dodge $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
11 [Miscellaneous Repairs - Ford $83.56 450 $115.00 $51,750.00 $85.00 $38,250.00
12 |Miscellaneous Repairs - GM $83.56 60 $115.00 $6,900.00 No Bid $0.00
13 |Miscellaneous Repairs - Jeep $83.56 250 $115.00 $28,750.00 No Bid $0.00
14 |Miscellaneous Repairs - Toyota $83.56 100 $115.00 $11,500.00 No Bid $0.00
15 |Miscellaneous Repairs - Dodge $83.56 50 $115.00 $5,750.00 No Bid $0.00
Percent Markup from Contractor Pricing for Parts/Supplies: 5% 11%
Percent Markdown from Manufacturer’s List Pricing for Parts/Supplies: 5% %
Total Cost: $243,225.00 $85,850.00

Planholders that did not bid: All-State Ford Trucks, Cambridge LTD, Cummins Inc., Ford Motor Company




