Awardees: AY McDonald, Core Main, and Hayes Pipe Supply

Buyer: Terri Young
Project Manager: Jennifer Swift
Bid Estimate: $1,037,970

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022
Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

Bidders: AY McDonald Core Main Ferguson Waterworks Hayes Pipe Supply Mueller Co. LLC
Bid Signed: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Master ltem Previous | ¢ yimated
# ltem M Model unit | Unit |53 PRET| Manufacturer / Model # Unit Cost |  Total Cost Manufacturer / Model # | Unit Cost | Total Cost | Manufacturer /Model # | Unit Cost | Total Cost | Manufacturer/Model# | UnitCost Total Cost | Manufacturer / Model # | Unit Cost Total Cost
Price
1" Spring Check Valve Mueller H14243N
" |FP xFip 1630001 Ford HS11-444NL Bach| 2457 4
AYM / 72054T 1" $26.05 $104.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $35.89 $143.56  |HS11-444NL $32.89 $131.56 |014243 330N $85.50 $342.00
5 |1-1/2" Spring Check Vaive 1630015 Mueller H14243N Eacn| 11738 | 100
FIP x FIP Ford HS11-666NL )
AYM / 72054T 1 1/2" $42.50 $4.250.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $172.10 | $17.210.00 |HS11-666-NL $157.08 $15.708.00 [014243 500N $233.18 $23,318.00
3 |2 Spring Check Valve 1630020 Mueller H14243N Each| 14838 »
FIP x FIP Ford HS11-777NL
AYM / 72054T 2" $60.72 $1.335.84 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $219.80 | $4.83560 |HS11-777-NL $198.53 $4.367.66 |014243 550N $303.94 $6.686.68
A.Y. McDonald 7 02-3HT 43
4 [3/4" Valve Check Angle 2640107 Ford HA34-323GNL Each| 27.74 | 1000
Cambridge Brass 590NL-T3F3 AYM / 702-3HT 43 $33.15 $33,150.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $48.10 | $48100.00 |HA34-323-G-NL $43.50 $43,500.00 014269 215N $68.94 $68,940.00
5 [1" Valve Check Angle 2640110 Ford HA34-444N Each| 31.98 85
AYM/ 702-4HT 54 $38.22 $3.248.70 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $52.10 $4.428.50 |HA34-444-NL $46.50 $3.952.50 |014269 330N $74.30 $6.315.50
6 |3 alve Plometer 2640125 Ford B11-455N Each| 7465 2
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $118.90 $237.80 |B11-455-NL $106.13 $212.26 |020200 420N $193.20 $386.40
2 Angle Ball Val Mueller B24286N
7 e tane T 2640220 Ford BFA13-777NL Each| 181.72 42
9 AY.MCDONALD 746048 AYM / 746048 2 $217.16 $9.120.72 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $309.10 | $12982.20 |BFA13-777-NL $274.20 $11.516.40 |024286 550N $377.77 $15.866.34
Angle Meter Valve Ford KV 23-332
8 [ond 2530000 AY.MCDONALD 4602 Each| 2652 2
5/8 Flare x 3/4 Mtr Coupling )
Mueller H14255 AYM / 74602 3/4 $32.22 $64.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid FORD $45.10 $90.20 KV23-332W-NL $39.23 $78.46 |014255 215N $50.80 $101.60
g [Angle Meter Valve OS 2570115 Ford KV 23-332W-05 Each| 27.59 2
5/8 Copper x 3/4 Mtr Coupling ’ ! i
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $45.10 $9020  |KV23-332W-OS-NL $47.50 $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Mueller H14258N
10 |3/4" Angle Meter Valve 2531006 Ford KV43-332GSMBNL | Each| 2537 | 9200
Compression x Meter )
A.Y. McDonald7 4602ST AYM / 74602ST 3/4 $30.32 $278,944.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $33.29 | $306.268.00 |KV43-332W-SN-G-NL $40.75 $374,900.00 |014258 215N $54.16 $498,272.00
Angle Meter Valve Ford KV23-342WMSBN
11314 Copper x1 Meter 2670315 A.Y.McDonald 74602 Bach| 2842 5 ) )
AYM/ 74602 1X3/4 $34.53 $172.65 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $47.99 KV23-342W-SN-NL $42.69 $213.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Angle Meter Valve Mueller H14256
12 'gle™ 2531010 Ford KV43-444GMSB Each| 36.92 470
Compression x Meter )
AY McDonald 746021 AYM/ 74602T 1 $44.12 $20.736.40 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $45.89 §21,568.30 | KV43-444W-SN-G-NL $55.99 $26.315.30 |014258 330N §74.18 $34,864.60
1" Stop Tee Head Female Ford B11-444 W/HB-34N
"3 {1 & Out with handle 2560010 AYMcDonald 76101H Bach| 5975 42
AYM/ 76101WHDLB 1 $71.40 $2.998.80 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $96.10 $4.036.20 |B11-444-HB-34-NL $88.71 $3.725.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid
" Mueller H20283N
14 ;ul/i F‘?g” Valve 2530014 Ford B11-666NL Each| 112.21 74
AYMcDonald 76101 AYM/ 76101 1 1/2 $134.09 $9,922.66 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $196.80 | $14,563.20 |B11-666-NL $168.61 $12.477.14 |020283 500N $232.18 $17,181.32
2 Ball Vat Mueller H20283N
15 (Ep kb 2530020 Ford B11-777NL Each| 158.72 | 425
AYMcDonald 76101 AYM /761012 $189.67 $80.609.75 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $278.10 | $118.192.50 |B11-777-NL $246.60 $104.805.00 |020283 550N $339.76 $144,398.00
16 i{i:esé‘;‘:ﬁ:c’gog“k Copper 2120005 Ford F600-2NL Each| 19.97 2
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $35.10 $70.20  |F600-2-NL $28.40 $56.80 |015000 200N $66.75 $133.50
. Mueller H15000N
17 |3/4" Stop Corp Cock Copper 2120006 Ford F600-3NL Each| 2080 | 4670
Flare Connection
AYMcDonald 74701 AYM / 74701 3/4 $24.86 $116.096.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $34.40 | $160,648.00 |F600-3-NL $31.25 $145.937.50 015000 250N $42.48 $198,381.60
. Mueller H15000N
1g |1 Stop Corp Cock Copper 2120010 Ford F600-4NL Each| 31.50 238
Flare Connection )
AYMcDonald 74701 AYM /74701 1 $37.64 $8,958.32 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $54.10 $12,875.80 |F600-4-NL $47.80 $11.376.40 |015000 330N $64.84 $15,431.92
19 |1:1/2 Ball Corp Stop 2120014 Ford-FBB00-6NL Each| 88.70 2
AWWA x Increased MIP
AYM/73121B 1 172 $107.77 $215.54 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $149.80 $299.60 |FB800-6-NL $134.70 $269.40 |020003 500N $179.71 $359.42
20 f;,m‘ Acfzgcsr;‘;e AMP 2120020 Ford-FB800-7NL Each| 147.83 | 250
AYM /731218 2 $176.66 $44,165.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $253.10 | $63.275.00 |FB80O-7-NL $220.25 $57.312.50 [020003 550N $331.34 $82,835.00
21 |3/4" Stop Corp Cock 2120206 Mueller H15025N Each| 2208 4
MIP x Increased MIP Ford FBI00-3NL
AYM/ 73122 3/4 $24.19 $96.76 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $53.10 $212.40 _|FB900-3-NL $49.21 $196.84 |009979 250N $39.50 $158.00
1" Stop Corp Cock Mueller H15025N
22 | MIP x Increased MIP 2120210 Ford FB900-4NL Each| 35.08 2 .
AYM /73122 1 $36.55 $73.10 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $67.10 $134.20 |FBY00-4-NL $62.28 $124.56 |009979 330N $65.11 $130.22
23 alsi”lfgfaf;"m', 2120220 Ford FB900-7NL Each| 152.89 2
AYM/73122B 2 $185.76 $371.52 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $253.10 $506.20 |FB900-7-NL $234.47 $468.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022
Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

1" Corp Cock Stop Mueller H9992N
24 | AWWA x Increased MIP Pitometer | 2120510 Ford F800-4NL Bach| 2975 4 )
AYM /731211 $36.15 $144.60 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $49.89 $199.56|F800-4-NL $4564 $182.56 |009992 N $73.85 $295.40
Corp Cook S Mueller H15000N
25 | 2P HOcK S1oP 2121115 Ford F600-23NL Each| 2150 10
5/8 AWWA x 3/4 Flare
AYMcDonald 74701 AYM /74701 5/8X3/4 $32.27 $322.70 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $34.10 $341.00  |F600-23-NL $30.60 $306.00 |015000 203N $47.96 $479.60
2 ’;I‘fgl‘:r'eﬁ;a;j - 2011105 Ford C21-23NL Each| 888 2
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $19.00 $38.00 _|C21-23-NL $12.63 $25.26 |015450 203N $31.90 $63.80
Adapter B Mueller H15451N
27 |5/ Compression x /4 FIP 2011206 Ford C14-33-GNL Each| 10.86 360
P AYMcDonald 74754 AYM / 74754T 3/4 $12.98 $4.672.80 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $19.99 $7.196.40 |C14-33-G-NL $16.20 $5.832.00 015451 250N $22.35 $8,046.00
Adapter Brass Mueller H15451N
2 (] C:mmess‘o" C1FIP 2011210 Ford C14-44-GNL Each| 14.89 12
AYMcDonald 74754T AYM/ 74754T 1 $18.09 $217.08 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $26.89 $322.68 [C14-44-G-NL $22 $264 015451 330N $31.96 $383.52
29 |Adapter Brass 2011304 Ford C28-21NL Each| 898 2
5/8 Flare x 1/2 MIP (10) ’ !
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $16.10 $3220  |cos-21-NL $12.77 $25.54 |015425 201N $25.75 $51.50
Adapter Brass Ford C28-23NL
30 518 Fiare x 374 MIP 2011305 | (- bridge Brass 117NL-cam3 | Each| 898 4 . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $16.10 $64.40 _|C28-23-NL $12.77 $51.08 |015425 203N $17.75 $71.00
31 :‘d;";z f’ﬁﬁ;w 2011310 Ford C28-44NL Each| 1325 75
AYM /74753 1 $15.83 $1.187.25 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $23.40 $1.755.00 |C28-44-NL $19.99 $1.499.25 |015425 330N $26.47 $1.985.25
Adapter Brass Mueller H15428N
32 250 a 2011406 Ford C84-33-GNL Each| 1043 | 1870
3/4 Compression x 3/4 MIP )
AYMcDonald7 4753T AYM/ 74753T 3/4 $12.46 $23,300.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $18.10 $33,847.00 |C84-33-G-NL $15.40 $28.798.00 |015428 250N $20.86 $39,008.20
Adapter B Mueller H15428N
33 | o resaon x 1 MIP 2011410 Ford C84-44-GNL Each| 1237 104
P AYMcDonald 747537 AYM / 74753T 1 $14.78 $1.537.12 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $21.48 $223392 |C84-44-G-NL $18.25 $1.898.00 015428 330N $24.64 $2,562.56
34 |3/4" Adapter OS 1/8 Bend 2015006 :Y";;’cﬁlg‘rfg%'} Each| 14.10 60
AYM /747497 3/4 $16.85 $1,011.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $23.90 $1,434.00 [LA104-33-G-NL $20.80 $1.248.00 |015487 250N $46.63 $2,797.80
35 |1" Adapter OS 1/8 Bend 2015010 Ford LA104-44-GNL Each| 23.91 14
AYM / 74749T 1 $29.05 $406.70 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $39.50 $553.00 |LA104-44-G-NL $35.30 $494.20 |015487 330N $67.30 $942.20
36 ’;‘f:g;%i;"g Bend 2015015 Ford LA104-23-GNL Each| 14.59 34
AYM [ 74749T 5/8X3/4 $17.44 $592.96 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $24.90 $846.60 _|LA104-23-G-NL $21.95 $746.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 ‘5\;3:';;%50;‘“ Bend 2015020 Ford L104-23-GNL Each| 16.28 42
P AYM/ 74777T 5/8X3/4 $19.45 $816.90 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $27.90 $1.171.80 [1104-23-G-NL $24.55 $1.031.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adapter NS 1/8 Bend Ford LA04-33-GNL
38 {314 Fiare x 3/4 Comp 2015066 AYMcDonald 74750T Bach| 1356 | 1300 !
AYM / 74750T 3/4 $16.20 $21,060.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $24.10 | $31.330.00 [LA04-33-G-NL $20.25 $26,325.00 [015075 250N $60.94 $79,222.00
Adapter NS 1/4 Bend Ford L04-33-GNL
39 |3/4 Flare x 3/4 Compression 2015076 AYMcDonald 74776T Bach| 1499 | 3615
AYM 74776T 3/4 $17.91 $64.744.65 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $2575 | $93.086.25 [L04-33-G-NL $22.50 $81.662.85 [015067 250N $44.97 $162.566.55
Adapter NS 1/8 Bend Ford LA04-44-GNL
40 | Flare x 1 Compression 2015080 AYMcDonald 74750T Each| 2174 80 §
AYM/ 74750T 1 $25.98 $2,078.40 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $37.10 $2,968.00 [LA04-44-G-NL $32.80 $2,624.00 |015075 330N $71.05 $5,684.00
Adapter NS 1/4 Bend Ford L04-44-G
41 |1 Fiare x 1" Compression 2015090 AYMcDonald 4776T Bach| 2273 | 175 )
AYM / 74776T 1 $27.16 $4.753.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $37.70 $6.597.50 _[L04-44-G-NL $34.28 $5.999.00 |015076 330N $63.76 $11.158.00
Adapter wiRibbed Insert Mueller H12213N
42 | 314 MiP x 3/4 PE 2016106 Ford PTMINL Bach| 7.03 52 ) )
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $10.99 $571.48 |PTM-1-NL $9.67 $502.84 |012213 250N $41.91 $2,179.32
Adapter w/Ribbed Insert Mueller H12213N
43 | et PE 2016110 Ford PTMNL Each| 11.51 12
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $18.25 $219.00 |PTM-2-NL $15.50 $186.00 |012213 330N $44.44 $533.28
Adapter Meter Ford A23NL
44 1518 x 3/4 to 314 length 2340008 AYMcDonald 710J23 Bach| 7.28 8 ) )
AYM /71023 3$8.85 $70.80 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $12.70 $101.60 _|A23-NL $10.65 $85.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 a’/‘fr;‘vg’gtz 35“ Branch Piece 2050007 Ford UV43-32W-65-GNL  |Each| 8050 | 2050
P No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $117.60 | $241.080.00 |UV43-32W-65-G-NL $107.76 $220.908.00 01536303 323N $160.36 $328.738.00
46 fffr;‘vg'g(:;sﬁ'amh Piece 2050006 Ford UV43-42W-65-GNL | Each| 76.63 34
AYM/ 709UTAW 1X3/4X6.5 | $91.57 $3.113.38 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $125.10 | $4.25340 |UV43-42W-65-G-NL $110.94 $3.771.96 |01536303 402N $169.25 $5.754.50
47 | Xt Branch picce 2050010 Mueller 681363 Each| 18.18 | 14
P No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|UV43-44W-14-AWT-G-NL $218.42 $3.057.88 |01536322 488N $211.47 $2.960.58
. 34 Ford ST-2NL
48 [5/8" x 3/4" S-Tubes 2510100 AY Mebonald 7461683 Each| 2812 | 1144 ! !
AYM/ 46195 5/8X3/4X4.50 | _$33.60 $38.438.40 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $49.99 | §57.188.56 |ST-2 $45.37 $51.903.28 NoBid No Bid No Bid
49 |1" S-Tubes 2510101 Ford ST-4NL Each| 51.16 85
AY McDonald 7461953
AYM /46195 1X5.50 $61.14 $5.196.90 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $89.99 §7.649.15 [ST-4 $82.20 $6.987.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 |2" Ell Flanged 2" FIP Outlet 2330020 Ford LF31-77NL Each| 44.11 34
AY McDonald 74783FF :
AYM / 74783FF 2 9565 $3.252.10 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $134.10 | $4,55040 |LF31-77-NL $120.74 $4.105.16 |014204 550N $314.67 $10,698.78
51 |1-1/2" Meter Flange MIP 2330514 A\F/USEEZ?‘:S%%LM Each| 31.95 92
AYM/7610M 1 1/2 $38.18 $3.512.56 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $57.10 $5.253.20 |CF38-66-2-NL $48.19 $4.433.48 |010129 M 500N $67.47 $6.207.24
52 |2" Meter Flange MIP 2330500 F:y,\'igiﬂf;gg’,\“n" Each| 42.60 14
AYM/ 7610M 2X2 $50.91 $712.74 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $69.99 $979.86  |CF38-77-2-NL $64.29 $900.06 |010129 M 550N $89.99 $1.250.86




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022
Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

Ford CF31-66NL
53 |1-1/2" Meter Flange FIP 2330614 | Cambridge Brass 803450205MNL | Each| 30.17 12
AYMcDonald 7610F AYM/ 7610F 1172 $36.05 $1.514.10 Brecco 200-225-00800 $9.98 $419.16 _|FORD $49.99 | $200058 |CF31-66-NL $44.60 $1.873.20 [010120 500N $62.46 $2,623.32
Ford CF31-77NL
54 |2" Meter Flange FIP 2330600 | Cambridge Brass 50390MNL | Each| 39.39 36
AYMcDonald 7610F AYM / 7610F 2 $47.07 $1.694.52 Brecco 200-225-00810 $10.77 $387.72__|FORD $65.89 $2,372.04 | CF31-77-NL $58.24 $2.096.64 [010129 550N $81.53 $2,935.08
55 |1-1/2" Union Brass GJ 2621014 Lee Each| 21.50 62
No Bid No Bid NoBid Brecco 400-100-01261 $29.48 $1.827.76 NoBid No Bid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $79.15 $4.907.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 |2" Union Brass GJ 2621020 Lee Each| 33.50 12
No Bid No Bid No Bid Brecco 400-100-01262 $45.04 $540.48 NoBid NoBid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $106.84 $1.282.08 NoBid NoBid No Bid
57 |Bushing Brass 2070508 Mueller H10888N Each| 2.33 4485
5/8" x 3/4" Meter Ford A12SNL )
AYM/10J12 $2.78 $12.468.30 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $6.99 $31,350.15_|A12S-NL $5.55 $24,891.75 [010888 203N $27.47 $123,202.95
58 g,'fm‘gf;?;ilp 2070604 Ford C18-13NL Each| 159 60
AYM / 722063/4x1/2 $2.16 $129.60 Brecco 400-100-12220 $2.68 $160.80 _|MERIT $2.99 $179.40 _|PRE-APPROVED $2.49 $149.40 NoBid NoBid No Bid
59 ?‘ﬁn,‘”f;f;;, 2071006 Ford C18-34NL Each| 240 122
AYM  722061x3/4 $3.17 $386.74 Brecco 400-100-01224 $3.99 $486.78 _|MERIT $5.92 §722.24 _|PRE-APPROVED $3.78 $461.16 |47165 $18.61 $2,270.42
60 ?'gg";%a"fg CC Tapered 2071106 “F";Z";’Enojgz't Each| 9.12 45
AYM /747011 1X3/4 $11.08 $498.60 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $15.99 §719.55 |BBAA4S-NL $14.12 $635.40 |010036 333N $49.52 $2,228.40
61 ?}‘m‘mfﬁ; P 2071206 Ford C18-35NL Each| 4.08 52
AYM / 722061 1/4x3/4 $6.92 $350.84 Brecco 400-100-01226 $6.80 $353.60 |MERIT $8.89 $462.28 _|PRE-APPROVED $6.43 $334.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 E’_‘ﬁ:‘mffﬁlp 2071210 Ford C18-45NL Each| 4.08 114
AYM/ 722061 1/4x1 $7.01 $799.14 Brecco 400-100-01227 $6.80 $775.20 _|MERIT $8.58 $978.12 _|PRE-APPROVED $6.43 $733.02 [47162 $37.25 $4.246.50
63 [JusrnoBrase o 2071406 Ford C18-36NL Each| 637 2
AYM 722061 1/2x3/4 §7.94 $190.56 Brecco 400-100-01231 $10.63 $255.12 _|MERIT $13.39 $321.36 | PRE-APPROVED $10.04 $240.96 |47168 $26.69 $640.56
64 E’_‘ﬁg‘;‘ﬁffﬁlp 2071410 Ford CLL?BNL Each| 5.21 2
AYM /722061 1/2x1 $8.10 $16.20 Brecco 400-100-01235 $14.64 $2028  |MERIT $10.95 $21.90 |PRE-APPROVED $8.21 $16.42 [47169 $26.69 $53.38
65 |Sushing Brase, 2072006 Ford C18-57NL Each| 930 2%
AYM / 722062x3/4 $11.57 $277.68 Brecco 400-100-01235 $14.64 $351.36|MERIT $2.75 $66.00 | PRE-APPROVED $14.66 $351.84 |47163 $51.31 $1.231.44
66 [Busting Bress 2072010 Ford CLL‘;NNL Each| 930 2
AYM / 722062x1 $14.46 $28.92 Brecco 400-100-01236 $14.64 $29.28 |MERIT $19.54 $39.08 |PRE-APPROVED $14.66 $29.32 47164 $39.04 $78.08
67 ?‘ﬁl"‘,‘”f fﬁ;ﬁ:lp 2072014 Ford CLLBE'MN" Each| 7.71 40
AYM / 722062x1 1/2 $12.01 $480.40 Brecco 400-100-01238 $12.88 $515.20 _|MERIT $16.87 $674.80 | PRE-APPROVED $12.17 $486.80 | 546043E $23.36 $934.40
- Mueller H10896N
65 | Coupling Straight Meter 2151106 Ford C36-23-2.5NL Each| 670 6
3/4 Meter x 2.5 Length !
AY McDonald 74620 AYM / 74620 3/4X3/4X2.50 $8.14 $48.84 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $11.99 $71.94  [C38-23-25-NL $10.02 $60.12 |010896 215N $12.66 $75.96
69 ?‘;}’:J'e':iz"saz‘ghg‘:‘g’m 2151110 Ford 38-44-2.625NL Each| 1043 4
) AYM /74620 1X1X2.63 $12.67 $50.68 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $17.99 $71.96  |C38-44-2.625-NL $15.42 $61.68 |010896 330N $19.37 §77.48
- Mueller H15403N
70 |Souplng Copper Tube Straight | 155006 Ford C44-33-GNL Each| 1258 | 2714
P AY McDonald 74758T AYM / 74758T 3/4 $15.03 $40.791.42 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $21.49 $58,323.86 |C44-33-G-NL $18.78 $50.968.92 |015403 250N $25.45 $69.071.30
) ) Mueller H15403
71 |Coupling Copper Tube Straight | 5155010 Ford C44-44-G Each| 1453 | 214
1" Compression :
AY McDonald 4758T AYM/ 74758T 1 $17.36 $3.715.04 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $24.75 $5,296.50 | C44-44-G-NL $21.48 $4.596.72 [015403 330N $27.77 $5,942.78
FOrG Caa-25-GNL
72 GapinaCamer e ST | prgsr | G S WNIOR2 || 1528 | 1
P i AV Marctn 7azEOT No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $2469 | $28516.95 [C44-23-GNL $21.77 $25.144.35 [015403 203N $36.23 $41,845.65
) ) Mueller H15403N
73 ?‘é’(fr‘r"';gxcs‘;:‘;z%“be Straight | 5155016 Ford C44-34-GNL Each| 1476 | 162
AY McDonald 74758T AYM / 74758T 3/4X1 $17.64 $2,857.68 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $24.99 $4,048.38 | C44-34-G-NL $21.82 $3.534.84 015403 333N $28.07 $4,547.34
Coupling Copper Tube Straight Ford C44-13-GNL
74 1472 Comp x 3i4 Compression 2155013 AY McDonald 74758-22 Bach| 1381 1 )
AYM / 74758-22 112X3/4 $17.01 $306.18 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $21.78 $392.04 _|C44-13-G-NL $19.35 $348.30 |015403 163N $34.84 $627.12
Coupling Ford C47-33-GNL
75 1374 Copper x 3/4 PVC 2155106 AY McDonald 74758T-44 Each| 1619 140 .
AYM  74758T-44 3/4 $20.52 $2.872.80 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $28.99 $4,058.60 _[C47-33-G-NL $25.40 $3,556.00 |E15409 250N $39.15 $5.481.00
Coupling Ford C47-34-GNL
76 |314 Copper x 1 PVC 2155107 AY McDonald 74758T-44 | E8CN | 2404 102 )
AYM / 74758T-44 3/4X1 $28.73 $2.930.46 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $40.56 $4.137.12_[C47-34-G-NL $35.55 $3.626.10 |E15409 254N $62.28 $6.352.56
77 iﬁ‘;g‘g‘gpper K112 PVC 2154115 | AY McDonald 74758T-44 11/2" | Each| 66.93 16
AYM / 74758T-44 1 1/2. §79.98 $1.279.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | C47-66-G-NL $98.95 $1,583.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coupling Ford C47-77-GNL
78 |2 Copper x2 PVC 2154120 AY McDonald 74758744 | E8N| 7813 14 ) _
AYM / 74758T-44 2 $93.37 $1.307.18 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $12080 | $1817.20 |c47-77-G-NL $115.53 $1617.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 10‘3’(5’;1;‘3 <1PVC 2154210 | AY McDonald 74758T-3G 1" |Each| 23.15 6
AYM/ 74758T-44 1 $29.70 $178.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|C47-44-G-NL $36.71 $220.26 |E15409 330N $43.01 $258.06
Coupi Mueller H15428N
80 |ouPIN 2155814 Ford C84-66-GNL Each| 33.19 194
1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 MIP '
AY McDonald 747537 AYM / 74753T 1 1/2 $39.66 $7.694.04 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $57.10 $11,077.40 | C84-66-G-NL $50.05 $9.709.70 015428 500N $68.15 $13.221.10
Coupling Compression Mueller H15426N
81 | ouPing Compi 2156820 Ford C84-77-GNL Each| 48.13 454
2 Compress x 2 MIP :
AY McDonald 74753T AYM/ 74753T 2 $57.52 $26.114.08 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $80.54 | $36.565.16 |C84-77-G-NL §72.93 $33,110.22 015428 550N $99.30 $45,082.20




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022

Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

Coupling Compression

Ford C45-77-GNL

82 |2 Copper x2 IPS 2154420 AY McDonald 74758T-55 Each| 68.36 2 .
AYM/ 74758T-55 2 $83.06 $166.12 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $113.10 $226.20 _|C45-77-G-NL $101.12 $202.24 |V15445 550N $220.28 $440.56
Coupling G ] Mueller H15403N
83 | pvoxaape 2155407 Ford C77-33-GNL Each| 13.77 8
AY McDonald 74758-44 AYM / 74758-44 3/4. $22.54 $180.32 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|FORD $33.10 $264.80 |C77-33-G-NL $27.47 $219.76 [015403 250N $25.45 $203.60
84 10‘:‘;5‘:;‘35 :’;“z’f;fgg 2155414 Ford C47-66-GNL Each| 61.49 2
AYM / 74758-44 1 1/2. $74.71 $149.42 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $110.10 $220.20 _|C77-66-G-NL $90.94 $181.88 |P15403 500N $97.89 $195.78
Coupling Compression Mueller H15403N
85 | 7ouping Comp! 2156714 Ford C44-66-GNL Each| 47.67 56
1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 Copper AY MeDoneld 74758T
AYM [ 74758T 1 1/2 $56.97 $3.190.32 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $79.99 | $4479.44 |C44-66-NL §71.95 $4,029.20 |015403 500N $97.89 $5.481.84
UGTer FIT54USN
Coupling Compression Ford C44-77-GNL
86 |3 Copper x 2 Copper 2155720 | Gambridge Brass 119NL-H7H7 | E2°0| 6438 144 §
AV Mioraoid 747c0 20 AYM / 74758T 2 §76.93 $11.077.92 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $109.72 | $15.799.68 |C44-77-G-NL $97.12 $13.985.28 [015403 550N $132.21 $19,038.24
Taener FIT5A5TN
Coupling Compression Ford C14-66-GNL
87 11172 Copper x 1-112 FIP 2155830 Cambridge 117NL-BXBX Each| 4331 16 §
AV Mot 74754 20 AYM [ 74754T 1 1/2 $51.76 $828.16 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $71.88 | $1150.08 |C14-66-G-NL $64.04 $1,024.64 |015451 500N $87.14 $1.394.24
Coupling G ] Mueller H15451N
L PosatAvditionnd 2155835 Ford C14-77-GNL Each| 51.56 8
PP AY McDonald7 47547 AYM / 74754T 2 $61.61 $492.88 No Bid No Bid NoBid __|FORD $84.10 $672.80 |C14-77-G-NL $76.27 $610.16 [015451 550N $103.85 $830.80
Coupling Lead Pac OS Ford Q32-23GNL
89 | Sig x 374 2362169 AY McDonald7 4758C-68 Each| 19.33 6 . .
AYM / 74758C-68 3/4X5/8 $23.49 $140.94 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $39.99 $230.94 |Q32-23-NL $28.92 $173.52 NoBid NoBid No Bid
Coupling Lead Pac Ford Q22-33GNL
0 {37 x 314 2362171 AY McDonald 747s8C-67 | N | 2284 4
AYM [ 74758C-67 3/4 $27.75 $111.00 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $44.99 $179.96  |Q22-33-NL $34.16 $136.64 NoBid NoBid No Bid
Coupling Lead Pac Ford Q22-23GNL
9 |58 x 374 2362170 AY McDonald 74758C-67 Each| 18.09 4 . .
AYM / 74758C-67 3/4X5/8 $21.98 $87.92 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $34.99 $139.96 |Q22-23-NL $27.03 $108.12 NoBid NoBid No Bid
92 |5/8" Pressure Regulator Adaptor | 2430005 A ’\:2'[‘)’0':3;”756 1o Each| 638 6
AYM / 74619 5/8 EPC 5/8 $11.01 $66.06 No Bid NoBid NoBid __|FORD $20.99 $125.94  |RA-NL $8.89 $53.34 NoBid NoBid No Bid
93 |3/4" Pressure Regulator Adaptor | 2430006 AY MFC‘I’J"(’}”ZQZ% 19 Each| 7.21 1165
AYM/ 74619 3/4 EPC-3/4 $8.84 $10.298.60 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $23.99 | $27.94835 |RA-2-NL $10.05 $11,708.25 NoBid NoBid No Bid
94 |1" Pressure Regulator Adaptor 2430010 AY ’\:"'d RA4NL Each| 9.00 4
lcDonald 74619
AYM /74619 1 EPC 1 $10.94 $43.76 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $29.99 $119.96  |RA4-NL $13 $52 NoBid NoBid No Bid
. Milwaukee 1151
9% ;ul/i F?Pa‘e Valve 2640014 Kitz 42-200 Each| 24.19 64
Mueller H10914N AYM/72035T 1 1/2" $17.35 $1,110.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid __|PRE-APPROVED $49.73 $3.182.72 010914 500N $346.66 $22,186.24
9 g’leg’l‘Sg Check Valve 2640106 M"Wa::‘;e 509 Each| 11.50 242
AYM / 72050T 3/4" $7.54 $1.824.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $15.31 $3.705.02 No Bid NoBid No Bid
97 |3/4" Stop Tee Head w/ Handle 2540306 | Cambridge Brass 02NL-F3F3H |Each| 4755 | 420
No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid _|711-3335W-HB-34-NL $75.42 $31,676.40 [010201 250N $68.72 $28,862.40
98 |3/4" Backflow Preventer 2160006 Watts #7 Each| 55.00 2
AYM / 711X3FE 33 $23.52 $47.04 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid _|WATTS #7 $98.72 $197.44 No Bid NoBid No Bid
99 |1ee threaded 2602996 Lee Each| 353 84
AYM /72230 3/4" $5.80 $487.20 Brecco 400-100-01071 $6.10 $51240 _|MERIT $8.59 §721.56__|PRE-APPROVED $5.86 $492.24 NoBid NoBid No Bid
100 ;e':elb";"ge/fdg‘:, 2604006 Lee Each| 2448 2
AYM 72230 2'%3/4" $31.24 $62.48 Brecco 400-100-01109 $41.96 $83.92  |MERIT $51.46 $102.92 |PRE-APPROVED $40.62 $81.24 NoBid NoBid No Bid
101 |78 Threaded 2604000 Lee Each| 1982 4
AYM /72230 2° $31.60 $126.40 Brecco 400-100-01075 $34.05 $13620 |MERIT $39.62 $158.48 | PRE-APPROVED $32.88 $131.52 NoBid NoBid No Bid
102|Tee 1-1/2x3/4 2605146 Lee Each| 14.98 2
AYM /72230 1 1/2'3/4" $19.08 $38.16 Brecco 400-100-01104 $25.71 $51.42 No Bid NoBid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $24.85 $49.70 NoBid No Bid No Bid
103|Tee 2x3/4 2605206 Dresser 65 Each| 2521 6
AYM 72230 2'%3/4" $31.24 $187.44 Brecco 400-100-01109 $42.06 $252.36 NoBid NoBid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $175 $1,050.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid
104 (B! Z‘/E‘}“CE' Brass Threaded 2421006 Lee Each| 465 4
AYM /72210 1'%3/4" $5.88 $23.52 Brecco 400-100-01139 $7.98 $31.92  |MERIT $10.27 $41.08 _|PRE-APPROVED $7.70 $30.80 NoBid NoBid No Bid
105 15?1"/;?‘3’;?' Brass Threaded 2421406 Lee Each| 10.66 2
AYM /72210 1 1/2'x3/4" $13.53 $27.06 Brecco 400-100-01144 $18.34 $36.68 _|MERIT $24.91 $49.82 _|PRE-APPROVED $17.68 $35.36 NoBid NoBid No Bid
106 g.?! ;‘z‘}“ce' Brass Threaded 2422006 Lee Each| 1586 10
AYM /72210 2'%3/4" $20.08 $200.80 Brecco 400-100-01148 $27.25 $272.50 _|MERIT $36.83 $368.30 _|PRE-APPROVED $26.30 $263.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid
107 ?.?L'( :‘j};?e' Brass Threaded 2422014 Lee Each| 14.07 38
AYM 72210 2'%1 1/2" $17.86 $678.68 Brecco 400-100-01151 $24.14 $917.32_|MERIT $32.05 | $1217.90 |PRE-APPROVED $23.34 $886.92 NoBid NoBid No Bid
108 :ﬁgeﬁfer Brass Threaded 2421410 Lee Each| 947 2
AYM 72210 1 1/2°x1" $12.03 $24.06 Brecco 400-100-01145 $16.28 $32.56  |MERIT $15.43 $30.86 |PRE-APPROVED $15.70 $31.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
109 | B¢l Reducer Brass Threaded 2422420 Lee Each| 2493 | 30
AYM 722102 1/2%2" $31.63 $948.90 Brecco 400-100-01154 $42.84 128520 |MERIT $56.45 | $1693.50 |PRE-APPROVED $41.34 $1.240.20 NoBid NoBid No Bid




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022
Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

110 |3/4" Plug Brass Std 2411206 Lee Each| 168 4
AYM /72202 314" $2.16 $8.64 Brecco 400-100-01190 $2.07 51188 No Bid No Bid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $2.79 $11.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
111|34" Plug Brass Threaded 2412006 Lee Each| 168 2
NS SQ Head Nut (10) ' ; i
No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid _|PRE-APPROVED $13.50 $27.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid
. Ford CSP-TANL
112|2’ Plug Threaded Brass 2412420 Cambridge Brass 98NL-A7 | Each| 19.64 2
Tapered AWWA )
AYMcDonald 73206 AYM /73206 2" $23.86 $47.72 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $79.99 §150.98 |CSP-7-A-NL $53.42 $106.84 010035 550N $61.71 $123.42
113 |2 Plug Threaded Brass 2415020 Lee Each| 6.63 270
AYM /72202 2" $8.44 $2.278.80 Brecco 400-100-01194 $1154 | $3.11580 |MERIT $1467 | $396090 |PRE-APPROVED $10.95 $2.956.50 NoBid NoBid No Bid
114 :}g?z gjfk Nut 2400005 Ford C02-32NL Each| 962 8
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $16.20 $129.60 |C02-32-NL $15.65 $125.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piggy Back Nut Ford C102-23NL
151314 x 518 2400006 AY McDonald 74742 Each| 1118 %
AYM [ 74742 5/8" X 34" $13.36 $1.282.56 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $2235 | $2.14560 |C102-23-NL $19.06 $1.829.76 NoBid NoBid No Bid
Piggy Back Nut Ford C02-43NL
18154 x1 2400010 AY McDonald 74755 Bach| 1206 o )
AYM /74755 314" X 1" $14.65 $439.50 No Bid No Bid NoBid__|FORD $23.99 §719.70 | C02-43-NL $20.56 $616.80 [015062 254N $34.37 $1,031.10
17 ;;gi";;“ Nut 0s 2400025 Ford C104-23GNL Each| 1268 4
AYM / 74742T 5/8" X 3/4" $15.41 $61.64 No Bid NoBid NoBid__|FORD $22.99 $91.96  [C104-23-G-NL $20.04 $80.16 NoBid NoBid No Bid
118 |1-1/2" Ell Brass Threaded 2213014 Lee Each| 880 22
AYM /72290 1 1/2" $14.93 $328.46 Brecco 400-100-01007 $15.12 $33264 |MERIT $22.21 48862 | PRE-APPROVED $14.58 $320.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
119 |2" Ell Brass Threaded 2213020 Lee Each| 14.32 134
AYM /72290 2" $23.93 $3.206.62 Brecco 400-100-01008 $2345 | $3.4230 |MERIT $30.61 $4.101.74 _|PRE-APPROVED $23.72 $3.178.48 NoBid NoBid No Bid
1203/4" Ell Brass Street 2214006 Lee Each| 374 442
AYM /72291 3/4" $4.81 $2.126.02 Brecco 400-100-01050 $5.82 $2572.44 _|MERIT $7.71 $3,407.82 _|PRE-APPROVED $6.18 $2.73156 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12117 Ell Brass Street 2214010 Lee Each| 6.19 24
AYM /722911 §7.87 $188.88 Brecco 400-100-01051 1097 $263.28 |MERIT $12.41 $297.84 | PRE-APPROVED $10.25 $246.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid
122 [1-1/2" Ell Brass Street 2214014 Lee Each| 12.36 14
AYM (722911 112" $15.75 $220.50 Brecco $2090 $29260 _|MERIT $25.48 $356.72 | PRE-APPROVED $20.44 $286.16 NoBid NoBid No Bid
123 |2 Ell Brass Street 2214020 Lee Each| 2092 | 235
AYM /72291 2" $26.71 $6.276.85 Brecco $3296 | $7.74560 |MERIT $4195 | 5985825 |PRE-APPROVED $34.67 $8.147.45 NoBid NoBid No Bid
124 |5 Bress Reducing 2222014 Lee Each| 20.07 6
AYM /72210 2'x1 1/2" $17.86 $107.16 Brecco $34.49 $206.94 |MERIT $60.00 $360.00 _|PRE-APPROVED $33.20 $199.74 NoBid No Bid No Bid
125 ;_”1'/32',?)5(52?3"““"9 2222020 Lee Each| 33.99 222
AYM 72210 2 1/2%2" $31.63 $7.021.86 Brecco $63.83 | $11.950.26 |MERIT §7147 | $15866.34 |PRE-APPROVED $56.38 $12.516.36 NoBid NoBid No Bid
126 Souping Brass Threaded 2152006 Lee Each| 233 6
AYM /72210 3/4" $3.21 $19.26 Brecco $3.99 52394 |MERIT $4.66 $27.96__|PRE-APPROVED $3.85 $23.10 NoBid NoBid No Bid
127 fj‘;;‘g%i’?sf/; gffde‘j 2152014 Lee Each| 749 10
AYM /72210 1 172" $10.08 $100.80 Brecco 51266 $126.60 _|MERIT $15.03 $150.30 _|PRE-APPROVED $12.43 $124.30 NoBid NoBid No Bid
128 Souping Brass Threaded 2152020 Lee Each| 1234 | 60
AYM/722102" $15.64 $938.40 Brecco $1990 | $1.19400 |MERIT $24.74 | $1484.40 |PRE-APPROVED $20.46 $1.227.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
129 |Nipple Brass 2361006 Merit Each| 133 285
3/4xCL (12) Trenton '
AYM /2200 3/4" $1.72 $490.20 Brecco 52 $570 _ |MERIT $3.58 102030 _|PRE-APPROVED $2.43 $692.55 NoBid NoBid No Bid
130 | lPple Brass 2361010 et Each| 196 2
AYM /2200 1" $2.55 $71.40 Brecco $3.21 $80.88  |MERIT $5.27 $147.56__|PRE-APPROVED $3.58 $100.24 NoBid NoBid No Bid
131 |ibpio Brass 2361014 Tromen Bach| 385 &
AYM /2200 1 1/2" $5.02 $421.680 Brecco $6.34 $532.56 _|MERIT $10.18 $855.12__|PRE-APPROVED $7.04 $591.36 NoBid NoBid No Bid
132 | YlPple Brass 2361020 et Each| 585 82
AYM /2200 2" $7.62 $624.84 Brecco $8.61 §706.02 _|MERIT $1550 | $1271.00 |PRE-APPROVED $10.71 $878.22 NoBid No Bid No Bid
133 ;T;;\es Brass 2361066 T’r‘:f‘:‘;n Each| 4.26 454
AYM /2200 3/4"X6" $5.54 $2.515.16 Brecco $6.81 $3.091.74 _|MERIT $9.50 $4.313.00 |PRE-APPROVED $7.80 $3.541.20 No Bid NoBid No Bid
134 lPple Brass 2361105 et Each| 521 2
AYM/ 2200 1°%5" $6.78 $13.56 Brecco $7.89 $1578  |MERIT $14.10 $28.20 _|PRE-APPROVED 5954 $19.08 NoBid NoBid No Bid
135 1N|§:/pz\ex E;rass 2361143 T’r‘:f‘:‘;n Each| 569 160
AYM /2200 1 1/2x3" $7.39 $1.182.40 Brecco $7.93 $1.268.80 |MERIT $1330 | $2.128.00 |PRE-APPROVED $10.42 $1.667.20 NoBid NoBid No Bid
136 lople Brass 2361144 et Each| 7.42 16
AYM /2200 1 1/2x4" $9.64 $154.24 Brecco $10.37 $165.92 |MERIT $14.62 $233.92 _|PRE-APPROVED $13.57 $217.12 NoBid No Bid No Bid
137 1N|§:/pz\ex Eérass 2361146 T’r‘:f‘:‘;n Each| 10.97 16
AYM /2200 1 1/2x6" $14.21 $227.36 Brecco $15.37 $24592 |MERIT $25.57 $409.12__|PRE-APPROVED $20.04 $320.64 NoBid NoBid No Bid
138 | ylPple Brass 2361203 et Each| 7.28 34
AYM/ 2200 23" $9.44 $320.96 Brecco $1023 $347.82 |MERIT $18.02 $612.68 | PRE-APPROVED $13.34 $453.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 22-88 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 26, 2022
Term: October 28, 2022 - October 27, 2024

139 | ipple Brass 2361204 et Each| 954 70

AYM 2200 2'x4" $12.38 $866.60 Brecco $13.97 $077.90 _|MERIT $2357 | $1649.90 |PRE-APPROVED $17.45 $1.221.50 NoBid NoBid No Bid
140 ;TZ‘E Brass 2361206 'rxf:én Each| 14.08 220

AYM /2200 2'%6" $18.29 $4.023.80 Brecco $18.90 $4.158.00 |MERIT $34.78 | $7.651.60 |PRE-APPROVED $25.76 $5.667.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 | Yipple Brass for Blow Of 2361212 et Each| 2768 | 154

AYM /2200 2°x12" $36.03 $5.548.62 Brecco $49.36 §7.601.44 _|MERIT $68.55 | $10.556.70 |PRE-APPROVED $50.50 $§7.777.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid
142 ;Tr;\se Brass 2361218 'rxf:én Each| 4369 106

AYM /2200 2°x18" $57.15 $6,057.90 Brecco $59.75 $6:333.50 |MERIT $107.90 | $11437.40 |PRE-APPROVED $62.60 $6,635.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Cost: $984,560.35 $66,827.78 $1,633,138.14 $1,590,298.36 $2,200,566.34
Awarded Total Cost:
Combined Total Cost: $0.00
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