
Awardee: Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC
Buyer: DeLisa Campbell
Project Manager: Eric McGiveney

# Item Master Item
# Unit Estimated 

Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Barricades, plain 9001013 Each 1200 $56.71 $68,052.00 $42.60 $51,120.00 $52.50 $63,000.00

2 Lights/bulbs & Photo Cell (2) 9001014 Each 500 $38.00 $19,000.00 $16.25 $8,125.00 $33.00 $16,500.00

3 Bulbs Only 9001015 Each 1200 No Bid No Bid $1.60 $1,920.00 $0.75 $900.00

4 Photo Cell Inserts Only 9001016 Each 90 No Bid No Bid $13.50 $1,215.00 $17.50 $1,575.00

5 Traffic Cones 28" 9001018 Each 5000 $19.00 $95,000.00 $13.98 $69,900.00 $15.00 $75,000.00

Total Cost:  

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 23-99 /  Barricades, Cones and Lights Purchase

Bid Opening Date: October 11, 2023
PM Estimate: $65,029.50

Bidders:

$182,052.00

Ferguson 
Waterworks

Yes
Bid Signed:

$132,280.00 $156,975.00

Acknowledged Receipt of Addendum #1:
Yes

Lightle 
Enterprises of 

Ohio, LLC

Peyton's 
Barricade & Sign 

Company

YesYes
Yes Yes
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