LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-23 / Electro-Mechanical Work for Water Treatment or Distribution Facilities
Bid Opening: April 10, 2024

) FINAL BID TAB
Contract Estimate: $120,000 annual

PM: John Azzara
Buyer: Renee Fromme

Ad d Electrical
Annual Estimate - $120,000 vanced Electrica Walter B. Diecks Ward Engineering
Supply
Description Est. Qty Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
Classification
PumpWork - Not Awarded
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.88 $8,688.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.96 $689.60
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.92 $338.76
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.30 $8,630.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.97 | $1,389.70
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.34 $316.02
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $20,052.08
Electrical Work / Non-Water Quality Instrumentation
Electrician
Straight Time| 100 $80.00 $8,000.00 $84.35 $8,435.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 $105.00 | $1,050.00 | $120.07 | $1,200.70 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 $135.00 $405.00 $155.78 $467.34 No Bid No Bid
Electrical Apprentice
Straight Time| 100 $52.00 $5,200.00 $62.94 $6,294.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime| 10 $68.00 $680.00 $87.95 $879.50 No Bid No Bid
Holiday| 3 $85.00 $255.00 $112.93 $338.79 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $15,590.00 $17,615.33 $0.00




Bid 24-23 / Electro-Mechanical Work for Water Treatment or Distribution Facilities

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY

Bid Opening: April 10, 2024
Piping & Valve Work
Pipefitter
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.88 $8,688.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.92 $1,129.20
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.97 $416.91
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $10,234.11
Pipefitter Apprentice
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.96 $6,896.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.83 $868.30
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.34 $316.02
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $28,548.54
Drive and Gearbox Work
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.88 $8,688.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.92 | $1,129.20
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.97 $416.91
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.96 $6,896.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.83 $868.30
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.34 $316.02
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $18,314.43




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-23 / Electro-Mechanical Work for Water Treatment or Distribution Facilities

Bid Opening: April 10, 2024
5 Air Compressor Work
Mechanic
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.88 | $8,688.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.92 | $1,129.20
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.97 $416.91
Mechanic Helper
Straight Time| 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.96 | $6,896.00
Overtime| 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $86.83 $868.30
Holiday| 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.34 $316.02
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $18,314.43
TOTAL COST $15,590.00 $17,615.33 $85,229.48
Acknowledgment of Addendum Yes Yes Yes
Bid Is Signed Yes Ves Yes




