LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-40 / Hydraulic, Machine and Gear Oils
Bid Opening Date: May 22, 2024
Initial Term: July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025

Awardee: Key Oil Company

Buyer's Name: Terri Young

Project Manager's Name: John Azzara
PM Estimate: $90,000

; Archie Supply LLC Romeo Enterprises
: Key Oil Compan: P
Bidders y Oil Co pany (MBE) (1) Disqualified; deemed nonresponsive
Bid Signed: Yes Yes Yes
Estimated
. . N Manufacturer Manufacturer .
Item Master Description Unit Prevm‘us Pr_evpus Quantity (Mobil or Manufacturer Unit Price Total Price |(Mobil or Royal Manufacturer Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer (Mobil | Manufacturer Unit Price Total Price
Item # Quantity | Unit Price (1 Year) Royal Purpl Item # Purple) Item # or Royal Purple) Item #
Initial Term oyal Purple) P!
ISO 22 R&O (Mineral): Mobil
1 9003019 |Velocite #10 or Royal Purple Gallon 55 $26.22 55 Mobil 105456 $25.00 $1,375.00 Mobil 201560509090 $30.62 $1,684.08 NO BID 0 $0.00 $0.00
Synfilm 22
2 | 9003020 |1SO 32 R8O (Mineral): Mobil DTE | oy | 55 | g26.70 55 Mobil 104742 $24.99 $1,374.45 Mobil | 201560501560|  $30.24 $1,663.20 NO BID 0 $0.00 $0.00
Light or Royal Purple Synfilm 32
ISO 68 R&O (Mineral): Mobil DTE
3 9003018 [Heavy Medium or Royal Purple Gallon 330 $25.33 330 Mobil 104817 $23.33 $7,698.90 Mobil 201560501590 $30.24 $9,979.20 NO BID 0 $0.00 $0.00
Synfilm 68
1SO 220 R&O (Mineral): Mobil DTE " .
4 9003022 BB or Royal Purple Synfilm GT 220 Gallon 110 $26.83 110 Mobil 103887 $27.14 $2,985.40 Mobil 220 $30.37 $3,340.70 NO BID 0 $0.00 $0.00
1SO 150 SYN (Synthetic): Mobil
5 9003025 [SHC 629 or Royal Purple Synfilm Gallon 220 $50.91 220 Mobil 110841 $49.00 $10,780.00 Mobil 201560500540 $56.21 $12,366.20 AMSOIL #SGL55 1 $42.00 $9,240.00
GT 150
1SO 220 SYN (Synthetic): Mobil
6 9003024 [SHC 630 or Royal Purple Synfilm Gallon 110 $53.87 110 Mobil 110844 $49.15 $5,406.50 Mobil 201560500550 $56.89 $6,257.90 AMSOIL #SGM55 2 $45.00 $4,950.00
GT 220
1SO 680 SYN (Synthetic): Mobil
7 9003028 [SHC 636 or Royal Purple Thermyl- | Gallon 220 $53.64 220 Mobil 110852 $49.10 $10,802.00 Mobil 201560500580 $58.69 $12,911.80 NO BID 0 $0.00 $0.00
Glyde
ISO 150 EP (Synthetic w/ EP
8 9003021 [Additives): Mobil SHC Gear 150 or | Gallon 330 $72.53 330 Mobil 110859 $71.55 $23,611.50 Mobil 615039 $84.30 $27,819.00 AMSOIL #RCL55 3 $48.00 $15,840.00
Royal Purple Synergy 150
1SO 220 EP (Synthetic w/ EP
9 9050322 |Additives): Mobil SHC Gear 220 or | Gallon 110 $71.82 110 Mobil 110864 $71.50 $7,865.00 Mobil 615047 $85.98 $9,457.80 AMSOIL #RCM55 4 $49.00 $5,390.00
Royal Purple Synergy 220
ISO 460 EP (Synthetic w/ EP
10 | 9003023 |Additives): Mobil SHC Gear 460 or | Gallon 55 $71.20 55 Mobil 110876 $72.00 $3,960.00 Mobil 201560409050 $87.88 $4,833.40 NO BID #RCO55 5 $52.16 $2,868.80
Royal Purple Synergy 460
Total: $75,858.75 $90,313.28 $38,288.80
Deliver within __ days of receipt of an order: 2 days 30 days 7 days

Planholders that did not submit a bid: Advantage Distributing, LLC, BidNet, Cambridge LTD, Clean Harbors Environmental Services Inc., Deltek, Heritage Petroleum, LLC, Hourglass, Kimball Midwest, Mobile Techs of South Florida LLC, Parman Energy Group, RelaDyne Chicago LLC, Riley Oil Company,
Shay Enterprise, Talan Industries, LLC, Top5 Equipment LLC DBA Region Equipment, WW Grainger, and Xiaoma

(1) Bid disqualified; deemed nonresponsive. Did not bid on all bid items and listed substitutions. Effected outcome of bid.




