Awardees: AY McDonald & Hayes Pipe Supply
Buyer: Terri Young

Project Manager: Brian Matherly

Bid Estimate: $1,065,622.10

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-90 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 16, 2024
Initial Term: October 28, 2024 - October 27, 2026

Bidders: AY McDonald Hayes Pipe Supply
Bid Signed: Yes Yes
Claiming Local Preference: No Yes
Claiming SBE Preference: No No
Master Item Previous 2 Year
# Item # Model Unit Unit Price Estimated Manufacturer / Model # Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer / Model # Unit Cost Total Cost
Quantity
1" Spring Check Valve Mueller H14243N . . ¥
L 1630001 Ford S 11 444N Each| $26.05 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 HS11-444-NL $29.96 $29.96
1-1/2" Spring Check Valve Mueller H14243N AYM / 666
2 |Loeor 1630015 Ford S 11-666NL Each| $42.50 75 i $141.30 $10,597.50 HS11-666-NL $143.09 | $10,731.75
2" Spring Check Valve Mueller H14243N - 77
3 |epree 1630020 B a1 777N Each| $60.72 10 AYM | 701-TEE 77 $179.10 $1,791.00 HS11-777-NL $180.86 | $1,808.60
AY. McDonald 7 02-3HT 43
4 |3/4" Valve Check Angle 2640107 Ford HA34-323GNL Each| $33.15 1000 AYM [ 702-3HT 43 $39.30 $39,300.00 HA34-323-G-NL $40.53 | $40,530.00
Cambridge Brass 590NL-T3F3
5 [1"Valve Check Angle 2640110 Ford HA34-444N Each| $38.22 85 AYM | 702-4HT 54 $42.00 $3,570.00 HA34-444-NL $43.33 $3,683.05
Ball Valve Pitometer " .
6 | e e B 2640125 Ford B11-455N Each| $106.13 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 B11-455-NL $133.64 $133.64
2" Angle Ball Val Mueller B24286N
7 e 2640220 Ford BFA13-777NL Each| $217.16 25 AYM | 74604B 2 $259.66 $6,491.50 BFA13-777-NL $254.99 | $6,374.75
x Flange A.Y.MCDONALD 746048
Angle Meter Val Ford KV 23-332W
g |onge Meler Valve ' 2530000 A.Y.MCDONALD 4602 Each| $32.22 1 AYM / 74602 3/4 $36.40 $36.40 KV23-332W-NL $38.56 $38.56
5/8 Flare x 3/4 Mtr Coupling
Mueller H14255
g |Angle MeterValve OS 2570115 Ford KV 23-332W-05 Each| $47.50 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 KV23-332W-OS-NL $85 $85.00
5/8 Copper x 3/4 Mtr Coupling
3/4" Angle Meter Val Mueller H14258N
10 ngle Meter valve 2531006 Ford KV43-332GSMBNL | Each| $30.32 9200 AYM / 74602ST 3/4 $34.87 $320,804.00 KV43-332W-SN-G-NL $39.84 | $366,528.00
Compression x Meter
AY. McDonald7 4602ST
Angle Meter Valve Ford KV23-342WMSBN . SN
1 |3 Copperx 1 Meter 2570315 o McDonald 74602 Each| $34.53 5 AYM / 74602 1X3/4 $40.42 $202.10 KV23-342W-SN-NL $42.83 $214.15
1" Angle Meter Val Mueller H14258
12 ngle Vleter valve 2531010 Ford KV43-444GMSB Each| $44.12 470 AYM / 74602T 1 $52.94 $24,881.80 KV43-444W-SN-G-NL $54.53 | $25629.10
Compression x Meter
AY McDonald 74602T
1" Stop Tee Head Female Ford B11-444 W/HB-34N HR.24.]
13 [ g o it o 2560010 FTER Each| $71.40 20 AYM / 76101WHDLB 1 $85.68 $1,713.60 B11-444-HB-34-NL $80.80 $1,616.00
1-1/2" Ball Val Mueller H20283N
14 |[-1/e" Ballvalve 2530014 Ford B11-666NL Each| $134.09 75 AYM / 761011 1/2 $159.62 $11,971.50 B11-666-NL $151.96 | $11,397.00
FIP x FIP
AYMcDonald 76101
2" Ball Val Mueller H20283N
15 |£ DAl vave 2530020 Ford B11-777NL Each| $189.67 425 AYM /76101 2 $227.60 $96,730.00 B11-777-NL $222.25 | $94,456.25
FIP x FIP
AYMcDonald 76101
16 |3/8" Stop Corp Cock Copper 2120005 Ford F600-2NL Each| $28.40 15 No Bid No Bid $0.00 F600-2-NL $31.31 $469.65
Flare Connection
3/4" Stop C Cock C Mueller H15000N
17 op forp Lack Lopper 2120006 Ford F600-3NL Each| $24.86 2000 AYM / 74701 3/4 $29.64 $59,280.00 F600-3-NL $30.45 | $60,900.00
Flare Connection
AYMcDonald 74701
1" Stop G Cock C Mueller H15000N
18 op Lorp tuock Lopper 2120010 Ford F600-4NL Each| $37.64 150 AYM / 74701 1 $45.17 $6,775.50 F600-4-NL $47.99 $7,198.50
Flare Connection
AYMcDonald 74701
19 |1-1/2" Ball Corp Stop 2120014 Ford-FB800-6NL Each| $107.77 1 AYM/73121B 1172 $127.54 $127.54 FB800-6-NL $125.24 $125.24
AWWA x Increased MIP
20 |2 Ball Corp Stop 2120020 Ford-FB800-7NL Each| $176.66 250 AYM /73121B 2 $211.99 $52,997.50 FB800-7-NL $207.04 | $51,760.00
AWWA x Increased MIP
3/4" Stop Corp Cock Mueller H15025N a
21 oo TP o e 2120206 For FBO00-INL. Each| $24.19 1 AYM /| 73122 3/4 $28.01 $28.01 FB900-3-NL $44.83 $44.83
1" Stop Corp Cock Mueller H15025N ¥
22 | S R P 2120210 For FBO00-ANL Each| $36.55 1 AYM /731221 $42.32 $42.32 FB900-4-NL $68.68 $68.68
23 |2/ Ball Corp Stop 2120220 Ford FB900-7NL Each| $185.76 1 AYM /731228 2 $217.48 $217.48 FB900-7-NL $213.58 $213.58
MIP x Increased MIP




Initial Term: October 28, 2024 - October 27, 2026

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-90 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 16, 2024

1" Corp Cock Stop

Mueller H9992N

24 |1 OGOk SOD e ometer| 2120510 s Each| $36.15 1 AYM /731211 $42.32 $42.32 F800-4-NL $44.86 $44.86
Corp Cock Stor Mueller H15000N
25 |CoP P 2121115 Ford F600-23NL Each| $30.60 5 AYM | 74701 5/8X3/4 $32.27 $161.35 F600-23-NL $36.69 $183.45
5/8 AWWA x 3/4 Flare
AYMcDonald 74701
Adapter Brass N .
26 |dapter Brass 2011105 Ford C21-23NL Each| $12.63 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 C21-23-NL $15.14 $15.14
Adapter Brass Mueller H15451N
27 | B A EP 2011206 Ford C14-33-GNL Each| $12.98 150 AYM | 74754T 3/4 $15.37 $2,305.50 C14-33-G-NL $16.29 | $2,443.50
P AYMcDonald 74754T
Adapter Brass Mueller H15451N
2g [fapterBrass 2011210 Ford C14-44-GNL Each| $18.09 12 AYM [ 74754T 1 $20.85 $250.20 C14-44-G-NL $22.10 $265.20
P AYMcDonald 74754T
Adapter Brass . .
29 [ B WP (10) 2011304 Ford C28-21NL Each| $1277 4 No Bid No Bid $0.00 C28-21-NL $15.30 $61.20
Adapter Brass Ford C28-23NL " "
30 |Adapler Brase b 2011305 | oo o ae TaNLcams | E2h| 81277 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 C28-23-NL $15.30 $15.30
31 ’:,f’;‘;‘fe' STLS,\S,HP 2011310 Ford C28-44NL Each| $15.83 75 AYM / 74753 1 $18.55 $1,391.25 C28-44-NL $19.67 | $1,475.25
Adapter Brass Mueller H15428N
3 |Adap . 2011406 Ford C84-33-GNL Each| $12.46 1870 AYM [ 74753T 3/4 $14.62 $27,339.40 ©84-33-G-NL $15.01 | $28,068.70
3/4 Compression x 3/4 MIP
AYMcDonald7 47537
Adapter Brass Mueller H15428N
3y |MEpterBrass P 2011410 Ford C84-44-GNL Each| $14.78 75 AYM [ 74753T 1 $17.31 $1,298.25 C84-44-G-NL $18.34 | $1,375.50
P AYMcDonald 74753T
. Ford LA104-33-GNL
34 |3/4" Adapter OS 1/8 Bend 2015006 Jaasaciet Each| $16.85 1 AYM [ 74749T 3/4 $19.73 $19.73 LA104-33-G-NL $20.91 $20.91
35 |1 Adapter OS 1/8 Bend 2015010 Ford LA104-44-GNL Each| $20.05 8 AYM [ 74749T 1 $33.47 $267.76 LA104-44-G-NL $35.47 $283.76
36 ?/‘éaf‘;"‘oci ;’S Bend 2015015 Ford LA104-23-GNL Each| $17.44 1 AYM | 74749T 5/8X3/4 $20.83 $20.83 LA104-23-G-NL $22.07 $22.07
37 ’s\/‘éaf‘;;%i :n’: Bend 2015020 Ford L104-23-GNL Each| $19.45 1 AYM | 74777 5/8X3/4 $23.26 $23.26 L104-23-G-NL $24.66 $24.66
Adapter NS 1/8 Bend Ford LA04-33-GNL
38 | Floro x 34 Comp 2015066 A0S O Each| $16.20 900 AYM | 74750T 3/4 $19.21 $17,289.00 LA04-33-G-NL $19.73 | $17,757.00
Adapter NS 1/4 Bend Ford L04-33-GNL
39 | Pl 34 Gompression 2015076 O N Each| $17.91 2500 AYM | 74776T 3/4 $21.41 $53,525.00 L04-33-G-NL $21.99 | $54,975.00
Adapter NS 1/8 Bend Ford LA04-44-GNL
40 | Comprasdion 2015080 A Each| $25.98 75 AYM | 74750T 1 $31.06 $2,320.50 LA04-44-G-NL $32.92 | $2,469.00
Adapter NS 1/4 Bend Ford L04-44-G
L Commrabsion 2015090 Ay Lo Each| $27.16 200 AYM | 74776T 1 $32.48 $6,496.00 L04-44-G-NL $33.35 | $6,670.00
Adapter w/Ribbed Insert Mueller H12213N
az |aapter wRibbe 2016106 ol 22 Each| $9.67 50 AYM / 72092 3/4 $3.59 $179.50 PTM-1-NL $10.67 $533.50
Adapter w/Ribbed Insert Mueller H12213N
a3 |gaper Wil 2016110 e 2 Each| $15.50 5 AYM /720921 $5.51 $27.55 PTM-2-NL $17.49 $87.45
Adapter Meter Ford A23NL
4 e 5t tongih 2340006 AT A2 s Each| $8.85 1 AYM /710423 $10.10 $10.10 A23-NL $10.69 $10.69
45 %‘}V’;fgt:pz“ Branch Piece 2050007 Ford UV43-32W-65-GNL | Each| $107.76 1200 No Bid No Bid $0.00 UV43-32W-65-G-NL $129.16 | $154,992.00
46 %‘}V"vf/;:pl Branch Piece 2050006 Ford UV43-42W-65-GNL | Each| $91.57 100 AYM / 7T09UTAW 1X3/4X6.5 | $105.86 $10,586.00 UV43-42W-65-G-NL $111.03 | $11,103.00
47 ;v’/‘tm S‘f;‘)”:h piece 2050010 Mueller 681363 Each| $218.42 125 No Bid No Bid $0.00 UV43-44W-AWT-G-NL $415 $51,875.00
48 |5/8" x 3/4" S-Tubes 2510100 Ford ST-2NL Each| $33.60 750 AYM / 46195 5/8X3/4X4.50 | $39.56 $29,670.00 ST-2-NL $51.09 | $38,317.50
AY McDonald 7461953 : B : 317
Ve Ford ST-4NL !
49 1" S-Tubes 2510101 A M T oss | Each| $61.14 75 AYM / 46195 1X5.50 $71.62 $5,371.50 ST-4-NL $92.54 | $6,940.50
. . Ford LF31-77NL
50 |2" Ell Flanged 2" FIP Outlet 2330020 Ay LTI e |Each| $9s.65 25 AYM | 74783FF 2 $114.34 $2,858.50 LF31-77-NL $121.14 | $3,028.50
. Ford LF38-66-2NL
51 |1-1/2" Meter Flange MIP 2330514 o Each| $38.18 75 AYM / 7610M 1 1/2 $45.64 $3,423.00 CF38-66-2-NL $48.35 | $3,626.25
52 |2" Meter Flange MIP 2330500 Ford LF38-77-2-125NL Each| $50.91 15 AYM / 7610M 2X2 $60.87 $913.05 CF38-77-2-125-NL $64.51 $967.65

AY McDonald 7610M




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-90 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 16, 2024
Initial Term: October 28, 2024 - October 27, 2026

Ford CF31-66NL
Cambridge Brass

53 |1-1/2" Meter Flange FIP 2330614 §03450295MNL Each| $9.98 10 AYM / 7610F 1 1/2 $42.24 $422.40 CF31-66-NL $44.76 $447.60
AYMcDonald 7610F
Ford CF31-77NL
54 |2" Meter Flange FIP 2330600 Cambridge Brass 50390MNL | Each| $10.77 10 AYM / 7610F 2 $55.16 $551.60 CF31-77-NL $58.44 $584.40
AYMcDonald 7610F
55 |1-1/2" Union Brass GJ 2621014 Lee Each| $29.48 50 No Bid No Bid $0.00 Pre-Approved $27.08 $1,354.00
56 [2" Union Brass GJ 2621020 Lee Each| $45.04 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 Pre-Approved $41.50 $41.50
Bushing Brass Mueller H10888N |
57 | cigny aan Moter 2070508 Ford AT2SNL Each| $2.78 6000 AYM /10412 $3.26 $19,560.00 A12S-NL $2.78 $16,680.00
Bushing Brass AYM | 72206 _
58 | D x 172 FIP 2070604 Ford C18-13NL Each| $2.16 60 At $2.24 $134.40 Pre-Approved $2.04 $122.40
Bushing Brass AYM | 72206 _
59 | P o pip 2071006 Ford C18-34NL Each| $3.17 122 X34 $3.40 $414.80 Pre-Approved $3.08 $375.76
Bushing Brass CC Tapered Mueller H10036N ¥
60 | o 3 o0 2071106 Ford BEAAINL Each| $11.08 45 AYM / 747011 1X3/4 $12.29 $553.05 BB44-43-NL $15.88 $714.60
Bushing Brass AYM / 72206 _
61 | a VP x 34 FIP 2071206 Ford C18-35NL Each| $6.43 52 1 1/axsla $6.43 $334.36 Pre-Approved $5.24 $272.48
Bushing Brass AYM / 72206 _
62 | P 1 EIP 2071210 Ford C18-45NL Each| $6.43 50 117401 $6.43 $321.50 Pre-Approved $5.24 $262.00
Bushing Brass Ford C18-36NL AYM / 72206 _
63 |0 VP x 3/4 FIP 2071406 Leo Each| $7.94 1 1125314 $9.04 $9.04 Pre-Approved $8.18 $8.18
Bushing Brass Ford C18-46NL AYM / 72206 _
64 | P 1 FIP 2071410 Leo Each| $8.10 5 o $8.10 $40.50 Pre-Approved $8.18 $40.90
Bushing Brass Ford C18-37NL AYM | 72206 _
65 |, i o pip 2072006 Leo Each| $11.57 1 3l $14.46 $14.46 Pre-Approved $11.94 $11.94
Bushing Brass Ford C18-47NL AYM | 72206 _
2 Pytieutin 2072010 Leo Each| $14.46 2 o $14.46 $28.92 Pre-Approved $11.94 $23.88
Bushing Brass Ford C18-67NL AYM / 72206 _
67 | P 1A/ FIP 2072014 Leo Each| $12.01 60 1 11 $12.01 $720.60 Pre-Approved $9.95 $597.00
Coupling Straight Met Mueller H10896N
68 |ouping Straignt Weter 2151106 Ford C38-23-2.5NL Each| $8.14 1 AYM / 74620 3/4X3/4X2.50 $9.49 $9.49 C38-23-2-5-NL $10.06 $10.06
3/4 Meter x 2.5 Length
AY McDonald 74620
69 | Coupling Straight Mtr 2151110 Ford 38-44-2.625NL Each| $1267 1 AYM / 74620 1X1X2.63 $14.62 $14.62 ©38-44-2-625-NL $15.49 $15.49
1 Meter x 2.625 Length
Coupling C: Tube Straight Mueller H15403N
70 |ouPing Lopper Tube Stralg 2155006 Ford C44-33-GNL Each| $15.03 2500 AYM | 74758T 3/4 $17.79 $44,475.00 C44-33-G-NL $18.28 $45,700.00
3/4" Compression
AY McDonald 74758T
Coupling C Tube Straight Mueller H15403
71 1,,"(‘;" ing ~opper fube Straig 2155010 Ford C44-44-G Each| $17.36 150 AYM / 74758T 1 $20.35 $3,052.50 C44-44-G-NL $20.91 $3,136.50
ompression AY McDonald 4758T
Ford C44-23-GNL
Coupling Copper Tube Straight Cambridge Brass 118NL-H3B2 . " P |
72 |78 Comp x 14 Commrossion 2155015 Muellor 15403N Each| $21.77 1200 No Bid No Bid $0.00 C44-23-G-NL $20.74 | $24,888.00
AY McDonald 74758T
Coupling C Tube Straight Mueller H15403N
73 | e e S 2155016 Ford C44-34-GNL Each| $17.64 150 AYM | 74758T 3/4X1 $20.67 $3,100.50 C44-34-G-NL $21.92 $3,288.00
omp x 3i% comp AY McDonald 74758T
Coupling Copper Tube Straight Ford C44-13-GNL Y 12.G.]
74 (112 Comp x 314 Compression 2155013 AY MoDomald 74758.22 Each| $17.01 1 AYM / 74758-22 1/2X3/4 $18.22 $18.22 C44-13-G-NL $19.29 $19.29
Coupling Ford C47-33-GNL 22 G
75 |37 Goper x 314 PVC 2155106 AY MeDorald 74768744 | E3ch| 52052 100 AYM | 74758T-44 3/4 $24.04 $2,404.00 C47-33-G-NL $25.50 $2,550.00
Coupling Ford C47-34-GNL 4G
76 |57 Gopper x 1 PVC 2155107 AY MeDorald 74768744 | E3Ch| 52873 100 AYM / 74758T-44 3/4X1 $33.67 $3,367.00 C47-34-G-NL $35.67 $3,567.00
77 |Coupling 2154115 | AY McDonald 74758T-44 1 1/2" |Each| $79.98 12 AYM | 74758T-44 1 1/2 $93.72 $1,124.64 C47-66-G-NL $99.29 $1,191.48
1-1/2 Copper x 1-1/2 PVC
Coupling Ford C47-77-GNL 7G|
78 |3 Campor x 2 PVC 2154120 AY MeDonald 74768744 | E3Ch| 99337 10 AYM | 74758T-44 2 $109.39 $1,093.90 CA47-77-G-NL $115.91 $1,159.10
79 |Coupling 2154210 | AY McDonald 74758T-3G 1" |Each| $29.70 2 AYM | 74758T-44 1 $34.75 $69.50 C47-44-G-NL $36.84 $73.68
1 Copper x 1 PVC
Coupli Mueller H15428N
80 1_‘;‘;5'0"9 1472 MIP 2155814 Ford C84-66-GNL Each| $39.66 200 AYM / 74753T 1 1/2 $47.41 $9,482.00 C84-66-G-NL $48.70 $9,740.00
opper x AY McDonald 74753T
Coupling C . Mueller H15428N
g1 |youping Lompression 2155820 Ford C84-77-GNL Each| $57.52 350 AYM / 74753T 2 $69.02 $24,157.00 C84-77-G-NL $70.94 | $24,829.00

2 Compress x 2 MIP

AY McDonald 74753T
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Coupling Compression

Ford C45-77-GNL

82 | o2 1bS 2154420 AY MaDonald 74768155 | Each|  $83.06 1 AYM | 74758T-55 2 $95.72 $95.72 C45-77-G-NL $101.45 $101.45
Coupling C: . Mueller H15403N
83 |] /3US\I/ncg ;’/’:‘I’F'fsss"’” 2155407 Ford C77-33-GNL Each| $22.54 1 AYM / 74758-44 3/4 $25.98 $25.98 C77-33-NL $27.55 $27.55
x AY McDonald 74758-44
g4 |Coupling Compression 2155414 Ford C47-66-GNL Each| $74.71 1 AYM / 74758-44 1 1/2 $86.10 $86.10 C57-66-G-NL $78.61 $78.61
1-12 PVC x 1-1/2 IPS
Coupling C . Mueller H15403N
85 1‘1‘;;’ g‘g °’"p;e?72'°g 2155714 Ford C44-66-GNL Each| $56.97 30 AYM / 74758T 1 1/2 $68.10 $2,043.00 C44-66-G-NL $72.18 $2,165.40
~1ie Copper x 1-4/2 Lopper AY McDonald 74758T
Mueller H15403N
Coupling Compression Ford C44-77-GNL 277G
8 | e o2 Gonper 21720 | e Brate 11ONLH7H7 | E3Ch| S76.93 125 AYM / 74758T 2 $91.96 $11,495.00 C44-77-G-NL $94.45 | $11,806.25
AY McDonald 74758-22
Mueller H15451N
Coupling Compression Ford C14-66-GNL 66-G
87 |5 Gopporx 1472 FIP 2155830 Cambridge 11/NLBXBX | E2°h| 5176 10 AYM / 74754T 1 1/2 $60.65 $606.50 C14-66-G-NL $64.25 $642.50
AY McDonald 74754-22
Coupling C . Mueller H15451N
88 |, ‘(’:“p 'ng "ZmFﬁfSS'O” 2155835 Ford C14-77-GNL Each| $61.61 8 AYM / 74754T 2 $72.19 $577.52 C14-77-G-NL $76.50 $612.00
opperx AY McDonald7 4754T
Coupling Lead Pac OS Ford Q32-23GNL v 93]
89 | e 2362169 AY Mobonalds 475868 |Each| $2349 1 AYM / 74758C-68 3/4X5/8 $27.35 $27.35 Q32-23-NL $29.01 $29.01
Coupling Lead Pac Ford Q22-33GNL 23]
90 | 2362171 AY MoDonald 7475867 |Each| $27.75 1 AYM | 74758C-67 3/4 $32.32 $32.32 Q22-33-NL $34.26 $34.26
Coupling Lead Pac Ford Q22-23GNL v 93]
9 | s 2362170 AY Mobonaid 7475867 |Each| $21.98 1 AYM / 74758C-67 3/4X5/8 $25.61 $25.61 Q22-23-NL $27.12 $27.12
92 |5/8" Pressure Regulator Adaptor | 2430005 Ford RATNL Each| $8.89 1 AYM / 74619 5/8 EPC 5/8 $12.60 $12.60 RA-1-NL $10.88 $10.88
AY McDonald 74619
93 |3/4" Pressure Regulator Adaptor | 2430006 Ford RA2 Each| $8.84 1300 AYM / 74619 3/4 EPC-3/4 $9.51 $12,363.00 RA-2-NL $11.92 | $15,496.00
AY McDonald 4619
94 |1 Pressure Regulator Adaptor | 2430010 Ford RA4NL Each| $10.94 4 AYM /74619 1 EPC 1 $13.05 $52.20 RA-4-NL $15.90 $63.60
AY McDonald 74619
" Milwaukee 1151
g5 |1-1/2" Gate Valve 2640014 Kitz 42-200 Each| $17.35 50 AYM $44.76 $2,238.00 Pre-Approved $23.50 $1,175.00
FIP x FIP 72035T 1112
Mueller H10914N
% i’l‘;'xs:’ligg Check Valve 2640106 M”Wﬁ‘;'i‘ge 500 Each| $7.54 240 AYM / 72050T 3/4 $13.78 $3,307.20 Pre-Approved $11.50 $2,760.00
97 |3/4" Stop Tee Head w/ Handle 2540306 | Cambridge Brass 02NL-F3F3H |Each| $75.42 420 No Bid No Bid $0.00 Z11-333SW-HB-34-NL $85.50 | $35910.00
98 |3/4" Backflow Preventer 2160006 Watts #7 Each| $23.52 4 AYM | T11X3FE 33 $21.79 $87.16 WATTS #7 $98.75 $395.00
Tee, Threaded _
99 | i el FIP 2602996 Lee Each| $5.80 30 AYM /72230 3/4 $5.80 $174.00 Pre-Approved $4.67 $140.10
Tee, Threaded AYM /
100 |0 o bp 2604006 Lee Each| $31.24 7 72930 2x3/4 $36.56 $255.92 Pre-Approved $32.36 $226.52
101 ;eFeI'PT:rze'a:f:" 2604000 Lee Each| $31.60 4 AYM /72230 2 $31.60 $126.40 Pre-Approved $26.20 $104.80
102 |Tee 1-1/2x 3/4 2605146 Lee Each| $19.08 2 AYM 1 $22.37 $44.74 Pre-Approved $19.80 $39.60
72230 1 1/2x3/4
103 |Tee 2 x 3/4 2605206 Dresser 65 Each| $31.24 6 L3G $36.56 $219.36 No Bid No Bid $0.00
72230 2x3/4
Bell Reducer Brass Threaded AYM/
104|257 e 2421006 Lee Each| $5.88 12 72210 1x3/4 $6.93 $83.16 Pre-Approved $5.83 $69.96
Bell Reducer Brass Threaded AYM /
105 e 2421406 Lee Each| $13.53 2 72210 1 1/2x314 $15.91 $31.82 Pre-Approved $14.10 $28.20
Bell Reducer Brass Threaded AYM /
106 |7 e 2422006 Lee Each| $20.08 1 72910 2x3/4 $23.67 $23.67 Pre-Approved $20.96 $20.96
Bell Reducer Brass Threaded AYM /
107 |02 2422014 Lee Each| $17.86 30 72910 261 112 $21.01 $630.30 Pre-Approved $18.59 $557.70
Bell Reducer Brass Threaded AYM /
108 2421410 Lee Each| $12.03 2 722101 1/2x1 $13.89 $27.78 Pre-Approved $12.51 $25.02
109 | Be!l Reducer Brass Threaded 2422420 Lee Each| $31.63 35 AYM $37.21 $1,302.35 Pre-Approved $32.95 | $1,153.25

2-1/2"x 2"

72210 2 1/2x2




Initial Term: October 28, 2024 - October 27, 2026

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-90 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 16, 2024

110 |3/4" Plug Brass Std. 2411206 Lee Each| $2.16 4 AYM / 72203 3/4 $4.72 $18.88 Pre-Approved $2.35 $9.40
3/4" Plug Brass Threaded
11|38 sQ hoad Nut (10) 2412006 Lee Each| $13.50 2 AYM / 72202 3/4 $2.51 $5.02 CSP-3-A-NL $15.50 $31.00
2 Plug Threaded B Ford CSP-7ANL
112 ug Threaded brass 2412420 Cambridge Brass 98NL-A7  |Each| $23.86 2 AYM / 73206 2 $28.63 $57.26 CSP-7-A-NL $61.46 $122.92
Tapered AWWA
AYMcDonald 73206
113 (2" Plug Threaded Brass 2415020 Lee Each| $8.44 200 AYM /72203 2 $18.53 $3,706.00 Pre-Approved $9.25 $1,850.00
114 ;ig?‘x’ Ej‘fk Nut 2400005 Ford C02-32NL Each| $15.65 8 No Bid No Bid $0.00 C02-32-NL $16.40 $131.20
Piggy Back Nut Ford C102-23NL 93]
15| 0% e 2400006 AY McDonald 74742 Each| $13.36 % AYM / 74742 5/8X 3/4 $16.03 $1,538.88 €102-23-NL $23.34 $2,240.64
Piggy Back Nut Ford C02-43NL ¥
16|29 2400010 AY MoDonald 74755 Each| $14.65 25 AYM / 74755 3/4X1 $17.58 $439.50 C02-43-NL $25.16 $629.00
117 g;fgxys‘?;“ Nut 0S 2400025 Ford C104-23GNL Each| $15.41 1 AYM [ 74742 5/8X3/4 $18.49 $18.49 €104-23-G-NL $20.10 $20.10
. AYM/
118 [1-1/2" Ell Brass Threaded 2213014 Lee Each| $14.58 15 72290 1 112 $14.50 $217.50 Pre-Approved $11.64 $174.60
119 |2" Ell Brass Threaded 2213020 Lee Each| $23.45 110 7‘;;’;"')’2 $23.62 $2,508.20 Pre-Approved $1892 | $2,081.20
f AYM/
120 |3/4" Ell Brass Street 2214006 Lee Each $4.81 450 72291 3/4 $5.24 $2,358.00 Pre-Approved $4.95 $2,227.50
" AYM/
121|1" Ell Brass Street 2214010 Lee Each $7.87 20 72201 1 $9.23 $184.60 Pre-Approved $8.18 $163.60
. AYM /
122|1-1/2" Ell Brass Street 2214014 Lee Each| $15.75 10 722911172 $20.40 $204.00 Pre-Approved $16.31 $163.10
123 |2" Ell Brass Street 2214020 Lee Each| $26.71 180 7‘2‘;'; ’2 $29.66 $5,338.80 Pre-Approved $27.65 | $4,977.00
Ell Brass Reducing AYM /
1245 2222014 Lee Each| $17.86 1 72210 251 112 $30.63 $30.63 Pre-Approved $26.53 $26.53
Ell Brass Reducing AYM |
125 50 re 2222020 Lee Each| $31.63 300 72210 2 1/2x2 $48.45 $14,535.00 Pre-Approved $4.95 $1,485.00
Coupling Brass Threaded AYM / _
126 o Y 2/a e 2152006 Lee Each| $3.21 1 72210 3/4. $3.47 $3.47 Pre-Approved $3.08 $3.08
Coupling Brass Threaded AYM / _
127 | B a2 b 2152014 Lee Each| $10.08 1 72210 1172 $11.19 $11.19 Pre-Approved $9.91 $9.91
Coupling Brass Threaded AYM / _
128 O 2152020 Lee Each| $15.64 60 722102 $17.91 $1,074.60 Pre-Approved $16.31 $978.60
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
129 0 GL (12) 2361006 Trenton Each| $1.72 225 cem $1.80 $405.00 Pre-Approved $2 $463.50
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
130|000 2361010 Trenton Each| $2.55 25 oot $2.89 $72.25 Pre-Approved $3.02 $75.50
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
131 S o 2361014 Trenton Each| $5.02 75 AR $5.71 $428.25 Pre-Approved $5.89 $441.75
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
132|008 2361020 Trenton Each| $7.62 75 e $7.75 $581.25 Pre-Approved $8.97 $672.75
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
133|000 S 2361066 Trenton Each| $5.54 450 PIRETG $6.13 $2,758.50 Pre-Approved $6.54 $2,943.00
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
134|708 2361105 Trenton Each| $6.78 1 o $7.10 $7.10 Pre-Approved $7.99 $7.99
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
135 3 2361143 Trenton Each| $7.39 120 T $7.39 $886.80 Pre-Approved $8.73 $1,047.60
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
136|102 2361144 Trenton Each| $9.64 8 T $9.64 $77.12 Pre-Approved $11.37 $90.96
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
137 | 2361146 Trenton Each| $14.21 12 T $14.21 $170.52 Pre-Approved $16.79 $201.48
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
138| ;00 2361203 Trenton Each| $9.44 25 oRa $9.44 $236.00 Pre-Approved $11.18 $279.50




LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 24-90 / Brass Fittings and Valves
Bid Opening Date: October 16, 2024
Initial Term: October 28, 2024 - October 27, 2026

Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
139 2 x4 2361204 Trenton Each| $12.38 80 2200 2x4 $12.57 $1,005.60 Pre-Approved $14.63 $1,170.40
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
140 2%6 2361206 Trenton Each| $18.29 160 2200 2x6 $18.29 $2,926.40 Pre-Approved $20.46 $3,273.60
Nipple Brass for Blow Off Merit AYM / _
141 2% 12 2361212 Trenton Each| $36.03 150 2200 2x12 $44.42 $6,663.00 Pre-Approved $40.29 $6,043.50
Nipple Brass Merit AYM / _
142 2% 18 2361218 Trenton Each| $57.15 100 2200 2x18 $57.15 $5,715.00 Pre-Approved $61.36 $6,136.00
Awarded Total Cost: $772,022.76 $480,881.67
Combined Total Cost: $1,252,904.43
If awarded this contract, we will deliver the material within calendar days of receipt of an
— Y P 100 days 7 - 190 days

order:

Planholders not submitting bids: Aaaju, asddfg, ASSD, BBR Printers, Beato Group, Inc., BuildCentral Inc., Builders Exchange of Kentucky, Inc., CAASI Flow Control, Core and Main, Deltek, Echelon Supply and
Service, Gtech, HJ Kirby Corporation, jitubbb, Masters Supply, Mueller Co. LLC, Pioneer Industrial Corp, Process Products International Ltd., Prometheos Limited Company, Smith-Blair, Total Maintenance
Solutions South, USA Government Contracting, Veteran Distribution & Supply, Vyce Industrial Supply, and Xiaoma
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