
PM: Brian Matherly

Items Qty Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

2140006 - 3/4" x 60' rolls  (Per Foot) 30,000     $ 5.68 $170,400.00 $5.34 $160,074.00 No Bid No Bid $8.32 $249,600.00 $ 7.81 $234,300.00

2140010 - 1" x 60' rolls (Per Foot) 5,400       $ 7.55 $40,770.00 $7.09 $38,284.38 No Bid No Bid $11.75 $63,450.00 $ 10.36 $55,944.00

2140010 - 1" x 100' rolls (per foot) 1,000       $ 7.55 $7,550.00 $7.09 $7,089.70 No Bid No Bid $12.86 $12,860.00 $ 10.36 $10,360.00

2140020 - 2" x 20' sticks (Per Foot) 1,400       $ 22.04 $30,856.00 $ 20.61 $28,854.00 No Bid No Bid $35.99 $50,386.00 $ 22.46 $31,444.00

$249,576.00 $234,302.08 $376,296.00 $332,048.00

Contract Period:  Purchase & Delivery

24-113 / Copper Tubing

Bid Opening November 20, 2024

Hayes Pipe Supply Masters Supply Plumbers Supply Company

Process Products 

International Ltd.

Veteran Distribution & 

Supply

FINAL BID TAB


