
26-49 Tapping Saddles

Bid Opening:  June 10, 2026

Bid Estimate:  $175,00

PM: Brian Matherly

Items Qty Est. Unit Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

Tapping Saddles for PVC Pipe (20)

2460404 - 4" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 4.8 Pipe O.D. 300 Each $ 93.42 $28,026.00 $ 96.02 $28,806.00 $ 114.88 $34,464.00 $ 118.72 $35,616.00 $ 100.8 $30,240.00

2460406 - 6" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 6.9 Pipe O.D. 600 Each $ 109.74 $65,844.00 $ 112.8 $67,680.00 $ 135.34 $81,204.00 $ 135.5 $81,300.00 $ 116.85 $70,110.00

2460408 - 8" pipe, 3/4" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 770 Each $ 135.99 $104,712.30 $ 139.78 $107,630.60 $ 167.49 $128,967.30 $ 169.88 $130,807.60 $ 144.7 $111,419.00

2460410 - 10" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 168.6 $1,686.00 $ 173.31 $1,733.10 $ 207.52 $2,075.20 $ 209.88 $2,098.80 $ 185 $1,850.00

2460412 - 12" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 155 Each $ 187.6 $29,078.00 $ 192.83 $29,888.65 $ 230.73 $35,763.15 $ 236.43 $36,646.65 $ 199.25 $30,883.75

2460304 - 4" Pipe, 1" Service, 4.8 Pipe O.D. 15 Each $ 93.42 $1,401.30 $ 96.02 $1,440.30 $ 114.88 $1,723.20 $ 118.72 $1,780.80 $ 100.8 $1,512.00

2460306 - 6" Pipe, 1" Service, 6.9 Pipe O.D. 35 Each $ 109.74 $3,840.90 $ 112.8 $3,948.00 $ 135.34 $4,736.90 $ 135.5 $4,742.50 $ 116.85 $4,089.75

2460308 - 8" Pipe, 1" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 60 Each $ 135.99 $8,159.40 $ 139.78 $8,386.80 $ 167.49 $10,049.40 $ 169.88 $10,192.80 $ 144.7 $8,682.00

2460310 - 10" Pipe, 1" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 168.6 $1,686.00 $ 173.31 $1,733.10 $ 207.52 $2,075.20 $ 209.88 $2,098.80 $ 185 $1,850.00

2460312 - 12" Pipe, 1" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 50 Each $ 187.6 $9,380.00 $ 192.83 $9,641.50 $ 230.73 $11,536.50 $ 236.43 $11,821.50 $ 199.25 $9,962.50

2460204 - 4" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 4.80 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 120.94 $604.70 $ 124.31 $621.55 $ 134 $670.00 $ 136.88 $684.40 $ 117.75 $588.75

2460206 - 6" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 6.90 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 128.72 $643.60 $ 132.56 $662.80 $ 154.71 $773.55 $ 154.9 $774.50 $ 135.75 $678.75

2460208 - 8" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 143.11 $715.55 $ 147.09 $735.45 $ 176.34 $881.70 $ 178.79 $893.95 $ 154.7 $773.50

2460210 - 10" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 11.10 PIpe O.D. 5 Each $ 185.27 $926.35 $ 190.44 $952.20 $ 227.95 $1,139.75 $ 232.84 $1,164.20 $ 201 $1,005.00

2460212 - 12" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 1 Each $ 211.54 $211.54 $ 217.44 $217.44 $ 260.27 $260.27 $ 263.6 $263.60 $ 229.5 $229.50

2460104 - 4" Pipe, 2" Service, 4.8 Pipe O.D. 4 Each $ 120.94 $483.76 $ 124.31 $497.24 $ 134 $536.00 $ 136.8 $547.20 $ 121.6 $486.40

2460106 - 6" Pipe, 2" Service, 6.9 Pipe O.D. 50 Each $ 128.72 $6,436.00 $ 132.56 $6,628.00 $ 154.71 $7,735.50 $ 154.9 $7,745.00 $ 139.5 $6,975.00

2460108 - 8" Pipe, 2" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 100 Each $ 143.11 $14,311.00 $ 147.09 $14,709.00 $ 176.34 $17,634.00 $ 178.79 $17,879.00 $ 157.5 $15,750.00

2460999 - 10" Pipe, 2"Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 30 Each $ 185.27 $5,558.10 $ 190.44 $5,713.20 $ 227.95 $6,838.50 $ 232.84 $6,985.20 $ 203.95 $6,118.50

2460112 - 12" Pipe, 2" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 211.54 $2,115.40 $ 217.44 $2,174.40 $ 260.27 $2,602.70 $ 263.6 $2,636.00 $ 232.45 $2,324.50

TOTAL $285,819.90 $293,799.33 $351,666.82 $356,678.50 $305,528.90

Tapping Saddles for Ductile Iron (22)

2470404 - 4" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 4.80 Pipe O.D. 50 Each $ 93.42 $4,671.00 $ 96.02 $4,801.00 $ 114.88 $5,744.00 $ 118.72 $5,936.00 $ 100.8 $5,040.00

2470406 - 6" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 6.90 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 109.74 $548.70 $ 112.8 $564.00 $ 135.34 $676.70 $ 135.5 $677.50 $ 116.85 $584.25

2470408- 8" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 135.99 $679.95 $ 139.78 $698.90 $ 167.49 $837.45 $ 169.88 $849.40 $ 144.7 $723.50

2470410 - 10" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 168.6 $843.00 $ 173.31 $866.55 $ 207.52 $1,037.60 $ 209.88 $1,049.40 $ 185 $925.00

2470412 - 12" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 187.6 $938.00 $ 192.83 $964.15 $ 230.73 $1,153.65 $ 236.43 $1,182.15 $ 199.25 $996.25

2470416 - 16" Pipe, 3/4" Service, 17,.40 Pipe O.D. 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 475.6 $951.20 $ 305.81 $611.62 $ 316.71 $633.42 $ 309.25 $618.50

2470304 - 4" Pipe, 1" Service, 4.80 Pipe O.D. 4 Each $ 93.42 $373.68 $ 96.02 $384.08 $ 114.88 $459.52 $ 118.72 $474.88 $ 100.8 $403.20

2470306 - 6" Pipe, 1" Service, 6.90 Pipe O.D. 50 Each $ 109.74 $5,487.00 $ 112.8 $5,640.00 $ 135.34 $6,767.00 $ 135.5 $6,775.00 $ 116.85 $5,842.50

2470308- 8"Pipe, 1" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 100 Each $ 135.99 $13,599.00 $ 139.78 $13,978.00 $ 167.49 $16,749.00 $ 169.88 $16,988.00 $ 144.7 $14,470.00

2470310 - 10" Pipe, 1" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 30 Each $ 168.6 $5,058.00 $ 173.31 $5,199.30 $ 207.52 $6,225.60 $ 209.88 $6,296.40 $ 185 $5,550.00

2470312 - 12" Pipe, 1" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 187.6 $938.00 $ 192.83 $964.15 $ 230.73 $1,153.65 $ 236.43 $1,182.15 $ 199.25 $996.25

2470999 - 6" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 6.90 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 128.72 $1,287.20 $ 132.32 $1,323.20 $ 154.71 $1,547.10 $ 158.86 $1,588.60 $ 135.75 $1,357.50

2470999 - 8" Pipe, 11/2" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 143.11 $1,431.10 $ 147.09 $1,470.90 $ 176.34 $1,763.40 $ 179.8 $1,798.00 $ 154.7 $1,547.00

2470999 - 10" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 185.27 $1,852.70 $ 190.44 $1,904.40 $ 227.95 $2,279.50 $ 236.43 $2,364.30 $ 201 $2,010.00

2470999 - 12" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 211.54 $2,115.40 $ 217.44 $2,174.40 $ 260.27 $2,602.70 $ 269.88 $2,698.80 $ 229.5 $2,295.00

2470104 - 4" Pipe, 2" Servcie, 4.80 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 120.94 $604.70 $ 124.31 $621.55 $ 134 $670.00 $ 135.5 $677.50 $ 121.6 $608.00

2470106 - 6" Pipe, 2" Service, 6.90 Pipe O.D. 10 Each $ 128.72 $1,287.20 $ 132.56 $1,325.60 $ 154.71 $1,547.10 $ 158.86 $1,588.60 $ 139.5 $1,395.00

2470108 - 8" Pipe, 2" Service, 9.05 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 143.11 $715.55 $ 147.09 $735.45 $ 176.34 $881.70 $ 179.8 $899.00 $ 157.5 $787.50

2470110 - 10" Pipe, 2" Service, 11.10 Pipe O.D. 30 Each $ 185.27 $5,558.10 $ 190.44 $5,713.20 $ 227.95 $6,838.50 $ 236.43 $7,092.90 $ 203.95 $6,118.50

2470112 - 12" Pipe, 2" Services, 13.20 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 211.54 $1,057.70 $ 217.44 $1,087.20 $ 260.27 $1,301.35 $ 269.88 $1,349.40 $ 232.45 $1,162.25

2470116 - 16" Pipe, 2" Services, 17.40 Pipe O.D. 10 Each No Bid No Bid $ 475.6 $4,756.00 $ 343.05 $3,430.50 $ 349.41 $3,494.10 $ 309.25 $3,092.50

2470999 - 4" Pipe, 1 1/2" Service, 4.8 Pipe O.D. 5 Each $ 120.94 $604.70 $ 124.31 $621.55 $ 134 $670.00 $ 136.8 $684.00 $ 117.75 $588.75

TOTAL $49,650.68 $56,744.78 $64,947.64 $66,279.50 $57,111.45

TOTAL BID $335,470.58 $350,544.11 $416,614.46 $422,958.00 $362,640.35

Winsupply of Louisville

Consolidated Pipe & 
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